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silent for a brief moment before continuing, “I can also let you in on a 
secret.” “What secret?” Jared asked. 

“The spiritual energy will soon return to this world, but no one knows where it 
will return to. I can give you the exact location so you can plan ahead and 
beat everyone else to it,” the sect leader replied. 

“Stop wasting my time, will you? If you won’t tell me, then I’ll be on my way 
now. You can forget about getting the blood demon’s body from me unless 
you’re willing to pay a hefty price,” Jared said nonchalantly. 

Fearing that Jared would leave, the sect leader said, “It’s Encanta Island. 
That’s where the spiritual energy will first be restored to this world. It’s the 
reason the blood demon sealed its body there.” 

Jared frowned slightly upon hearing that. “Encanta Island?” 

That explains all the strange incidents that have taken place there lately! 
Godrick and the others had no choice but to return to Jadeborough. This must 
be the precursor to the recovery of spiritual energy! 

Jared deliberately asked in the most uninterested tone possible, “Is that 
it?” “Yes, that’s all I can tell you…” replied the sect leader of Demon Sect. 

“Then I think we can forget about this. I need a fair deal if we are to work 
together. Why would I hand the blood demon’s body over to you guys if you 
can’t give me something of equal value? 

If I hand it over to Evil Heart Sect, they might just release my girlfriend and 
save me the trouble of locating their secret realm!” Jared said 
nonchalantly. “What do you want, then?” 

The sect leader of Demon Sect was starting to get a little anxious. He was 
worried that Jared would actually hand the blood demon’s body over to Evil 
Heart Sect. 

“I need resources. I’m talking about rare herbs that are tens of thousands of 
years old. A sect in the secret realm such as yours should have no issues with 
that, right?” Jared asked with a smile. 



While he couldn’t actually see the sect leader’s expression through the mask, 
he could tell that the sect leader had a gloomy look on his face. 

Jared only said that to test and see if the location he previously discovered 
was where Demon Sect got its resources from. However, Patrick’s reaction 
suggested that it wasn’t the case. 

“Mr. Chance, do you know how much a single ten-thousand-year herb is 
worth? It’s not something we can just obtain easily from nature. We have been 
living in this secret realm all this while, so we are lacking in resources as is. 
Where will we even find such herbs? Please be more realistic about your 
demands, Mr. Chance, Patrick said calmly. 

“You guys have so many members in your sect, though. Where do you get 
your resources for cultivation, if not from the secret realm?” Jared asked with 
doubt written all over his face. 

“I’ll be honest with you here, Mr. Chance. Most of our resources are 
purchased from the outside to support the cultivation of our members,” Patrick 
replied. 

“If you won’t tell me what I want to know, then we can forget about this deal. 
It’s pointless to continue this conversation,” Jared said with a frown and 
started walking away. 

Patrick quickly ran forward to block his path. “What makes you say that, Mr. 
Chance? We didn’t lie to you!” 

“Well, you’re most certainly mocking my intelligence. Resources are extremely 
rare and expensive these days. I doubt there’s a single prestigious family out 
there willing to support you guys financially for so many years. 

It’s obvious that you guys have your own supply of resources, but you don’t 
trust me enough to tell me the truth.” Jared carried on walking after voicing out 
his theory. 

“Wait, Mr. Chance!” Patrick had a conflicted look in his eyes as he stopped 
Jared a second time. After hesitating for a bit, he clenched his teeth and said. 

“To be honest, we don’t have our own supply of resources, but our ancestors 
have left us a map that would indicate the location of rare herbs whenever 



they appeared in the world. We’ve been relying on that map to locate the rare 
herbs and stock up on resources.” 
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interest and curiosity. Oh, wow… I didn’t know such a map existed! Is it able 
to scan the environment like a radar or something? 

“Could you please show me the map, Mr. Sullivan?” Jared asked. Patrick 
nodded without any hesitation. “Sure thing!” Since he had gone as far as 
telling Jared about the map, he was mentally prepared to show it to him. 

While he was leading Jared to the back of the palace, the sect leader of 
Demon Sect simply sat there without saying a word. Jared couldn’t help but 
find it a little strange. 

Why would the sect leader let a vice sect leader make all these important 
decisions? Does he not care at all? 

Jared stole a glance at the sect leader while walking past him. However, apart 
from being unable to detect the sect leader’s aura, Jared didn’t find anything 
strange about the sect leader at all. 

Patrick led Jared into a secret room that was about one hundred square 
meters in size. 

There was a highly detailed map drawn on one of its walls. The plants on the 
map looked so lifelike that one would easily mistake the map for a satellite 
image of an area. 

Upon closer inspection, Jared realized that the large map only covered the 
area within a radius of a few hundred miles from Norham. “This is the map 
you guys used to collect your resources?” Jared asked in confusion, as he 
didn’t see anything special about the map. 

“That’s right. Whenever a rare herb that is over a thousand years old appears, 
its location will be indicated on this map,” Patrick replied with a nod. 

“Hmm… How peculiar!” Jared tried touching the map with his fingers, but he 
couldn’t find anything unusual about it at all. “Wouldn’t you guys get into 



conflicts with the Zagorski family while collecting resources? This is their 
territory, after all.” 

I don’t understand this at all. Demon Sect is a really large sect, so it must’ve 
obtained a huge amount of resources. How come no one has ever tried to 
stop them? The resources they’re getting are extremely valuable and 
precious, after all. 

“We rarely get into conflicts because we’re usually able to pinpoint the exact 
location of the resources and quickly send our members to bring it back. The 
Zagorski family doesn’t even. know about it. Even if they did somehow hear 
about the resources, it would all have reached us by then,” Patrick explained 
calmly. 

Hmm… I suppose that explanation makes sense. Having this map here is no 
different from having a radar for rare herbs, so there’s no way the others 
would be able to compete against that! 

“Regardless of how you guys obtain your resources, I can’t just hand you the 
blood demon’s physical body based on your verbal promise alone. You need 
to give me some kind of benefit as a deposit or down payment,” Jared said. 

“No problem. Based on our past experience, a huge amount of rare herbs will 
soon emerge. How about we give it all to you, Mr. Chance?” Patrick asked. 

Jared nodded. “Very well. I will hand the blood demon’s body over to you guys 
if I deem the resources worthwhile.” 

The only benefit I get out of the blood demon is using its body as a shield 
anyway. My main priority right now is to rescue Josephine with Demon Sect’s 
help! 

Josephine had been held prisoner for a very long time, so Jared was getting 
incredibly anxious after several failed attempts at rescuing her. 

After leaving the secret room, Patrick summoned Jessica and had her stay 
with Jared for the time being. The smile on Patrick’s face vanished the 
moment Jared and Jessica left. 

Suddenly, a man whose body was completely covered in a black robe 
stepped out of the shadows and asked Patrick, “Do you really think he’ll trust 
you and hand the blood demon’s body over as promised?” 
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will certainly oblige. But, we may have no choice but to give him the resources 
that are about to appear soon,” said Patrick Sullivan with a grim expression. 

“This guy has a rebellious spirit. Then again, he will be of great help to us if 
we know how to make use of him,” said the black-robed man calmly. 

“I’ll figure out a way to use him to our advantage. It’s better that you make a 
move first before someone sees you,” Patrick urged the black-robed man to 
leave as soon as possible. 

“I’ll leave everything to you then. Once the spiritual energy has been 
revitalized, we, the demon spirits, will make a comeback.” With that, the guy in 
the black robe waved his hand in the air, and a ray of bright light lit up. He 
then disappeared into the light. 

Soon after the black-robed man left, Patrick glanced at the leader of the 
Demon Sect who had been still all the while. He walked up and removed the 
mask of the leader. 

There was only a set of skeletons underneath the mask. Not a single bit of 
blood or flesh. could be seen. 

Once Jessica sent Jared back to his lodging.. she told him, “Mr. Chance, you 
can always look for me if anything crops up. I’m genuinely sorry for what 
happened today. Simon is indeed too impulsive.” 

Jessica was apologizing because Simon Lambert tried to hit Jared earlier on. 

“That has nothing to do with you.” Jared smiled. He knew that her position in 
Demon Sect was not high enough. Therefore, she did not have the right to 
interfere just now. 

“Well then, I won’t take up any more of your time. Mr. Chance, please take a 
good rest.” With that, Jessica was about to leave. 

Flaxseed had been waiting by the door all the while, and he immediately 
opened the door and said, “Ms. Zimmerman, why don’t you come in and take 
a seat? Let’s have a chat!” 



Jessica rolled her eyes at Flaxseed. She knew that if she went into the house, 
Flaxseed would definitely take advantage of her. 

However, just as Jessica was about to walk away, Jared suddenly called out 
to her, “Ms. Zimmerman, how long have you been in Demon Sect?” 

She turned around and looked at him. “Mr. Chance, why do you want to 
know?” “Oh, I just want to know you better since we will be working with one 
another in the future!” explained Jared. 

With a smile, Jessica replied, “I have been with them for more than a decade. 
I was brought here since I was a child.” “Why did you decide to join Demon 
Sect? Did they force you to join?” asked Jared curiously. 

“No, of course. Demon Sect never forces anyone to join them. Back when I 
was only a child, my parents died after our family was hunted down by our 
enemies. Someone from Demon Sect saved me and took me back here,” 
Jessica clarified. 

The moment Jared heard her explanation, he felt very awkward. He did not 
expect Jessica to have such a miserable past. “Ms. Zimmerman, I’m so 
sorry…” 

Jared felt bad for reminding Jessica about her painful past. “It’s fine. That was 
a long time ago. Besides, I love my life now. Although others call us demon 
spirits, I find this place heartwarming. 

Furthermore, for more than ten years, our lord has always taught us to 
become better people through cultivation and to not lose ourselves. If anyone 
who practices our cultivation technique becomes greedy and loses control of 
himself, he will be devoured by the technique and will become a cruel and 
ruthless person. 

That’s why many people get the wrong idea about us. Now that you have met 
people from the Demon Sect, don’t you think we’re different from what you 
imagined us to be?” 

When Jessica was talking about Demon Sect, her eyes lit up with 
pride. “You’re right. It is, indeed, different,” said Jared as he nodded his 
head. It was true that the moment Simon saw Jared, he challenged him to a 
fight and showed no mercy at all. 
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feel evil to him at all. As for those black-robed men in Warriors. Alliance, they 
had spirits possessing them and exuded an evil aura. 

Perhaps the two sects broke up because they held different beliefs. Jared felt 
that he would have to see Demonic Cultivators and demon spirits in a new 
light in the future. “Honestly, our lord is the most lovely person I have ever 
seen in my life. He gives off a fatherly feeling every single time I see him!” 

Admiration was written all over Jessica’s face. Jared frowned and found it 
strange that Jessica was singing praises about her lord. “Your lord wears a 
mask and talks weirdly. I can’t seem to sense the fatherly feeling that you’re 
talking about.” 

“That’s because you have never seen our lord in the past. He used to appear 
even more polite and refined than our second-in-command. Unfortunately, 
there was a fire five years ago, and it ruined our lord’s face. Since then, his 
temperament changed drastically. From then on, I have never spoken to him 
again.” 

Jessica looked sad as she recounted the past. “How qualified is your vice sect 
leader?” As far as Jared was concerned, Patrick did not look very old. 
Surprisingly, he was able to become the vice-sect leader of Demon Sect. 

Furthermore, Jared also noticed that Patrick seemed to be more powerful than 
the lord himself. That was why Jared got curious and asked Jessica that 
question. 

“Our vice sect leader has only been here for six years. Although he joined the 
sect after I did, he is a very outstanding and capable man. Ever since our lord 
is injured in the fire, Mr. Sullivan was chosen to be our vice sect leader. He 
has been helping our lord run Demon Sect since then,” said Jessica. 

Jared frowned when he heard that. Something felt amiss to him, but he could 
not put his finger on it. 

Patrick had been nothing but respectful to Jared, and he appeared very 
sincere too. He had even revealed the secret of Demon Sect to Jared as well. 



Yet, Jared felt that there was something mysterious about Patrick. “Hmph! 
Outstanding, my foot! What’s so good. about him? He’s just more handsome 
than me, that’s all. He’s just a toyboy…” 

When Flaxseed heard Jessica praising Patrick, he became annoyed. “What 
nonsense are you talking about?” 

Jessica frowned and stared angrily at Flaxseed. Jared took note of the 
woman’s anger and quickly said, “Sorry about that, Ms. Zimmerman. We’ll go 
and take our rest first.” 

With that, Jared dragged Flaxseed away with him. “Hmph! That toyboy is up 
to no good. That silly girl must have been fooled by him.” Flaxseed was very 
jealous of the way Jessica was singing praises about Patrick. 

“All right, that’s enough. That’s none of your business. But, there’s definitely 
something amiss with Patrick. I can’t explain the gut feeling I have, though,” 
said Jared as he furrowed his brows. 

“What’s wrong? Did the discussion not go well? Is that place Demon Sect’s 
resources area?” asked Flaxseed when he saw the look on Jared’s face. 

To that, Jared shook his head. “Demon Sect doesn’t have any resources area. 
However, they do have a magical map.” Thereafter, Jared began telling 
Flaxseed everything that happened in the main hall. 

“I can’t believe such a magical map exists in the world!” Flaxseed exclaimed 
after hearing Jared’s description. A map that could predict the growth location 
of precious herbs was unheard of. 

After Jared and Flaxseed stayed in the secret realm for another day, they 
started to find the place extremely boring. 

After all, the secret realm was too small, and there was nothing special there. 
In the end, the two men decided to leave the place and head to Norham. 

There was another reason why Jared wanted to go to Norham. He wanted to 
know if Austin was truly able to absorb the entire city’s natural energy. 

After gaining approval, Jessica took Jared and Flaxseed out of the secret 
realm and into Norham. 
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Jared and Flaxseed for half a day. It was only a small city, so they nearly 
covered the entire place within. that time. 

“I’m too tired! The two of you can continue exploring. I’m going to find 
someplace to rest.” After making up an excuse, Flaxseed left in a hurry. Jared 
immediately knew why Flaxseed was dashing off. That guy is simply 
inseparable from women! 

Jessica seemed aware of Flaxseed’s intentions, too. She could not stop 
herself from rolling her eyes. “Are men truly so incapable of curbing their 
desires? Just look at the impatience on his face.” 

Her remark instantly made Jared feel a little awkward. He coughed softly and 
said, “Not all men are like Mr. Flaxseed. I’m still a virgin.” 

A look of surprise spread across her face at his words, and she stared at him 
in disbelief. “You… You have so many women around you, and you have a 
girlfriend. Didn’t you ever…” “No. Absolutely not. I think that’s a sacred act 

that should wait until after marriage,” Jared replied while waving his hand 
dismissively. She suddenly chuckled upon observing his reaction. “What a 
surprise. 

I never thought that a pure young man like you would still exist in such a 
society. If it were not because I already have feelings for someone else, I’d 
really have the urge to pursue you.” “Is Patrick the person you have feelings 
for?” he enquired without beating around the bush.. 

Her face flushed slightly. Then, she nodded. “Yes. He’s very nice to me.” For 
some reason, the sight of her shy expression sparked an uneasy feeling in 
Jared’s heart. I can’t seem to get a handle on Patrick. There’s this niggling 
feeling that he’s not the person he appears to be. 

The pair chatted as they walked. Noon soon rolled around, and they found a 
place to eat. Although the small border city did not have upscale hotels like 
those found in the big cities, it had its own unique cuisine. Jessica ordered a 
myriad of dishes, which all looked delicious. 

“Do you often come here to eat?” he asked. 



She shook her head. “Demon Sect has strict rules. We’re not allowed to 
wander outside the secret realm at will. My position requires me to come out 
frequently, so I’ve eaten here twice. However, some haven’t stepped outside 
the secret realm since they joined the sect.” 

“How is that different from being locked up in prison?” Jared could not help 
remarking with at laugh. Being forced to stay in such a small space without 
being able to step foot outside is the same as being imprisoned! 

“As a cultivator, shouldn’t we ignore the affairs of the world and focus on 
cultivation? Actually, not allowing the other sect members to leave the secret 
realm at will is also our leader’s way of protecting them. The world’s spiritual 
energy has depleted, so it’s no longer a suitable living environment for 
cultivators. 

Besides, according to the laws of nature, staying outside for long periods of 
time will not only cause our cultivation level to remain stagnant but even 
deteriorate. 

It could even cause irreversible damage to the body. Otherwise, cultivators. 
would’ve already left the secret realm, and there wouldn’t be any martial arts 
world left. Nonetheless, the spiritual energy is about to be replenished, and a 
battle might start again…” 

There was a flicker of worry in her eyes. A battle for resources will happen 
again after the recovery of spiritual energy. When that timel comes, immortals 
and demon spirits alike will go to any lengths for the sake of their own 
interests! 

“Actually, it’d be a pretty good thing if we could continue living like this. If the 
restoration of spiritual energy occurs, it’ll be a time of tribulation for the 
ordinary people.” 

Jared could imagine each of the secret realms opening. after the spiritual 
energy recovery and the entire world descending into chaos. By then, ordinary 
people will appear utterly worthless to cultivators. 
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change it. The will of the heavens cannot be thwarted.” In truth, Jessica did 



not wish for the situation to come to that either. The day it did would only 
mean misery, suffering, and endless fighting. 

“By the way, Ms. Zimmerman, Demon Sect shares the same origin as Evil 
Heart Sect, the sect behind Warriors Alliance. So why are they allowed to 
roam freely on this earth and are not subjected to the same restrictions?” 

Jared asked curiously. I always thought that the laws of nature only applied to 
spiritual energy cultivators but not demonic energy cultivators. From the looks 
of it, however, it seems that Demon Sect also has to abide by the same 
restrictions. That means my assumption was incorrect. 

“The same restrictions apply to Evil Heart Sect. Why else do you think they 
haven’t sent a skilled fighter to kill you after how you provoked Warriors 
Alliance? 

Warriors Alliance is nothing more than Evil Heart Sect’s representative in the 
mundane world. Its members are merely people possessed by spirits, and the 
laws of. nature don’t govern spirits without their real bodies. Evil Heart Sect 
used that loophole to make its members commit suicide, then made their 
spirits enter the mundane world. 

However, there’s a fatal flaw to that method-the strength of those possessed 
by the spirits will be greatly diminished. Also, not everyone is suitable to be a 
host, and selecting a host isn’t all that simple. 

Evil Heart Sect has gone all out to lay out their plans in the mundane world 
before the spiritual energy recovery. However, their practice of attaining 
what’s effectively a pyrrhic victory is too cruel,” she replied. 

Jared looked shocked as he listened to her detailed explanation. It never 
crossed his mind that Evil Heart Sect would go so far as to make their 
members take their own lives just because they wanted to create spirits. 

Suddenly, he recalled what happened when he was in Demon Sect’s secret 
realm. I wasn’t stopped by the mysterious force when I split my spirit from my 
body to pass through the chaos dimension, so it seems that force is the power 
of the laws of nature. 

Very quickly, another question popped into his head. Jessica doesn’t hold a 
high position within Demon Sect, so why does she know so much? The 



recovery of spiritual energy and Evil Heart Sect’s plans should be considered 
confidential information. How did she learn about all that? 

Puzzled, he asked, “If you don’t mind me asking. how did you come to know 
so much?” 

His question jolted Jessica into the realization. that she had said too much. 
Logically speaking. someone in my position shouldn’t be privy to that much 
information. However, since he’s already getting suspicious, I can’t hide 
anything from him anymore. 

“Mr. Chance, I think of you as a friend. That’s why I’ve unknowingly been so 
open with you. You can’t let my sect leader know what I’ve told you, okay?” 
she responded, gazing at him with an imploring look. 

He nodded. “Not to worry, Ms. Zimmerman. You think of me as a friend, so 
how could I betray a friend?” 

Jessica hesitated for a moment. Then, she finally said, “Because you asked, 
I’ll tell you. I know all that because I heard about them from Mr. Sullivan. It 
seems he knows quite a bit about Evil Heart Sect and shared many things 
with me. Don’t tell anyone about this. If the sect leader finds out, he’ll surely 
punish Mr. Sullivan.” 

“Don’t worry. My lips are sealed,” Jared promised. Nonetheless, he could not 
help feeling puzzled. Why did Patrick tell her all of this? Even if the two are in 
a relationship, there’s no need to touch on these matters. After all, in the 
current environment, the more one knows, the more dangerous that could be. 
If Patrick cared about her safety, he wouldn’t have told her these things. 

“Ms. Zimmerman, I’m still a little confused. Why did Mr. Sullivan tell you all 
these? After all, it won’t do you any good to be aware of these matters, right?” 
Jared asked. 
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confessed, “The vice president was drunk once, and he came to my room to 
tell me he would give me a life I couldn’t expect…” “He went to your room, 
drunk? Don’t tell me you guys…” 



Sensing his scrutiny, the redness on Jessica’s cheeks grew even more 
intense. “I already belong to Mr. Sullivan,” Jessica muttered softly, lowering 
her head. 

Not knowing what to say, Jared forced an awkward smile and continued to 
stuff food into his mouth. While they were eating, a weird feeling as though 
someone was watching him crept up his back. 

Jared scrunched his brows at the unpleasant feeling before unleashing his 
spiritual sense. A smile curved his lips shortly after, and he withdrew his 
spiritual sense. 

“What’s wrong, Mr. Chance?” Jessica asked curiously when she noticed the 
swift change in his expression. “It’s nothing. Let’s eat. I suppose someone 
can’t wait any longer,” Jared said with a smile. “Can’t wait any longer? Who’s 
waiting for us?” 

Jessica was perplexed. “You’ll know in a while. Let’s eat.” Jared hurriedly 
finished his food. After they finished eating and paid for the food, Jared 
followed Jessica out of the restaurant. 

Jared might look like he was strolling casually down the streets, but he was 
observing the person following them stealthily. Meanwhile, Kayson stood at a 
corner down the street. “Are you ready? They’re almost here,” he asked his 
eight subordinates. 

“Everything is ready, Mr. Zagorski. Rest assured,” one of his subordinates 
replied. 

“Great!” Kayson nodded with satisfaction, and the corners of his lips curled up 
into a smile. “Since that dipsh*t dares to hit my face, I’ll let him feel the power 
of the Zagorski family’s Soul Binding Chains.” 

When Jared and Jessica reached the corner, the latter frowned at the fleeting 
sense of danger. 

“Something’s wrong, Mr. Chance. This place. should be bustling with people, 
but why is it so quiet?” Jessica said with alarm as she became wary of their 
surroundings. 

“Maybe they all went home after a meal. There’s nothing strange about 
it.” Jared assured her with a smile before continuing forward. 



“Mr. Chance, watch out for any ambush. I sense something is not right 
here.” Jessica swiftly stepped in front of Jared and cautiously scanned both 
sides of the street. 

Anxiety filled Kayson, who was hiding in the corner, as he watched Jessica 
block Jared from walking forward. If Jared doesn’t come nearer, he can’t walk 
into the trap I set. 

“F*ck! This b*tch better not ruin my plan!” Kayson cussed as he hid in the 
dark. “You’re being too cautious, Ms. Zimmerman. I think it’s quite safe here. 
Don’t worry.” 

Jared shoved Jessica aside and continued walking. Jared’s stupidity filled 
Kayson with glee. This dumb’ss! Fate is on my side! 

Keeping a watchful eye on their surroundings, Jessica slowly reached for her 
sword and rested her hand on the hilt in case of any unexpected threat. 

Jared turned the corner and saw the street was desolate. With a sweep of his 
gaze, he continued walking ahead nonchalantly with a faint smile. 

Kayson clenched his fists tightly, his palm. clammy from all the nervous 
sweat. Jared was so close to walking into the trap. when he abruptly came to 
a halt. 

Kayson’s heart almost jumped out of his throat at that point. His entire body 
was strung tight with tension. Walk into it! A bit more! Walk into it! Kayson 
pleaded silently. 

“You said it was dangerous, Ms. Zimmerman, but I don’t see anything.” Jared 
turned around and even took two steps back to speak with Jessica. 

Jessica scanned the surroundings again. Even though she could sense 
danger, she wasn’t sure about it. When she saw no threat, she let down her 
guard. “Maybe I’m too sensitive,” Jessica commented. 
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the same couldn’t be said for Kayson. He watched as Jared nearly stepped 
into his trap, but to his dismay, Jared stepped back when he was just one step 
away. 



“Mr. Chance, I think we should head back even though there’s no 
danger.” Jessica brushed past Jared and took the lead.. 

When Kayson saw Jessica had taken the lead, his heart almost skipped a 
beat. If Jessica triggers the trap, Jared will flee. Frustration inundated Kayson, 
and he was like a cat on a hot tin roof. 

“Ms. Zimmerman.” At that moment, Jared called out to Jessica. The latter 
halted to look over her shoulder at Jared. “What’s wrong, Mr. Chance?” 
Jessica asked. 

“It’s nothing, but I think I should take the lead. It’s more appropriate since I’m 
the guest, after all.” Jared chuckled. Despite her confusion, Jessica quickly 
complied with a smile. “You’re right. After you, my respected guest.” 

She gestured for Jared to walk ahead, and Jared strode past her 
nonchalantly. Kayson was, of course, elated when he saw that. 

Serves you right for putting on airs, you dumb’ss! I’m just waiting for you to 
take the bait. Kayson cackled silently with his gaze fixed on Jared. 

When Jared finally walked into Kayson’s trap. the sky suddenly turned dark, 
and eight men emerged from both sides of the street. Each of them held a 
black chain in their hands. 

All eight of them tossed one end of the chain at Jared simultaneously. With 
chains wrapped around Jared tightly like snakes, his feet were firmly rooted to 
the ground. He couldn’t move his body at all. 

Jessica unsheathed her sword urgently, eager to rescue Jared. However, 
Jared shouted, “Run, Ms.. Zimmerman! Leave me here! Otherwise, none of us 
will get to flee!” 

Jessica halted in her tracks upon hearing Jared’s warning. She then yelled, 
“Don’t worry, Mr. Chance! I’ll go get help! We’ll definitely rescue you!” 

Following a leap into the air, she disappeared. Jessica knew that the only 
person who would want to capture Jared was Kayson from the Zagorski family 
because Kayson bore a grudge against Jared. 



With her abilities, she was aware she couldn’t go up against the entire 
Zagorski family, so she ran. Kayson didn’t give chase as he watched her 
disappear. His only target was Jared. 

Seeing Jared constrained by his family’s Soul Binding Chains, Kayson happily 
came strutting out of the dark corner. 

“I told you before, Jared. No one dares to disrespect me in Norham. You’re 
the first, so you’re going to pay for that today,” Kayson sneered. 

Jared wasn’t nervous in the slightest when he saw Kayson come out of hiding. 
Instead, he asked with a smile, “So you got me. What are you planning to do 
with me? Kill me?” 

“No. How can I kill you? You’re a celebrity in the martial arts world. I just want 
the martial arts world to know who stands at the top among the youth. No 
matter how powerful you are, you’re now my prisoner. I want my father to look 
at us. He thinks too highly of you. In truth, you’re not as powerful as you 
seem.” 

With a wave of his arm, he ordered, “Take him away, I want the whole world 
to see that I, Kayson Zagorski, have defeated the brightest nova of the martial 
arts world.” 

Jared didn’t resist one bit and compliantly followed Kayson back to the 
Zagorski residence. “Dad! Dad!” Kayson began shouting the minute he 
stepped through the front door. 

He wanted Austin to see Jared wasn’t as powerful as rumored, and he was 
the one who captured Jared. In the meantime, Austin was discussing 
business with the executives of the Zagorski family. 

A crease formed between his brows when he heard Kayson’s screaming. 
“What did that sh*thead do now?” he uttered in annoyance. 

“Let’s call it a day. You can leave now. Don’t bring up what we discussed with 
anyone,” he warned before waving his arm dismissively. Stepping out of the 
secret room, he barked at Kayson, “What are you screaming about? Why are 
you looking for me?” 
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A Man Like None Other Chapter 1879-At his father’s appearance, Kayson 
joyfully bragged, “Dad, you said Jared was powerful, didn’t you? So what if 
he’s powerful? I still caught him in the end! I want the entire martial arts world 
to know that I captured Jared Chance.” 

Kayson held his head high as he showed off triumphantly to his father. Shock 
crossed Austin’s face. “What did you say?” 

“I said I captured Jared Chance,” Kayson repeated. “How is that possible? 
That guy isn’t even scared of the Warriors Alliance. Numerous elites from 
Warriors Alliance have died at his hands. 

How did you catch him?” Austin was doubtful of his son’s claim. After all, he 
knew Kayson’s capabilities better than anyone. “Dad, how can you not believe 
me? I used the Soul Binding Chains to catch him,” Kayson explained. 

Anger surged within Austin. “F*ck! You b*stard! Are you trying to piss me to 
death? How could you use the Soul Binding Chains for such a reason?” “Dad, 
I’ve already used it, and I caught Jared. 

The Zagorski family name shall rise to fame in the martial arts world. By then, 
we won’t have to stay cooped up in this tiny city anymore. We can develop our 
family business in bigger cities, Kayson said indifferently. 

“You… You…” Austin’s entire body was trembling from anger. “Where is 
Jared now?” “He’s in the front yard. I’ll take you to him. You’ll see. He’s just 
human, too.” 

Kayson led Austin to the front yard. A conflicting look crossed Austin’s face 
when he saw Jared tied to a large pillar in the Zagorski family’s front yard by 
the Soul Binding Chains. 

After a moment of hesitation, Austin hurried over to Jared. “Mr. Chance, I’m so 
sorry. My son was a fool to offend you.” 

“You know me?” Jared was surprised by Austin’s courteousness since he 
wasn’t acquainted with the Zagorski family. 

“No one in the martial arts world hasn’t heard. of your name. You’re the finest 
among the youth of the martial arts world, Mr. Chance. May I know the reason 
you traveled all the way here to Norham, Mr. Chance?” 



Austin wanted to know if Jared’s arrival had anything to do with what was 
about to happen in Norham. “A friend brought me here for fun,” 
Jared answered casually. 

Naturally, he couldn’t reveal his collaboration with the Demon Sect to 
Austin. “Are you just here to sightsee, Mr. Chance?” Austin had doubts about 
Jared’s words. 

Taking note of Austin’s reaction, Jared felt there was more to it than met the 
eye, so he questioned, “Why do you think I’m here in. Norham then, Mr. 
Zagorski?” 

Stumped by Jared’s question, Austin smiled sheepishly and said ingratiatingly, 
“I suppose you’re here for recreation, too. However, with your fame and 
stature in the martial arts world, the Zagorski family should welcome you 
warmly for your arrival in Norham.” 

When Austin attempted to untie Jared, Kayson ran up to stop him. “Dad, are 
you crazy? It took me so much effort to capture him!” 

Slap! Austin raised his hand and gave Kayson a slap across the cheek. “You 
b*stard! I’m now the Zagorski family matriarch! Are you intending to rebel 
against me right now?” 

Kayson’s temper flared. Biting the bullet, he said stubbornly, “Dad, I won’t let 
you release him no matter what. Kill me if you want, but I can’t take this lying 
down.” 

Kayson was threatening Austin, for he knew Austin wouldn’t kill him since he 
was his only son. “You!” Austin’s face flushed in anger when he was 
threatened by his own son. 
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A Man Like None Other Chapter 1880-Austin lifted his hand but couldn’t bring 
himself to thrust his palm down. After all, he couldn’t truly beat Kayson to 
death. 

“I’m starting to feel a little embarrassed because you two are arguing about 
whether to release me.” Jared smiled. “I’ll just take this matter into my own 
hands to avoid a conflict between you two.” 



With that, golden lights enveloped Jared’s body, and the terrifying aura he 
emitted filled the air above the Zagorski residence. Sensing Jared’s 
formidable aura, Austin and Kayson widened their eyes in utter astonishment. 

Clang! All of a sudden, the eight Soul Binding Chains restraining Jared 
shattered and fell to the floor. Austin and Kayson were stunned after seeing 
that. 

The Soul Binding Chains was the Zagorski family’s heirloom and was a high-
grade magical item. Yet, Jared had effortlessly destroyed it. Jared brushed the 
dust off his body and said to Austin nonchalantly, “Mr. Zagorski, sorry that I 
broke your family heirloom.” 

Austin remained silent because he was at a loss for words, while Kayson 
stared fearfully at Jared as if he was looking at a devil. His arrogance earlier 
had entirely dissipated at that instant. 

“I shall forgive you today on your father’s account. If you dare to repeat this 
mistake, I suggest the Zagorski family get ready to attend your funeral,” Jared 
said to Kayson. 

Then, he turned around and left. Austin regained his senses when Jared 
reached the doorway. He hastily chased after the latter. 

“Mr. Chance, wait up. Please hold on,” Austin shouted Jared spun on his 
heels to look at Austin. “Do you want me to compensate you for the family 
heirloom, Mr. Zagorski?” 

“No, no, that’s not it. My son was at fault in the first place, so I wouldn’t dare to 
ask you for compensation. I simply wish to invite you into. my house to be my 
guest so my son can apologize to you. Besides, I’ve heard many great things 
about you, Mr. Chance, so I wish to have a chat with you.” 

Austin asked Jared to stay because he wanted to have a talk with 
Jared. “Okay,” Jared agreed without hesitation. Austin led Jared into his room, 
then instructed Kayson, “B*stard, get over here and pour Mr. Chance a cup of 
coffee!” 

Kayson put his haughty demeanor away and respectfully filled a cup of coffee 
for Jared. Judging by how Jared had easily broken the Soul Binding Chains 
into pieces, Kayson figured he was no match for Jared as the gap between 
their abilities was vast beyond his imagination. 



Austin raised his cup of coffee and uttered courteously, “Mr. Chance, my 
negligence in educating my son had caused him to offend you. I wish to 
apologize to you in his stead. I hope you’ll have mercy and forgive my son.” 

“That’s all right, Mr. Zagorski. It’s just a small misunderstanding,” Jared 
responded with a faint smile. 

Austin felt more at ease after hearing that. Otherwise, if Jared were to pursue 
that matter further and harm Kayson, Kayson’s life would be in danger. 

“Mr. Chance, it is Norham’s honor to host you. I’ll immediately order my 
subordinates to arrange accommodation for you. You can choose any place 
you wish to stay in Norham. Moreover, please feel free to do whatever you 
want here. 

You can also stay as long as you desire. I am capable of providing you with 
great luxury in this city.” Austin began to bootlick Jared. “You’re too kind, Mr. 
Zagorski. As I mentioned, I’ll leave very soon since I’m just here with my friend 
on a short getaway.” 

Jared reemphasized he was merely there for al few days of vacation. He 
could sense that Austin was cautious toward his sudden arrival at Norham, 
seemingly afraid that he might be plotting something. 

 


