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Charlie left the hotel, rode on his little e-car, and ran for the Pearl River Woods first.

This community has just opened, and recently it has been advertising and promoting
sales everywhere in Aurous Hill, so Charlie also heard about it.

If you change it to a few years ago, any newly opened community will be sold out by
crazy citizens and speculators in a very short time.

However, recently real estate brokers are not doing well, and many new communities
are experiencing slow sales, so these developers have begun to do everything possible
to promote sales.

Wendy originally wanted to apply for a real estate sales job, but because the salary for
this job would not be settled until the next month, so she had to go back and work as a
temporary etiquette lady in an etiquette company.

To put it plainly, the etiquette company is a human intermediary company.

Like housekeeping agencies, they signed a large number of girls who wanted to be
courtesy ladies, and then set different prices according to the external conditions of
each girl and then took the information of these girls to match with Party A.

For example, if a clubhouse opens for a celebration, if twenty slender, beautiful, and
temperamental ladies are needed, they will directly talk to the etiquette company.

The etiquette company takes the profile photos of the etiquette, let Party A choose, after
the selection, negotiate the price, and then arrange the schedule and time with the
etiquette.



Generally speaking, the cost of Party A to the etiquette company is, on average, an
etiquette lady, ranging from 400 to 800 per day.

However, these etiquette companies will take half or more from the middle and give the
etiquette ladies 200 to 400 compensation.

Although Wendy is not as pretty as Claire, she is definitely a beauty, with a good figure
and good temperament. In Party A, she can get 800 stalls.

Correspondingly, the etiquette company should also give her 400 a days remuneration.

However, the person in charge of the etiquette company realized that Wendy was short
of money, so he deliberately lowered her price, only willing to give her two hundred yuan
a day.

Wendy felt that the three relatives in the family were waiting to eat and take medicine,
and they couldn’t cut off their cash income every day, so even if she was exploited a
little bit harder, she could only accept it with anger.

At this time, she was wearing a blue cheongsam-style lady etiquette uniform, standing
at the door of the Red Woods sales office to welcome guests.

The current season is still the first month, the temperature is very low, and the uniform
she wears is very thin, and her calf wearing only silk stockings is exposed underneath.
After standing at the door for less than half an hour, her body has become stiff from the
cold.

However, in order to make money, she did not dare to have any complaints, she could
only clench her teeth and persist.

At this time, she had been standing at the door for more than an hour. She was
trembling with cold, her face was pale and her lips were blue, but she still forced herself
to keep the sign of the lady of manners smiling, nodding and bowing to every customer
who entered the sales office. Say hello.

At this time, a woman in a mink fur coat came out from the sales office and said to
Wendy: “Girl, today President Liu ordered that all our hostesses must sign an exclusive



guarantee agreement with the company, while there are no customers. Come to see the
room, you sign the agreement with me.”

The woman’s name was Mia Chen, who was the site supervisor of Wendy’s etiquette
company and the second in command of the company.

Wendy asked respectfully, “Sister Mia, what does the exclusive guarantee agreement
mean?”

Mia said arrogantly: “The exclusive guarantee agreement means that from now on, you
can only cooperate with our etiquette service company exclusively, and you cannot
have any form of business dealings with other etiquette companies. Otherwise, the
company has the right to request You compensate.”
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Wendy asked again: “Isn’t it an exclusive guarantee agreement? What does the
guarantee mean other than exclusive cooperation with our company?”

Mia explained: “The guarantee means that you have to guarantee a minimum of 28
events for the company in a month. If due to your personal reasons, the number of
events in the month does not meet the requirements, the company will also ask you to
Compensation, or deduct part of your labor costs.”

Wendy asked, “Will the company benefit from signing this agreement?”

“Benefits?” Mia curled her lips: “The good thing is that as long as you follow the
company’s requirements and have at least 28 activities per month, the company will
give you a basic salary of 5,000 yuan.”

When Wendy heard this, she said with joy: “Sister Mia, what do you mean is that in
addition to the 200 yuan for each event, the company also gives a basic salary of 5,000
yuan?”

“Yes.” Mia nodded and said: “This is a contract specially prepared by the company for
employees. Most people don’t have this opportunity.”



After that, she handed the agreement to Wendy and urged: “Come, sign, and handprint
quickly, and I will take it back to the company and report it to Mr. Liu when I’m done.”

Wendy was overjoyed. If there are 28 activities in a month, the activity fee alone will be
5,000 yuan, plus a basic salary of 5,000 yuan, which is more than 10,000 yuan!

She hadn’t looked down upon her with a monthly salary of over 10,000 before, but now,
a monthly salary of over 10,000 is of great significance to her.

With this income, the family no longer has to go hungry. Moreover, as long as the
money is used for living expenses, as long as they don’t buy things randomly, the family
can definitely eat well, and the recovery speed of the father and brother’s body must be
a lot faster.

She was overjoyed and didn’t think much about it. She probably looked at the contract
and saw that the basic salary of 5,000 yuan per month was indeed written, so she
relieved herself and immediately signed her name, and then covered it with the ink pad
that Mia handed over. Made her own handprints.

After receiving the contract, Mia smiled triumphantly and said, “Oh, Wendy, you are
welcome to become the exclusive contract artist of our Shangmei etiquette company.
You must work hard in the future!”

Wendy said excitedly: “Sister Mia you can rest assured, I will definitely work harder!”

Mia hummed, and said, “Okay, I’ll go back to the company first. After you are off work,
you can sign with your team leader to go back.”

Wendy hurriedly asked: “Sister Mia, are you still here this afternoon?”

Mia waved her hand: “I won’t come here. The company has taken over etiquette work in
several other buildings today. I will go to inspect the site this afternoon.”

Wendy has worked with this company for a few days, knowing that Mia is the person
responsible for on-site payment of salaries. At the end of every day, she takes cash to
settle the settlement for everyone, so when she heard that she would not come in the
afternoon, she hurriedly asked: “Sister Mia, do you find the team leader to settle today’s
expenses after getting off work?”



Mia looked surprised: “The cost? What is the cost?”

Wendy hurriedly said, “That’s the etiquette expenses for today…two hundred yuan…”

Mia looked at Wendy and said with contempt: “I said Wendy, did you not wake up?
What dreams are you doing here?”

Wendy said nervously, “Sister Mia, I…what’s wrong with me?”

Mia shook the contract in her hand and said coldly: “Wendy, the contract is clearly
written. The company will give you a basic salary of 5,000 yuan and pack your 28
activities per month. All your remuneration is in these five thousand are included in the
monthly salary. What do you want me to pay for today’s etiquette? Doing a job and
asking for money twice, why do you think so? Are you so beautiful?”
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When Wendy heard Mia’s words, she asked in surprise: “Sister Mia, didn’t you just say
that? The money for the activities separate and the basic salary is not included in it!”

Mia curled her lips and said: “What you think is really beautiful! I tell you, Mr. Liu said
that in the future, all etiquette ladies must settle monthly, so starting from today, you will
work for the company steadily, as long as you are full Twenty-eight activities, you will
receive a basic salary of five thousand on the 15th of next month!”

Wendy’s expression suddenly became embarrassed, and she said: “Sister Mia, one
event is 200, and 28 events should be five thousand and six. The company uses five
thousand yuan to pack it. That means I will give the company three for nothing every
month. what……”

After that, she said very embarrassedly: “I’m relatively tight lately, I can’t accept this kind
of cooperation method of monthly settlement, or I won’t sign it…”

“Huh? No sign?” Mia sneered: “Wendy, do you think that Miss Etiquette’s wings
hardened after a few days of work?”

Wendy shook her head and said religiously: “Sister Mia, I didn’t mean that, I think this
cooperation method is really not suitable for me…”



Mia snorted and said seriously: “Wendy, let me tell you that you have signed the
contract. If you want to break the contract at this time, you must bear the responsibility
for the breach of contract!”

Wendy realized that she had been deceived, so she hurriedly asked: “What is the
responsibility for the breach of contract?”

Mia raised the contract in her hand and sneered: “This is clearly written in black and
white. You have signed a contract with the company voluntarily. If you voluntarily breach
the contract, you will have to pay the company a penalty of 500,000 yuan. Otherwise,
the company has the right to sue you in court!”

As soon as Wendy heard this, she felt a little frustrated and hurriedly pleaded: “Sister
Mia, I rely on two hundred yuan to support my family every day. Please, there are two
patients who are paralyzed in bed at my house. Kindly void that contract…”

“Void?” Mia sarcastically said: “What is your dream? You can also make this contract
void. First, bring 500,000 yuan in a penalty!”

Wendy said: “Sister Mia if I get 500,000 yuan, I won’t come to do this job…”

“Yo!” Mia scoffed and said with a mockery: “Listening to tone, it seems that you think
this job is shameful?”

Wendy hurriedly shook her head: “I didn’t mean that I just wanted to say, I really can’t
spend that much money…”

Mia roared fiercely: “You fcking slt can’t get the liquidated damages and still haunt me
here? If you can’t get the liquidated damages, you can work honestly with me! The
contract period for this contract is three years. In three years and thirty-six months, you
have to do 28 games every month, otherwise, one less game and one thousand
deductions until all deductions are made!”

“What?!” Wendy cried anxiously, and blurted out: “Aren’t you cheating? It’s less than two
hundred yuan for one game. If you lose one game, you will deduct one thousand. If I do
it in a month Twenty-three games, five games are missing, then you want to deduct all
my five thousand dollars?”



Mia glared at Wendy and said with a smile: “You should be fortunate that the contract is
only deducted and you are not compensated. If you are allowed to compensate, you will
lose all your earned money!”

Wendy blurted out: “It’s too evil of you! I won’t do it! I won’t honor the contract!”

“Not fulfilled?” Mia sneered: “If you don’t fulfill it, then follow me back to the company
and give the company an IOU of 500,000!”

Wendy was anxious and asked: “Why?!”

“Why?” Mia curled her lips in disdain, turned around, and rushed to a golden cup car at
the door to beckoned. In the car, four strong men came out of the car and directly
surrounded Wendy.

Mia scolded the brawny men: “Take her into the car and get her back to the company! I
don’t believe it anymore. I can’t stop her from being a rebel!”

“Okay Sister Mia!” One of the strong men immediately responded, and even if he led
someone to the front, he grabbed Wendy’s arm tightly, and yelled: “Honestly follow us in
the car, otherwise you will not feel better! “
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“I’m not going!” Wendy blurted out, “You are committing a crime in broad daylight! I want
to call the police to arrest you!”

“Call the police?” Mia came up and slapped Wendy, and yelled, “You f*cking think you
can bluff me by calling the police? Tell you, there are so many ways for me to see you
with a cheap hoof! I have a million ways to do it. I can get you killed !”

Wendy blurted out: “You are too bullying! Now it’s a society under the rule of law! How
can you be allowed to be so nonsense!”

Mia sneered and said: “What about bullying you? What I am doing is bullying? I tell you,
President Liu is the number one person on Aurous Hill Road. If you dare to be smart, it’s
not just you who will feel the heat, at the end, your family will not have anything to eat!”



She said, “Wendy, don’t blame me for not reminding you, don’t say anything else, just
the contract you signed and drew in my hand. The price of ten thousand is sold to a
debt collection agency. When the time comes, people from the collection agency will
come to your house every day to block you and force you to pay back the money. Paint,
no matter where you go to work, they will go to the place where you work and beat you
to death.

Mia’s etiquette company was originally built by a gray group in Aurous Hill.

Their mode of operation is to first use normal cooperation to lure the little girls in, then
trick them into signing a sales agreement, and then use the sales agreement to firmly
control them.

Plain looks generally become their coolies, with the lowest remuneration, helping them
to be polite ladies everywhere, desperately squeezing, and some even run three or four
activities a day.

And those who look better are basically forced to go to KTV to be a princess or lady,
and some are even forced to go on the road of the dust.

Mia feels that Wendy’s appearance is indeed excellent. If she is controlled and sent to
high-end clubs, she can create at least 50,000 or 60,000 benefits in a month, which is
definitely a cash cow.

She was also worried that there would be many dreams in the night, so she hurriedly
said to those people: “Quickly, get her in the car!”

Several strong men immediately grabbed Wendy and dragged her into the car.

Wendy’s scared soul was not possessed, and she blurted out, “Help! it is a Kidnapping!”

Some passers-by heard it and looked over immediately.

Mia hurriedly said loudly: “Don’t get me wrong, we are Aurous Hill Shangmei etiquette
company, a formal enterprise!”



“This girl is one of our employees. Some time ago, her parents had a car accident. Our
boss kindly lent her 500,000 yuan to see a doctor. In the end, she did well and quietly
took the money to gamble!”

“Don’t talk about losing all the money, and abandoning her parents in the hospital
regardless. We are going to take her to the hospital to see her dying parents and see if
we can reawaken her conscience!”

When everyone heard this, they didn’t know who to believe.

At this time, Mia whispered to those people: “Get in the car!”

Those people immediately pulled Wendy out of the car door, and she was about to push
her into the car.

Wendy was frightened at this time, and her heart was desperate. She knew in her heart
that once she got in the car, she would be on the thief ship, and she might not be able to
get off in her life…

Just when she was desperate and didn’t know what to do, she suddenly heard a familiar
voice whispering coldly: “Let her go!”
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With this roar, Wendy and others including Mia immediately followed the sound
subconsciously.

At this moment, they saw Charlie riding his electric bike, quickly approaching everyone.

Immediately, Charlie stopped the electric bike and did not get out of the car. He put his
legs on the sides of the electric bike and said in a cold voice, “Let her come to me.”

When Mia saw that Charlie was driving an electric bike, her expression immediately
became extremely disdainful, and sarcastically said: “Who should you be? a hero to
save China? It turns out to be a damn sc*mbag!”

After she finished speaking, she gave a cold snort and snorted: “Smelly filth, I tell you,
don’t be nosy here, otherwise, I will make you unable to eat!”



Seeing Charlie’s sudden appearance, Wendy immediately felt a strong sense of
security, and hurriedly cried out: “Brother-in-law, brother-in-law, please help me,
brother-in-law…”

When Mia heard this, she couldn’t help but sneered: “Oh, you are her brother-in-law,
what’s the matter? Want to redeem her?”

Charlie smiled and asked her, “How do you call this lady? I don’t know where my
sister-in-law has offended you?”

Mia curled her lips: “You are not worthy of knowing my name. As for how your
sister-in-law has offended me, you don’t need to know so clearly. You only need to know
one thing. Your sister-in-law owes me five hundred thousand, if you pay the money, I will
let her go now; if you don’t pay, then I will take her away!”

Wendy hurriedly said aggrieved: “Brother-in-law, I don’t owe them money at all. They
lied to me to sign a contract. The contract came with a penalty of 500,000 yuan. This is
completely a contract fraud… ..”

Charlie waved his hand: “Ok, Wendy, don’t talk, I’ll talk to this young lady.”

After that, he looked at Mia with a smile, and said, “Beauty, isn’t it half a million? This
matter is really easy to solve. Otherwise, you can give me a card number or your Alipay
now. Account, I will send you 500,000 immediately.”

Mia frowned and looked at Charlie, and said coldly: “Cut, what the hell? You don’t even
have a decent car to drive, can you give me half a million?”

Charlie didn’t get angry, so he took out his mobile phone and smiled: “In this way, you
can open your Alipay now, and I will transfer the money to you now. If the money
arrives, you will release the person directly; if the money does not arrive, you can do
whatever you like.”

Mia started to hesitate at this time.

She thought to herself: “Looking at his stupid look, he doesn’t seem to be bragging. If he
can really put out 500,000, this is an excellent deal. Even if I bring Wendy back and
force her to work for me. , She can be squeezed for tens of thousands of dollars a



month at most. If he wants to squeeze out 500,000, it will take at least half a year or
even longer for Wendy to earn for the company…”

“Now that this idiot is willing to spend half a million to settle this matter, wouldn’t I just
make half a million for nothing in one morning?”

Thinking of this, she immediately said to Charlie: “Since you really have the intention to
settle this matter for her, then I will give you a chance, but don’t blame me for not
reminding you in advance. If you dare to play with me, Not only will I take your
sister-in-law away today, even you will not end well!”

Charlie smiled and said: “Don’t worry, you have so many people here, how dare I play a
trick on you?”

Mia snorted and immediately took out her mobile phone and opened her Alipay.

Charlie casually scanned the QR code for receiving payments, and then immediately fill
in an amount of 500,000 in the transfer column.

Because the amount is relatively large, Alipay requires full name verification, so Charlie
smiled and said to Mia: “Beauty, it won’t work if you don’t tell me your name this time.
The transfer needs to be verified.”

Mia shrugged her shoulders and said arrogantly: “My name is Mia, my last name is
Chen.”


