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Chapter 851

When he came to the place where the red fruit grew, the little white snake looked at
George Han vigilantly, and vomited a red letter.

The last time George Han ate red fruit as a meal, Xiao Bai Snake was so distressed.
Looking at it this time, it seemed that George Han wouldn’t succeed in any way.

But George Han didn’t care. He is about to go to the second world. This kind of
good thing is prepared and can bring more, so naturally he has to get more.

He slapped Xiao Bai Snake’s head and said: “Go away, want me to take you away.
Still reluctant to have such a broken thing?”

Little White Snake was beaten and shook her head, obviously a little dizzy, Jiang
Yingying on the side was happy to see.

“Brother George. This little guy is really human, much more fun than cats and
dogs.” Jiang Yingying said.

George Han smiled faintly, and continued to say to Xiaobai Snake: “I will take you
away from here and return to where you used to live. These fruits are useless to
stay here. Who wouldn’t you give me?”

Little white snake’s red eyes clearly flashed with a hint of surprise, and he took the
red fruit with his mouth and delivered it to George Han.

George Han no longer felt surprised that it could understand his own words. He
just said: “You little thing is quite realistic. It is very happy to be able to go home,
right?”

The little white snake nodded, still with some excitement.



Red fruits grow from vines, which cover the entire wall. Since George Han and
Jiang Yingying had already been eaten a lot last time, there was not much left.
After peeling off the vines and searching carefully several times, it was only a
dozen.

George Han gave half of it to Jiang Yingying.

“I really want to go with me?” George Han asked Jiang Yingying. He and Jiang
Yingying mentioned the second world in the past. Originally, George Han planned
not to let Jiang Yingying go. After all, there are too many there. Unknown danger,
and whether he can return alive is still unknown. He didn’t want Jiang Yingying to
die with her.

But Jiang Yingying’s attitude was firm, and George Han could not refuse.

“Brother George, I have all thoughts, and I have decided, you can’t persuade me.”
Jiang Yingying said.

George Han smiled helplessly and said, “Aren’t you afraid of death?”

“Die sooner or later, one day you will die. Why should you be afraid.” Jiang
Yingying said simply.

George Han nodded and stopped struggling with this question.

Frowning and looking at Xiao Bai Snake, if you want to take this guy out of the
Demon King’s Cave, you have to think of a way, and you must not let other people
find out, otherwise, George Han’s experience in the Demon King’s Cave will be
hard to hide.

If others were to know that the alien beasts in the Demon King’s Cave would not
harm him, it would probably trigger a lot of rumors.



Little White Snake seemed to understand what George Han was thinking about,
and walked in front of George Han, got directly into George Han’s cuff, and
entrenched it on his arm. Will not be discovered by anyone.

“This thing is really good at observing appearance, if it can talk, at least it can tell
me what the second world is.” George Han said.

“Brother George. After all, he is a beast, how could he speak human words.” Jiang
Yingying said with a smile.

George Han nodded, this is indeed a bit extravagant, but he just said casually, and
didn’t really think so.

“Let’s go, after leaving the Demon King’s Cave. We are about to face a brand new
world.” George Han said.

This time, I entered the Demon King’s Cave not long ago, just a short period of
half a day, but when George Han left the Demon’s Cave again alive, he still evoked
a lot of repercussions in Apocalypse, and was able to come and go freely in the
Demon’s Cave as his own home. Those strong in the sky. Everyone sighed for how
powerful George Han was.

George Han has created incredible miracles one after another in Tianqi, which will
surely be recorded in history.

Yi Lao and He Qingfeng appeared in front of George Han for the first time.

After He Qingfeng and George Han played against George Han, he didn’t dare to
despise George Han any more. Even if he didn’t know that George Han and his
boxing didn’t show their full strength, it would be enough for him to retreat. Three
thousand admired.



“Do you know what those people are talking about now?” Yi Lao said to George
Han with a smile.

“What?” George Han looked at Yi Lao with questions.

“They said that the Devil’s Cave is not as terrible as expected. After all, you can
come out so easily.” Yi Lao said, except for the powerhouse of Tianzi level, no one
can understand how powerful George Han’s pioneering work is. People below the
Tianzi level even feel that the Devil’s Cave is no longer scary, and now it has
caused many people to eagerly try. Want to challenge the Devil’s Cave.

“Didn’t your goal happen to be achieved?” George Han said.

Elder Yi does not deny that he hopes to use George Han to eliminate other people’s
fear of Demon King’s Cave, because Apocalypse needs the birth of a strong
person, and he must cross the hurdle of Demon King’s Cave. In the past ten years,
no one has been able to pass the test of the Demon King’s Cave, which has formed
a stalemate, and no one dares to challenge it.

And the appearance of George Han. Breaking this stalemate also made the strong
people of the earth word level finally have the confidence to face the Devil’s Cave.

“Nothing in the second world. I still…”

Before Yi Lao finished speaking, George Han interrupted: “There is no discussion
about this matter, I have to go.”

“George Han, you are the hope of Apocalypse in the future, how can you give your
life to risk it? You are in Apocalypse, you can inspire many people, and even more
powerful people will appear because of you. Only you can change the status quo of
Apocalypse.” He Qingfeng said with an anxious look.



George Han looked at He Qingfeng in surprise, and he was able to say such a
thing, which really surprised George Han.

“Hallmaster He, you still care about me?” George Han said.

He Qingfeng shook his head and said straightforwardly: “I don’t care about you,
but about the future of Apocalypse. It makes no sense for you to die.”

To fight against the Second World, Apocalypse requires the birth of a large number
of true strong men. In addition to inspiring the birth of strong men, George Han
believes that his own strength can also play a key role in the war. Maybe he could
turn the tide, if he went to the Second World to die in vain, then it would be a pity
his strength.

“It is the best way to be able to stifle the danger in the cradle. With Apocalypse’s
current strength, do you think you can cultivate thousands of word-level
powerhouses in a short period of time?” George Han was indifferent ‘S expression
asked He Qingfeng.

Thousands of word-level powerhouses?

This is the strength that Apocalypse only possessed during the peak period. To
return to the peak, for the current Apocalypse, it is simply impossible.

“George Han, no matter what, you have to come back alive.” Yi Lao said suddenly,
listening to his words, it seems that he has no intention of blocking George Han.
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He Qingfeng froze for a moment, looked at Yi Lao with puzzled eyes, and said,
“Are you crazy?”



Yi Lao smiled helplessly. He was not crazy, but knew that he could not stop George
Han, what happened now. It was completely beyond what he had imagined. In the
final analysis, he underestimated George Han’s strength, so that his plan was
completely broken. Now the situation is obvious, what George Han has to do. No
one can change.

“Can you stop him?” Yi Lao asked He Qingfeng back.

He Qingfeng subconsciously thought of what had happened above the four main
halls.

At that time, George Han said he couldn’t stop him, and He Qingfeng still felt a
joke.

But now think about it, to block George Han. It is not an easy task.

“George Han, we are for your good.” He Qingfeng said to George Han.

“Dianzhu He, you are an upright person in the face of big truths and wrongs. I
appreciate that, but I still hope that the things I decided to do can understand.”
George Han said.

He Qingfeng sighed. He didn’t know what to say to persuade George Han. This is a
stinky stone. It is really helpless if oil and salt don’t enter.

“When do you plan to go?” Yi Lao asked George Han.

“Tomorrow.” George Han said.

“Is it so urgent?” Yi Lao said.

“If you delay any longer, I’m afraid it will be too late. You should know better than
me what the fluctuation of the forbidden ground means.” George Han said.



Elder Yi nodded. Since he is going, it is better to go as soon as possible. Otherwise,
it is useless to go.

“Is there anything else I can arrange for you?” Yi Lao asked.

“Zhuang Tang and Gong Tian, ​​I hope they can be transferred by me.” George Han
said.

“These two people will be exclusive to you in the future. No one can order them
except you.” After saying this, Yi Lao looked at He Qingfeng.

After all, Apocalypse was not dictated by Yi Lao alone, so He Qingfeng’s consent
was needed.

He Qingfeng nodded helplessly, and said: “The Three Halls give these two
privileges, what they want in the future, the Three Halls will never hide their
privates.”

“Thank you Dianzhu He, see you tomorrow.” George Han left after speaking.

He Qingfeng sighed one after another. Tianqi hadn’t seen such talents for a
hundred years, but he was going to die in the second world, which really made him
feel reluctant.

“If he can stay in Tianqi, he will definitely be able to play a vital role in the future,
you old fellow. Why don’t you persuade your apprentice?” He Qingfeng said.

“He is not my apprentice, it’s just that you think so. We have never had an
apprenticeship between the two of us, and when he goes to the second world,
maybe he will play a bigger role. This is neither you nor me. Expected.” Yi Lao
said.



“That’s how it is said, but by staying behind the Apocalypse, at least you can see
greater hope. After all, the second world is an unknown territory, and no one
knows what it is like there.” He Qingfeng said.

Yi Lao shook his head, he obviously didn’t think so.

With the current strength of Apocalypse. Sitting and waiting for death is definitely
a dead end, otherwise, he would not decide to go to Apocalypse.

In Yi Lao’s opinion. If you want to truly solve this trouble, you can only break
through from within the second world, otherwise the hidden dangers of the second
world will never be solved.

“All we can do now is trust him.”

George Han and Jiang Yingying came to the yellow-character level again.

The two of Zhuang Tang Gongtian are now advancing by leaps and bounds, and
their gratitude to George Han is naturally self-evident. Seeing George Han is
kneeling and welcoming a big gift, like reborn parents.

If it weren’t for George Han’s generosity, the strength of the two of them would
never have been diligent, and they would only be at the yellow character level in
this life, and there would never be a breakthrough, but now. When the
classification competition starts next year, they are fully confident to hit the ground
level.

Seeing the two kneeling, George Han did not stop him, but said: “I hope you can
leave Apocalypse and go to Basin City.”

“We naturally obey your decision, but the apocalypse’s order is not enough, we
dare not leave easily.” Zhuang Tang said.



“From now on, you two only need to obey my orders. As for other people’s words,
you don’t have to worry about it. This is the privilege given to me by Yi Lao and
He Qingfeng. It has been recognized by the Four Doors and Three Halls.” George
Han explained.

Zhuang Tang was shocked. The four gates and three halls are now independently
from George Han?

Although there are not many people in this vein. But it is enough to show that Yi
Lao and He Qingfeng attach importance to George Han.

“In that case, when do you want us to leave?” Zhuang Tang asked.

“Now, it is the responsibility to protect Amelia Su and Han Nian. This is your only
purpose in the future. If they are hurt at all, they will definitely take your lives after
I come back.” George Han said coldly.

“Please rest assured, if you want to hurt them, you must step on the bodies of my
two.” Gong Tian said solemnly.

George Han took out two red fruits and said: “After half a year, taking this red fruit
will make your strength rise again.”

Zhuang Tang and Gong Tian knew how powerful this red fruit was. They were so
excited at this moment that they didn’t know how to speak, so they could only keep
thanking George Han.

“As long as you do what I ask for, I will guarantee you to become a strong Tianzi
rank in the future.” George Han said.

“Thank you, thank you Mr. Han.”



“From today onwards, the two of me will be the pawns of Mr. Han and have
worked for Mr. Han all my life.”

“Remember, no matter who wants to hurt them and kill them without mercy, even
the people of Apocalypse will never let it go.” George Han said.

After George Han left, so he could not even see his back, Gong Tian and Zhuang
Tang stood up.

After carefully harvesting the red fruits, Gong Tian said: “Master, listening to
George Han, he seems to be going somewhere.”

Zhuang Tang scolded: “What Mr. Han is going to do, how can we guess at will,
just do our own thing, hurry up and pack up and set off for Basin City
immediately.”

“Yes.” Gong Tian said.

“Brother George, will it benefit them too much?” Jiang Yingying asked George
Han after walking away. There are not many red fruits left. It is already a treasure.
Now it is given to them both at Jiang Yingying. It seems a pity.

“Compared to the safety of Amelia and Nian’er, these external objects are
nothing.” George Han said lightly.

“But now who else dares to hurt them, Basin City has Boss Mo, and Tianqi can’t
send people to Basin City casually.” Jiang Yingying was puzzled.

“Previous lessons told me that any situation can happen. It is very necessary to take
precautions. Moreover, Tianqi will not send people. It does not mean that He
Xiaoxiao will not. Once a woman’s desire for revenge becomes urgent, she can do
anything. “George Han said.
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After listening to George Han’s words, Jiang Yingying’s eyes flashed with cold
light. For her, anyone who wants to hurt Amelia Su and Han Nian is an enemy.
Since He Xiaoxiao is likely to do so, look at her. It’s best to come and kill.

“Brother George, why didn’t you just kill her?” Jiang Yingying said coldly.

George Han smiled helplessly, but He Xiaoxiao, the daughter of the Lord of the
Three Halls, how could it be possible to kill by saying that he could kill?

If things were so easy to handle, George Han would not let Zhuang Tang and
Gongtian go to Basin City.

Although He Qingfeng now demoted He Xiaoxiao to the yellow character level.
But it doesn’t mean that He Qingfeng doesn’t take He Xiaoxiao seriously. The
reason why he did it was just for others to see. After all, He Xiaoxiao’s words at
the entrance of the Demon King’s Cave that day had already aroused public
outrage, even if he was willing to shelter him. Think about the situation.

“If it weren’t for my influence, He Qingfeng would not demote He Xiaoxiao to the
yellow character level. She is the daughter of He Qingfeng after all. It is the person
He Qingfeng values ​​most. Three thousand said.

“But keeping her is a scourge, I don’t worry.” Jiang Yingying said.

George Han is not at ease, because he can see that He Xiaoxiao is a very vengeful
and vicious woman, but George Han has no choice but to ignore He Qingfeng.
Once He Xiaoxiao is really killed, the inside of Apocalypse may be It will fall
apart, which is not a good result for anyone.

“Don’t worry, apart from Zhuang Tang and Gong Tian, ​​there is also Fang Zhan,
there shouldn’t be any problems.” George Han said.



Jiang Yingying was still worried, after all, they were leaving, and they weren’t
rushing from one city to another, they could go back if something happened. This
is going to the second world, once something really happens here, they don’t even
have the chance to know.

“Brother George, let me warn her.” After that, Jiang Yingying was about to go to
He Xiaoxiao.

George Han grabbed Jiang Yingying’s shoulder and said, “You will only irritate her
even more if you go to her.

Jiang Yingying looked tangled, she knew that there was a hidden danger, but she
couldn’t solve it, so she couldn’t worry about it.

“Go back and rest, it’s time to start tomorrow.” George Han continued.

“Okay.” Jiang Yingying nodded helplessly.

George Han was afraid that Jiang Yingying would only agree on the surface, and
would secretly carry him to find He Xiaoxiao, reminding: “Don’t go to her secretly,
otherwise it will only make her hate stronger, maybe she won’t go to the cloud
From the city. You will also attack Amelia Su and Han Nian because of your
actions.”

“I see, Brother George, I won’t go.” Jiang Yingying said.

The two went back to their rooms to rest. George Han’s heart was sinking. After
all, he was going to face an unknown world tomorrow. It was impossible to say
that he had no worries in his heart, but no matter what, this trip was a must.

“What kind of place is the second world?” George Han, who was sleepless,
suddenly asked the little white snake wrapped around his arm.



Little White Snake had a lazy and expressive expression, turned his head, too lazy
to pay attention to George Han.

George Han has taken offense to Xiaobai Snake’s very human performance. It
understands human speech, but unfortunately it can’t speak and can’t
communicate.

Early the next morning, George Han, who stayed up all night, was still full of
energy. In contrast, Jiang Yingying was slightly haggard.

“Not asleep?” George Han asked Jiang Yingying.

Jiang Yingying nodded and didn’t close her eyes all night. Her mind was full of the
second world. She made a lot of guesses and fantasies, so she couldn’t calm down
and sleep.

“Brother George, you didn’t fall asleep either.” Jiang Yingying asked back.

George Han nodded and was about to speak when He Qingfeng walked towards the
two of them.

“Dianzhu He. Can’t you sleep so early?” George Han asked He Qingfeng with a
smile.

He Qingfeng’s face was as sinking as water, and he asked George Han seriously,
“Have you really considered it clearly? Maybe the choice left is better.”

“Don’t bother with Palace Master He, what I have decided. It won’t change again.”
George Han said.

He Qingfeng sighed. He also stayed up all night, because George Han is a top
talent that is rare in a century. Even if he is not a member of the Third Hall, he does



not want such a talent to fall into the second world. From Qingfeng’s point of view,
his role in Tianqi was the greatest.

“Young man. You are so impulsive, you will never have a chance to regret it in the
future.” He Qingfeng said.

“Hallmaster He, let’s make a bet, how about it?” George Han said with a smile.

“Bet? What to bet?” He Qingfeng asked puzzledly.

“Bet I can come back. If I come back alive, Apocalypse will no longer be divided
into four gates and three halls, what do you think?” George Han said.

The reason why Apocalypse had four gates and three halls was because the
predecessors considered power checks and balances and did not want one person to
be dominant. Although the effect of checks and balances was achieved, the two
veins of the Apocalypse were unable to achieve the same heart. Internal conflicts
are frequent, which is why Tianqi has not seen more strong people.

The division of resources, coupled with the fact that the Four Doors and Three
Halls spent more of their minds on internal fighting, naturally dragged down the
strength of the entire Apocalypse.

“Do you know why the person who founded Tianqi back then had four gates and
three halls?” He Qingfeng asked George Han.

“Of course it’s clear that he doesn’t want a person’s power to be too great and lead
Apocalypse into the wrong path.” George Han said.

He Qingfeng nodded and said, “Since you know, then you should also understand.
This is impossible.”



“Dianzhu He, have you ever thought about why the overall strength of Apocalypse
has been regressing for so many years. Although many masters have fallen in the
war a hundred years ago, the Apocalypse is still standing in place after a hundred
years of recuperation. There is also such an apocalypse. The necessity of existence,
if it is not broken and then stands, the existence of Apocalypse will only be a
tasteless one.” George Han said.

He Qingfeng took a deep breath. As the master of the three halls, he naturally
knows the reason for this, but the integration of the four doors and three halls
requires a ruler with absolute influence, and he needs to be convinced to do this.

“George Han, your ambition is not small, you actually want to control the entire
Apocalypse in your own hands.” He Qingfeng said.

“Dianzhu He, time is almost up. I have to go to the forbidden area. If you are okay,
you can follow me to have a look.” George Han did not answer He Qingfeng’s
question directly, after saying this. So he took Jiang Yingying to the forbidden area.

He Qingfeng was stunned for a while before he quickly followed George Han’s
pace.

But at this moment, He Qingfeng’s attitude towards George Han changed again,
this guy is more than just tough. Even the mind is not so simple, if the apocalypse
is handed over to him, it might really change dramatically.
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Elder Yi and his assistants seem to have arrived early. In addition to these two
people, there are all the Tianzi-level powerhouses of Apocalypse. Unfortunately,
compared to the heyday of Apocalypse, these more than a dozen Tianzi-level
powerhouses seem a bit ridiculous , After all, the previous Apocalypse had the
power to contend with the Second World, but now, these more than ten Tianzi level
powerhouses, it is estimated that it is not enough to stuff the teeth of the Second
World.



“George, I won’t say anything to persuade you, I know it’s useless, after it’s gone. I
have something to tell you.” Yi Lao walked to George Han and said.

George Han did not speak, but stared at the entrance of the second world. Since he
appeared, the energy fluctuation of the entrance has become more obvious, and the
faint sense of involvement also appeared in his heart again, as if in the first There
was a voice in the second world calling him.

“The second world is completely unknown to you, so after you go, you must be
low-key. Before you are familiar with the second world, don’t do anything that is
too popular, and don’t attract the attention of the second world. Your identity is
exposed, and it is very likely that you will be killed.” Elder Yi reminded George
Han.

George Han nodded subconsciously. These reminders don’t need to be said by Yi
Lao. He also knew how to easily get out of the limelight in a completely unfamiliar
place. He still understands the truth of the tree attracting the wind.

“I won’t say anything else, I hope you can come back safely.” Yi Lao said.

George Han glanced at Jiang Yingying.

Jiang Yingying nodded, and the two jumped in tacit understanding.

No one thought that George Han would not hesitate so much. Those more than ten
Tianzi level powerhouses were all shocked.

They admire George Han’s courage, and appreciate George Han’s decisiveness
even more.

“This guy. I’m really not afraid of death.” He Qingfeng gritted his teeth and said.



Yi Lao smiled helplessly and said: ” For the safety of Amelia Su and Han Nian, he
had already put his life and death aside, so there was no fear. “

After a pause, Yi Lao continued to say to He Qingfeng: “George Han cares very
much about the safety of Amelia Su and Han Nian, so I advise you, it is best to
look after your daughter. Her vengeance will definitely not require me to remind
you. If these two people are harmed by your daughter, how serious the
consequences of this matter will be, I don’t need me to remind you.”

“Ying Lao, although my daughter is a little bit stubborn, she shouldn’t be so
insecure. “He Qingfeng said coldly.

“Proper measure?” Yi Lao looked at He Qingfeng mockingly, and said: “She has
been spoiled by you for a long time and she doesn’t know what proportion is.
Don’t you know how many ugly things she has done in Tianqi for so many years?”

“Lao Yi. This is my daughter. It’s not yet your turn to give pointers.” He Qingfeng
looked at Yi Lao dissatisfied.

“If it weren’t related to George Han, I wouldn’t have much to say, but how could I
care about this matter? If Amelia Su and Han Nian were injured or even killed
because of He Xiaoxiao, he would destroy the entire Three Halls and even the
Apocalypse. , His strength growth rate, I must not remind you.” Yi Lao said.

He Qingfeng was shocked, how terrifying George Han’s strength growth was. He
was naturally very clear, because he was playing against George Han and was
forced to retreat by George Han. God knows how strong George Han will become
again this time in the second world.

But He Qingfeng still believes. He Xiaoxiao would not do this kind of thing. In He
Qingfeng’s eyes, naughty and vicious were completely different things, and He
Xiaoxiao was just a bit naughty.



“Following the trouble, I know how to deal with my own affairs.” He Qingfeng
said.

Yi Lao shook his head helplessly, and it seemed that he had spoken thoroughly. He
Qingfeng would realize what kind of woman He Xiaoxiao is. Otherwise, he really
thinks He Xiaoxiao is innocent.

“As far as I know, He Xiaoxiao has secretly sent someone to leave Tianqi. As far as
whereabouts, but she sent someone to leave for no reason. Compared with where
she went, I don’t need to say more.” Yi Lao said.

“Yilao, is it too much for you to slander a little girl so much?” He Qingfeng looked
at Yi Lao angrily.

“If it’s slander, you can check it out for yourself. Can you not do this little thing? If
you don’t do it, then I can only solve the matter by myself.” After speaking, Yi Lao
turned and left. Having said so much, it’s almost time to accept it, as for what He
Qingfeng would do. It’s not what he can manage.

He Qingfeng saw that Yi Lao was not joking, and he didn’t want to slander He
Xiaoxiao in this way, so he ran towards the yellow character level.

If He Xiaoxiao really did this kind of thing, he had to stop it immediately,
otherwise he would regret it once he made a big mistake.

Although He Qingfeng is the lord of the Three Halls, his identity is not worth
mentioning in the face of strength. How strong George Han will become in the
future is impossible to predict. If Amelia Su and Han Nian are really injured
because of He Xiaoxiao It’s death, George Han’s anger, I’m afraid it will burn the
entire Apocalypse!

The entrance to the second world was calm, George Han and Jiang Yingying took a
leap, as if nothing happened.



At this time, George Han was in the space tunnel, feeling that the pressure around
him was about to shatter his body, not knowing how long it took. The moment the
pressure dissipated, he fainted.

When George Han woke up again, he found that he was actually wearing a red
robe, which was particularly festive. The surrounding environment gave him a very
old-fashioned and simple feeling, as if he had suddenly traveled back to ancient
times.

There was a floor-to-ceiling bronze mirror in the southeast corner of the room,
when George Han walked to the bronze mirror. I realized that what I was wearing
seemed to be a wedding suit!

George Han had no idea what was going on. He was about to ask someone to ask
when the door was pushed open. A cold-eyed woman walked in with a phoenix
crown on her head.

When the woman saw George Han, a trace of surprise flashed across her face, and
she was full of anger.

“You woke up!” The woman gritted her teeth and said to George Han, full of anger,
as if she had seen killing her father and enemy.

George Han didn’t know, so he knew that he had safely entered the second world.
But why did he appear here, why he was wearing a red robe, and who this woman
was, George Han didn’t know anything.

“Who are you.” George Han asked.

The woman said nothing. Walking to George Han, a loud slap slapped George
Han’s face.



This made George Han even more confused by Zhang Er’s monk. The hatred in
this woman’s eyes was extremely strong, which made George Han wonder if he
had done something to apologize to her. Didn’t you even notice it?
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“What I want is just a rubbish, why do you wake up at this time.” Seeing the
woman’s appearance, she almost broke her teeth, and George Han waking up
seemed very unacceptable to her.

When she raised her hand again, George Han reached out and pinched her wrist
directly.

George Han is not a person who beats and scolds, and now he doesn’t understand
what the situation is, how can he be humiliated by a woman like this.

Even if she was very beautiful, George Han would never let her do whatever she
wanted.

“Where am I. Why do you wear this suit and who are you?” George Han asked.

The woman wanted to break free, but she was surprised to find that the man in
front of her was extremely powerful, which made a flash of light in her eyes.

“I order you to stay in the room. You are not allowed to go anywhere, otherwise, I
will do everything possible to kill you.” The woman said to George Han in a
commanding tone.

“Okay, I can go nowhere, but I have to know what’s going on.” George Han said.

“Let go of me, I will let someone explain what is going on, and I will let you know
what you should do in the future.” The woman said.



George Han released her hand, and the woman turned away without hesitation.

Looking at himself in the bronze mirror, George Han had an inexplicable and
inexplicable premonition. This dress was like getting married, but he felt unlikely.
How could it be possible to be taken to a wedding after coming to the second
world?

And he had been in a coma before. How could the woman just marry him?

All the doubts in George Han’s mind turned into a mass of paste, but soon, the door
was pushed open again, and a simple-dressed figure who looked like a maid
walked in.

“The young lady asked me to come, you can ask me if you want to ask.” The maid
said to George Han.

Based on the costumes of the two, George Han guessed that this second world is
likely to be an ancient civilization. This made George Han feel a little eager to see
what the outside world is like.

However, George Han would not leave easily without knowing the current
situation. After all, he was not familiar with the world. Once he walked around and
revealed his flaws, it was a very dangerous thing for him.

“How long have I been in a coma?” George Han asked his first question.

“Three months.” The maid said.

“What!” George Han said in astonishment. He was in a coma for three months.
How could it be possible for him. This time is like a day has just passed!

“Miss thought you would be in a coma for a lifetime and never wake up again.”
said the maid.



George Han took a deep breath and calmed his mood. Continue to ask: “Why do I
wear this suit.”

“Because today is the day when you and Miss get married.” The maid explained.

George Han’s mind was blank.

The day of marriage!

The guess just now turned out to be true!

But there is one thing that makes George Han puzzled. That woman, why would
she marry a comatose person? Is it possible that she is crazy?

“You just said that your lady thought I would never wake up in this life. In that
case, why did she marry me?” George Han asked in confusion.

“Miss doesn’t want to marry someone who doesn’t like, so she would rather find
trash like you.” said the maid.

This bizarre idea subverted George Han’s three views. But he did understand what
the maid meant. It seemed that the woman just used him as a shield. As for why
she did this, the reason is simple. It is probably that her family wants her to marry
someone, but she herself does not. willing. That’s why this ridiculous thing was
staged.

Suddenly, George Han held his head and made a painful look.

“It hurts. My head hurts.”

The maid did not panic, because when George Han woke up, her lady hoped that
George Han would die. The pain he showed now did not require her to care.



“I don’t remember anything, can you tell me where I am and where did you find
me.” George Han asked.

“This is the mansion of the Chen family in Longyun City.” The maid was ordered
by the young lady to explain George Han’s confusion. At this point, she was still
very competent, and she would answer George Han’s questions no matter what.

“You were found in the south of Longyun City. I heard that you were in disarray at
the time without clothing.”

“Anyone besides me?” George Han continued to ask.

“No,” said the maid.

No one else!

Where did Jiang Yingying go? Could it be that it was in a space tunnel? After the
two separated, their positions in the second world were different.

This makes George Han a little worried, Jiang Yingying is a girl after all. I don’t
know how she is now.

“Do you have any other questions?” the maid asked.

“No, I want to take a break.” George Han said.

The maid nodded and left the room.

George Han’s headache was pretended. So as soon as the maid left, he returned to
normal.



It’s a pity that George Han still has too little information. If you want to know
more about this world, you will have to do so in the future.

Marriage is absurd to George Han, but in some respects, it is also a good thing. At
least he now has an identity cover, so that he won’t be easily discovered that he
doesn’t belong here.

“I never dreamed that I would be able to receive the second marriage in this life.
Amelia, I didn’t do anything to be sorry for you. I just woke up and it was already
like this. The situation is beyond my control.” George Han sighed. Talk to yourself.

After the maid left, she walked into another room.

Chen Yanran had taken off the phoenix crown on her head, and her expression was
still very angry. It was obvious that George Han’s sobriety was something she
could not accept.

“How about, what did he ask?” Chen Yanran asked the maid.

“Miss, he doesn’t seem to remember anything, and asked some very common
questions, where is he and why he married you.” The maid said.

Chen Yanran sneered and said: “I thought that finding a waste that has been in a
coma would solve my troubles. I didn’t expect that he would wake up at this time. I
have to find a way to kill him, his kind of rubbish. , How can I be worthy of being
my husband.”

“Miss, he just got married with you. Didn’t you fail him by killing him?” The maid
worried.

Chen Yanran smiled faintly, and said: “How can I fail? He is my husband. It is
natural for me to keep the spirit for him for three years. It is worthwhile to
exchange a wasteful life for me for three years of worry-free.”



“Miss, what are you going to do?” the maid asked.

“Long Cloud City’s annual beast hunting conference is about to begin, and I will
let him die for granted.” Chen Yanran said coldly.

Chapter 856

George Han was locked in the room. Although a wooden door could not stop his
violence, George Han did not dare to do it lightly. After all, he knew nothing about
what happened outside the door, and after kicking it open George Han couldn’t
predict what kind of consequences it would cause.

Although this feeling of being imprisoned is very uncomfortable, for George Han,
he must be extremely careful with every step he takes now, once he loses his life
here. George Han never saw Amelia Su and Han Nian again.

As it got late and night fell, George Han, who was lying on the bed, finally heard
footsteps outside the door.

It was the maid who brought food to George Han.

The food was delicious, but the maid stood by and said nothing. Let George Han
feel like he is being watched.

“I’ve been in a coma for so long, are you taking care of me?” George Han asked
the maid.

“Miss’s request, people just do it right now, so you don’t have to thank me.” The
maid’s tone did not carry any emotion, giving George Han a mechanical feeling.

“I’m very curious, what did I eat during the time I was in a coma?” George Han
looked at the maid in doubt. When he woke up today, he didn’t feel any hunger.



“fluid food.”

George Han nodded and continued to ask: “Who is your lady? The Chen family is
in Longyun City, is it a big family?”

“There are three big families in Longyun City. The Chen family is one of them,
and it is naturally a big family.” The maid said, the reason why she was willing to
answer George Han’s question was also Chen Yanran’s instruction. Otherwise, she
could not Talk to George Han.

George Han smiled faintly. He didn’t expect to come to the second world, so lucky
to “marry” into a big family, it seems that this life is destined to miss the poor
character.

“The reason why your lady got married with me, can you tell me more about it?”
George Han continued to ask. Having discussed this issue briefly before, George
Han only made some general guesses. Whether it is accurate or not depends on the
answer this maid gave him.

“Because the city lord’s son wants to marry my lady, but my lady is unwilling, so
you become my lady’s means to deal with outsiders.” The maid said.

“Her family members, didn’t they refuse? After all, in her eyes, I am just a
vegetable who can never wake up.” George Han said.

The maid frowned slightly and said, “What is a vegetative?”

George Han was shocked, such words should be unfamiliar to the second world.
When he speaks, he must pay attention to this matter, otherwise it is easy to be
noticed that he does not belong here.

“It’s nothing. I just talked about it casually, probably the person who is always
sleeping.” George Han said.



The maid thought of plants, and then compared people to plants. It suddenly
dawned on her that she felt that this term could not be used to describe the state of
George Han before.

“This is the decision made by the lady after discussing with her family, naturally
no one will refuse.” The maid said.

George Han wondered if this big family was crazy. Using the innocence of my
daughter’s life to reject the son of the lord of a city, is it possible that the son of the
lord of the city is ugly and earth-shattering?

“Your daughter is married to the city lord’s son. Isn’t it better to improve the Chen
family’s position in Longyun City, why is she not willing?” George Han asked in
confusion.

A hint of impatience flashed across the maid’s face and said: “Please hurry up with
your meal. After the meal, someone will come to shower and change your clothes.”

Dedicated!

Bathing and changing clothes.

George Han couldn’t help smelling his body, only then suddenly realized a
problem, and was in a coma for such a long time. It stands to reason that he had a
peculiar smell, but he smelled bursts of fragrance!

“When I was in a coma, someone helped me take a bath every day?” George Han
asked.

“Not bad.”

George Han lowered his head feebly. In this way, wouldn’t he have been seen by
those subordinates long ago!



After a while, some maidservants brought hot water in succession. Although all of
them were good-looking and clever, George Han still couldn’t imagine their hands
touching him. The bargain The subordinates took it, although it was not considered
to be unfaithful to Amelia Su, but it was still uncomfortable to see this secret of
privacy.

“You go out, I’ll do it myself, don’t bother you.” George Han said to several maids,
there was no choice when he was in a coma before. But now, George Han will
never allow these people to do anything to himself.

Several maids were not obedient, and stayed motionless.

George Han was slightly angry. Said: “I don’t need your help, go quickly.”

“You go first.” Chen Yanran’s appearance resolved the problem for George Han.

She gave George Han an amazing feeling at first glance. Even if it was the second
time I saw it, I had changed into a normal outfit, it would still make George Han
feel very beautiful. This is a big beauty who is alive and well, but this makes
George Han wonder why she is unwilling to marry the daughter of the city lord.

“What’s your name?” Chen Yanran asked George Han.

“The last name is George Han, how about you?” George Han said.

“Chen Yanran.”

“A nice name.”

“I heard someone say that you don’t remember anything.” Chen Yanran asked.



“It’s a blank. If you are willing to help, you can find a famous doctor to treat me. I
heard the maid said that the Chen family is very good in Longyun City. This little
thing shouldn’t be difficult for you.” George Han said.

Chen Yanran sneered in her heart. In her eyes, George Han was just a dying person,
how could she find a doctor for George Han.

“Starting from tomorrow. You can walk around and take a look. After half a month,
there will be a hunting convention in Longyun City. You have to participate with
me.” Chen Yanran said.

“Beast hunting conference, what do you mean?” George Han asked puzzledly.

“Literally, nothing else, I won’t bother you.” After speaking, Chen Yanran turned
around and left without giving George Han a chance to ask.

George Han could feel that Chen Yanran, the woman’s face under the frost, was
even more of an iceberg. She must be a strong woman. The reason for not marrying
the city lord’s son probably had some purpose.

It’s a pity that the information that George Han currently controls is too little to
judge what Chen Yanran wants to do.

But tomorrow he will be able to leave this imprisoned room, which is a good thing.
If you understand Long Basin City as soon as possible, you can also understand
what kind of person Chen Yanran is.

After taking a shower, George Han lay on the bed, enjoying the exceptionally
bright moonlight through the window. He didn’t know if the moon and the earth
were the same here.

Chapter 857



The next day, George Han noticed that his arm was slightly cold as soon as he
opened his eyes. When he opened his eyes, Xiao Bai Snake had returned to his arm
for some time.

After George Han woke up yesterday, he looked for it everywhere, but there was
no trace at all. I thought it had returned to his own world and had left. I didn’t
expect it to have left yet. I was probably afraid of being discovered. That’s why I
hid temporarily.

“Little thing, I didn’t expect you to be very affectionate, and you didn’t even
leave.” George Han said with a smile.

Little White Snake vomited a red letter to George Han, and he didn’t know whether
he was expressing his loyalty or deliberately intimidating George Han.

George Han got up while getting dressed and opened the door.

Take a deep breath. Involuntarily said: “The air here is really good. If there is a
chance in the future, it is also a good choice to bring Amelia Nian’er here to care
for the elderly.”

After saying this, George Han couldn’t help but think of what Amelia Su had said,
to find a polygamous country, this world is probably like this.

The Chen family’s courtyard is very large, several times larger than the total area
of ​​the Han family’s compound in Hillwood City, but this is not unusual. After all, it
is one of the three major families in Longyun City. It’s just handwriting. Moreover,
the value of the location in this world is not comparable to that of the earth.

Had it not been for the guidance of his servants, George Han had almost lost his
way in the yard. After spending a lot of effort, George Han finally walked onto the
street.



The streets are as George Han imagined, full of ancient flavors, and people’s
costumes are not even modern, just like being in an ancient movie.

“If you can drive a Ferrari on this street, I don’t know what kind of scene it is.”
George Han couldn’t help but laugh when he thought of this.

The best place to learn about Longyun City and Chen’s family is the teahouse, so
George Han quickly determined his destination.

A teahouse called Weijuju. The flow of people is the most, but the name of this
restaurant is really strange to George Han.

After entering the teahouse, there was a shopkeeper who greeted George Han to sit
down, and all the nearby tea customers whispered to discuss the recent uproar of
Chen Yanran’s marriage.

“I don’t know who the eldest Chen family is married to. She has never shown up in
Longyun City. I heard that he is a fool.”

“What a fool, I obviously heard that he is a lame.”

“Your news is really unclear, I heard from the underlings of the Chen family. That
person is disabled without hands.”

Hearing these words, George Han couldn’t help touching his head, then looked at
his legs and feet. I don’t know where these rumors are coming from, but they have
turned him into a complete rumor.

George Han approached the group of discussants and said, “I heard that the man
was in a coma for a long time and has not been awake. I don’t know Miss Chen Jia.
Why would he marry such a man.”



Several people took a look at George Han, and they did not reject his new strange
face, and soon started chatting.

“I heard the gossip. Chen Yanran did this because she wanted the city lord to break
completely.”

“Huang Xiaoyong has liked Chen Yanran for many years. This is a well-known
thing in Longyun City. Late last night, the city lord’s mansion pulled out more than
a dozen corpses. I heard that it was because of Huang Xiaoyong’s anger. Those
servants are really pitiful.”

Hearing these words, George Han couldn’t help frowning. The city lord should be
the person with the highest status in Longyun City. How could Chen Yanran break
with the city lord?

“When Chen Yanran did this, wouldn’t he be afraid that the anger of the city lord
might affect the Chen family?” George Han asked in confusion.

“Little brother, you just arrived in Longyun City not long ago.” Someone looked at
George Han with a smile, as if he said that was strange.

“Yes, brother, I just arrived in Longyun City, and I would like to ask some elder
brothers to clarify. Today’s bad money, the younger brother will come.” George
Han said.

Hearing that George Han wanted to buy tea money, all of them were happy. They
didn’t hide it, and explained it to George Han clearly.

From their mouths, George Han learned that the City Lord of Longyun City is not
the supreme existence. Although he was the city owner, he still had to be
controlled by the three major families because of the construction and maintenance
of Longyun City. These three families were responsible for the expenses, and the
reason why the city lord was able to take the position back then was also strongly



supported by these three families. In other words, this city lord is actually just a
puppet.

And now, this puppet is probably no longer willing to be ordered by the three
major families. Therefore, as a bird in the early days, the Chen family had torn the
face with the city lord, and heard from them that the Chen family deliberately
wanted to seize the seat of the city lord, it is no wonder that Chen Yanran would
stand against the city lord so unscrupulously.

But so far, among the three major families. Only the Chen family has completely
expressed its attitude, and the other two big families have not had any
performance, which makes George Han a little strange.

Since it was the three major families that together promoted the lord of the city.
This turn of the face, it should be the three families together, why did the Chen
family alone express its attitude?

There must be reasons why these tea customers don’t know. It is even possible that
Chen Yanran was put together by the other two big families, and it was not
impossible for them to take this opportunity to get rid of the Chen family.

“Little brother, what you want to know, we have already said almost, this tea
money…”

“Don’t worry, the tea money comes from the younger brother.” George Han
smiled.

“In this case, thank you little brother for his hospitality, and I will leave first.”

Several people clasped their fists and left, George Han combed through the
information he had just received.



The current situation of the Chen family may be that the other two families dug a
hole for the Chen family and want to join hands with the city lord to remove the
Chen family.

There is also a possibility that the Chen family wants to be better than Basin City,
and simply doesn’t care about the attitude of the other two families.

But the possibility of the latter is relatively small. After all, the three major families
are standing on top of each other, and the Chen family’s ability is probably not
enough to deal with these three forces.

“Receive money.” George Han came out almost in time today, and couldn’t eat fat
in one breath, so he planned to go back first and learn about the hunting conference
tomorrow morning.

However, when Xiao Er walked in front of George Han, George Han drew it out
again, but he couldn’t get out a penny.

Not only was there no money, George Han didn’t even know what money in this
world looked like.

“Boss, someone wants to drink Bawang tea.” Xiao Er looked at George Han warily
and shouted.

It is estimated that the store often meets people like George Han, so he was
prepared, and after a while, a few strong men holding wooden sticks surrounded
George Han.

“Dare to drink Bawang tea at my tail beast, boy, don’t you know how to write dead
words.” The boss was a middle-aged man and threatened George Han in a cold
voice.
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George Han looked bitter. Before he went out, he had never thought about this,
because he never lacked money on the earth, and he would never take money into
his heart. He never expected it to happen. This embarrassing thing appeared.

“Boss, listen to me. I don’t have money, but I didn’t bring it.” George Han said.

Middle-aged people have come across all kinds of excuses. He didn’t believe what
George Han said, and immediately let his subordinates beat George Han violently.

Although George Han is not afraid of these people in front of him, once the
movement becomes big, it will be difficult to keep a low profile in the future.

“I belong to the Chen family. If you don’t believe the boss, you can come home
with me. I promise to give you the money, and I will give you twice.” George Han
said.

“A member of the Chen family?” The boss looked at George Han up and down.
The material of this guy’s clothes really didn’t look like a poor man. Good silk
fabrics were not affordable for ordinary families.

“Who are you from the Chen family?” the boss asked.

George Han was embarrassed. These people would definitely not believe that he
was Chen Yanran’s husband. After all, it was rumored that he was still a fool with a
lame and severed hand.

“I am a relative of the Chen family, and you will understand when you walk with
me.” George Han said.

“Go, report to the Chen family, saying that his Chen family won’t pay for tea in my
tail beast house. Let them pay quickly.” The boss ordered his opponent.



George Han breathed a sigh of relief, as long as someone from the Chen family
came, this matter could be resolved.

“Boss, the name of your teahouse is interesting. Why is it called Weijuju?” George
Han chatted with the boss.

Speaking of this incident, the boss showed a proud look on his face, and said:
“Boy, I am afraid to scare you. The reason why my teahouse is called Tail Beast
House is because I once killed a tail beast with my bare hands. , This matter is well
known in Longyun City.”

Next, the boss talked about his fight with the tail beast. He seems to have told this
story many times, using words and words, and the story is connected smoothly.

The tail beast in his mouth should be a certain species of the alien beast in this
world, and from his words, George Han perceives that the alien beast is
conquerable in this world, and many people regard it as conquering the alien beast.
proud.

“It’s a pity that the beast doesn’t want to be tamed to me. I can only kill it with my
own hands. Otherwise, I won’t be just the teahouse owner now.” The boss said
with regret. In fact, he was just lucky enough to find a tail beast, so he compiled a
thrilling story and named the tail beast house.

“What if you tame the tail beast?” George Han asked.

The boss looked at George Han with strange eyes, what would happen if the tail
beast was tamed. The entire Xuanyuan world knows this question, how could he
ask such a stupid question?

“Boy, you deliberately made me happy.” The boss looked at George Han angrily.



George Han knew that he had asked the wrong thing. This is probably something
that everyone should know, so his ignorance can give the boss this illusion.

Just as George Han was thinking about the wording and preparing to explain, one
person walked into the teahouse, which made George Han look confused.

In George Han’s opinion, the Chen family should send someone to help him solve
this problem. But he never expected that Chen Yanran would show up in person!

“Chen, Miss Chen!” The boss was shocked when she saw Chen Yanran.

“Are you the boss here?” Chen Yanran asked the boss.

The boss nodded like garlic. Seeing Chen Yanran, he was obviously very nervous.

“This is my husband. He forgot to bring money when he went out today. I’m really
embarrassed.” Chen Yanran nodded slightly, obviously apologizing.

As soon as this sentence came out, the whole teahouse looked at George Han with
amazement.

Now the entire Dragon Cloud City is discussing who Chen Yanran’s husband is,
but he didn’t expect him to appear in this way.

It’s not the legendary lame and broken hand, nor is it a fool!

George Han himself also had a dumb face, never expected that Chen Yanran would
expose his identity in the public.

Didn’t she still say yesterday that he shouldn’t leave easily, the woman’s mind
turned so fast?



“Miss Chen. It turns out that he is your husband. I knew this a long time ago. What
does this tea money count.” The boss wiped a cold sweat secretly. The Chen
family’s power in Longyun City was definitely not something that a small teahouse
owner could offend.

“In this case, thank you boss.” Chen Yanran glanced at George Han.

George Han consciously walked to Chen Yanran’s side. The two left the teahouse
together.

“Unexpectedly, this is Chen Yanran’s husband. It seems that there is no such
unbearable rumors.”

“The two of them stood together. There really is a feeling of a talented girl. I have
to say that compared with him, Huang Xiaoyong does have a lot of gaps.”

“What’s the use of looking better than Huang Xiaoyong? A man must pay attention
to his ability. His white face is not enough for Huang Xiaoyong to fight with one
hand. Look, if Huang Xiaoyong knew about this. It’s good.”

The incident of Chen Yanran’s husband’s appearance spread throughout Longyun
City in less than half a day.

On the way back to the Chen family mansion, George Han asked Chen Yanran
puzzledly: “Why are you doing this?”

“You are my husband. This is a fact, I just tell everyone, why do I need it?” Chen
Yanran said lightly.

“The Chen family is opposed to the City Lord’s Mansion, and Huang Xiaoyong
must hate me deeply. Do you want Huang Xiaoyong to kill me?” George Han
guessed.



“He doesn’t dare, otherwise, marriage will not go smoothly.” Chen Yanran said.

George Han frowned. If Huang Xiaoyong had the courage to kill him, he would
have come to rob his relatives. Thinking about it this way, it does make sense.

But George Han can be sure that Chen Yanran must have an untold secret in doing
so.

“Although Huang Xiaoyong didn’t dare to kill me, you really want me to die,
right?” George Han continued.

“We are married. This is an irreversible fact. Why would I want you to die.” Chen
Yanran said.

This woman gave George Han the feeling that she was an extremely deep snake
and scorpion in the heart of the city. Her body seemed to be covered with a layer of
fog, which made people unable to see the reality.

“Beast hunting conference, what are your intentions?” George Han asked
unwillingly, Chen Yanran must have planned this matter, otherwise, he would not
be allowed to participate in it.

“Tame a strange beast, and you can get the attention of the imperial court. This is
an adventure everyone hopes to have. Dragon Cloud City is just a small town in
Xuanyuan World. People with aspirations will not stay in this small town forever.
Place.” Chen Yanran was also generous. Whatever George Han asked, she
answered whatever.
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Chen Yanran’s words exposed her ambition very directly. From her tone, George
Han felt unwilling. It seemed that just staying in a small place like Longyun City
would not satisfy Chen Yanran.



This also means that Chen Yanran may really want to seize the seat of the city lord.
And this is just her first step.

Compared with Amelia Su, the two of them are completely extreme. Amelia Su’s
character is indisputable, and she never cares about status and rights in the Su
family. If it is not forced to go nowhere, Amelia Su will never turn her face with
the Su family.

arrive home. Chen Yanran gave George Han a book with the word “Shanhe”
printed on the cover.

“What is this?” George Han asked puzzledly.

“Since you don’t remember anything, this book can give you a better
understanding of Xuanyuan World.” After leaving the book. Chen Yanran left,
facing the husband of George Han, it can be said that there is no feeling of
nostalgia.

George Han went back to his room and read the book. The most important thing he
needs to do now is to understand the world of Xuanyuan. The opportunity is now,
so naturally he will not miss it.

“Miss, why do you want to do more with him?” The maid asked Chen Yanran.
Since Chen Yanran wanted to kill George Han, then he would die sooner or later,
so why bother to understand Xuanyuan World.

“Just treat him as the last pity.” Chen Yanran said lightly.

The maid grew up with Chen Yanran. She knew very well that everything that the
young lady did was planned, and it was absolutely impossible for him to
understand Xuanyuan World because she had pity for George Han.



But since Chen Yanran didn’t want to say it, the maid didn’t dare to ask too much.
After all, the two of them were masters and servants, what Chen Yanran had to do.
She is not qualified to intervene.

George Han was completely immersed in the book of Shanhe in his room, which
was like a very magical mythical story, recording all kinds of magical aspects of
Xuanyuan World.

Xuanyuan World has a certain cultivation system. The mountains and rivers have
not explained it in detail. Perhaps the author does not know the mystery. He just
wrote very plainly that the realm ranges from one to nine lights. Nine lights are the
strongest. As for the meaning of lights, It is not mentioned in the book, and there is
a top level master above Jiu Deng, known as Ji Shane. The entire Xuanyuan world
has no more than ten masters. The book describes that Ji master has a knight to
break a thousand army. Horror capacity.

In addition, there is another kind of human status in Xuanyuan World. It is the
talent that various countries compete for, that is, the master of beasts, which is the
ability to tame alien beasts that Chen Yanran mentioned before. People with this
ability are generally extraordinary in status, and even have the same status as the
master.

Once a new beastmaster appears, all countries will inevitably compete for huge
resources.

Seeing this, George Han couldn’t help but glanced at the little white snake on his
arm. He didn’t know if he was considered a beastmaster now, and was worthy of
competition from all countries.

Continuing to read, the mountains and rivers also recorded the situation of the
Three Kingdoms of Xuanyuan World, and the Dragon Cloud City where George
Han was located was under the Imperial Court. In addition to the imperial court,
there are Xia Guo and Chongye.



Regarding the description of Xia Guo, only the word magic is mentioned in the
book. As for how amazing it was but didn’t write it down, this made George Han a
great curiosity.

The situation of Chongye can be felt from the text. The book records that the
barbarians of Chongye are rampant, eating raw meat and drinking blood.

Looking at the whole mountain and river, George Han didn’t spend too much time,
but he had a deep understanding of Xuanyuan World.

At this moment. The maid pushed the door in, still with that emotionless face, and
said to George Han: “You’d better not go out these days.”

“Why?” George Han asked uncomprehendingly. Chen Yanran said before that he
could go out for a walk if he had nothing to do. It was only one day, so he was put
under house arrest again?

“This is for your own good. Huang Xiaoyong sent many people nearby. Once you
leave the Chen family mansion, he will never let you go.” The maid explained.

George Han suddenly realized, and said: “It just so happens that I have nothing to
do these days, so just stay at home.”

A hint of contempt flashed in the maid’s eyes, and she looked down on George
Han for being not a man at all.

George Han can feel the maid’s contempt, but it doesn’t matter to him. After all,
the other party is the son of the city lord. There is no need to argue with him at this
time. George Han has to keep a low profile when he has no background. Row.

“You behaved like this. It’s better to be in a coma forever.” After leaving this
sentence, the maid turned and left the room.



George Han stood up and stretched. He said to himself: “I’m afraid I would
accidentally kill Huang Xiaoyong when I went out. What do you as a maid know.”

Although George Han didn’t know what his realm was like now, it was such a
small city. There shouldn’t be a master who is too powerful, maybe his current
strength can crush everyone in Longyun City. It’s just that his current situation
does not need to be too high-profile.

Even if he doesn’t go out, George Han won’t be bored, because the Chen family
mansion is really too big and there is enough place for him to entertain.

There are countless koi carps in a pond in the backyard, and George Han makes a
fishing rod and hook to pass the time by fishing.

Those servants didn’t understand what George Han was doing at first, but when
they saw George Han Zhongyu, they couldn’t help but crane their necks to wait
and see. It seemed that they had never seen fishing.

After losing interest in fishing, George Han fiddled with new things, and just like
that, a week passed quickly, and the hunting convention in Longyun City was
slowly approaching.

On this day, George Han had just gotten up and was about to go to the backyard
pond to have another hand addiction. Chen Yanran’s personal maid ran to George
Han in a panic expression.

“The sky has fallen?” George Han asked jokingly.

The maid looked pale, and asked George Han: “You are the lady’s husband, the
lady is in trouble, you have to save her.”



George Han said without even thinking about it: “I and her are just a nominal
couple, and have no actual relationship, and she shouldn’t want me to intervene in
her affairs.”

“You’re still not a man. Miss is in big trouble now, do you want to stand by?” The
maid said anxiously.

George Han’s expression was still indifferent, he wouldn’t really treat Chen Yanran
as his wife, so if Chen Yanran was in trouble, it wouldn’t be something he should
care about.

“If I am a man, you probably haven’t experienced it, but you don’t need to
experience it. If there is nothing else, you can help your lady think of other ways.
Don’t delay my fishing.” George Han finished. To go.

The maid stepped in front of George Han and said, “You have to go, you must go.”

Chapter 860

George Han’s face instantly became cold.

This maid is making troubles unreasonably. She knows the relationship between
Chen Yanran and herself better than anyone, but at this time, she has to come
forward to solve the trouble for Chen Yanran.

“Your lady probably didn’t know you came to me.” George Han said coldly.

The maid’s complexion changed, Chen Yanran did not know about this, but she
made her own claims.

Seeing the maid’s expression, George Han knew that he had guessed correctly, and
continued: “Let me guess again. Chen Yanran’s trouble should come from the other
two families, right?”



“How do you know!” The maid was shocked. She didn’t tell George Han what
happened. How could George Han know?

George Han smiled lightly, how did he know? This is something that can be
guessed without thinking about it. What is the difficulty.

Chen Yanran is very ambitious. At this time, she is likely to fall into the trap of the
other two families.

Who will be the lord of the city? After all, it was just a puppet. Even if this puppet
is a bit disobedient now, it is not too threatening, and the Chen family. But it is a
real opponent. It is not difficult for the two big families to take this opportunity to
eradicate the Chen family.

Even from the beginning of the whole thing, the goal of the other two families was
not to be the city lord, but to overthrow the Chen family.

“I am extremely smart, of course I know, but I believe that your lady will definitely
have the means to cope with it. Why do you need my help.” George Han said.

The maid shook her head and said: “This time is different. They brought four
masters, and the Chen family does not have such masters. I am worried that they
will hurt Miss.”

Four lights master?

Although George Han doesn’t know how strong the four-lamp master is, it is only
in the middle and lower reaches of the strength. The Chen family is so big, there is
not even a four-lamp master?

In fact, this situation is not difficult to understand. After all, Longyun City is a
small place. How can a truly capable expert be willing to stay here, so the Four
Lights is already a very rare powerhouse for Longyun City.



“Look at me.” George Han said.

The maid didn’t understand what these words meant. But he still looked at George
Han up and down, and then said, “After reading it, so what?”

George Han couldn’t help rolling his eyes, and said, “I have small arms and thin
legs, have you ever beaten a four-lamp master? It’s useless for you to find me.”

The maid’s face is as gray as death, and the trash in front of her is indeed
impossible to be the opponent of the four-lamp master. It may be useless to find
him, but Chen’s parents are not in Longyun City now. Only Chen Yanran is facing
it alone. Don’t worry.

“Even if you die, you must protect the lady.” The maid said.

George Han sneered, his life is in the eyes of the maid, is it so worthless?

“My life is much more important than her. I don’t want to do things like dying. You
should leave now.” George Han said.

“If Miss has an accident, you will die too. The Chen family will not let you go.
Huang Xiaoyong will not let you go.” In desperation, the maid rushed to the
doctor, she could only try every means to threaten George Han. thousand.

These words made George Han stop. It is the same reason that thinks about it. He
can stay in Chen’s house safely now because he is Chen Yanran’s husband. If Chen
Yanran really has an accident, he will end up best. He had to be kicked out of the
Chen family, and Huang Xiaoyong might have been waiting for him for a long
time.

For George Han’s current situation, this kind of thing is extremely unfavorable. He
wants to use the Chen family as a cover to gain a deeper understanding of the
Xuanyuan world, and this place can avoid many disputes.



“Look at you, what can you say? Why do you have to threaten me? Let’s lead the
way.” George Han said.

“You…” The maid was so angry that she couldn’t speak. Such a brazen person was
the only one she had ever seen. Didn’t she talk to George Han well when she first
came?

In front of the Chen family, Chen Yanran was sitting on the main seat, facing the
other two heads of the clan. Although on the surface he was not inferior to the two
old foxes, because of the four-lamp master standing behind them, Chen Yanran
would be a little less confident after all.

This was something Chen Yanran hadn’t expected, they were able to find a master
of four lights!

George Han broke in suddenly. It broke the solemn atmosphere of the front hall.

I saw George Han smiling hippiely and said: “It’s so lively, what is this for?”

Chen Yanran frowned slightly, how come George Han came!

After taking a look at the maid, she lowered her head with a guilty conscience, and
Chen Yanran understood.

“Who are you?” one of the clan chiefs asked George Han sharply.

“Introduce myself, my name is George Han, Chen Yanran’s husband.” George Han
said with a smile.

The man almost laughed, some time ago. George Han couldn’t even get out the tea
money, but it spread throughout Longyun City and caused countless people to
laugh. I didn’t expect to see it today. It was a waste.



“Chen Yanran, your vision is really good. When you find such a trash, he can’t
touch you, but he can stop everyone from talking, so Huang Xiaoyong has no
chance. It really is Miss Chen family.” The man laughed. Said.

Chen Yanran looked embarrassed. Although she agreed that George Han was a
trash from the bottom of her heart, the taste of such words from outsiders was
completely different, and she would be ashamed.

“George Han, what are you doing here. There is nothing for you here, so hurry up.”
Chen Yanran said to George Han in a commanding tone.

George Han thought this place was not what I wanted to come to, if it weren’t for
fear of your death, the Chen family’s umbrella was missing. How can I be nosy.

“Lady, your business is my business. How can I say that it has nothing to do with
me? I can’t just watch you being bullied, and I heard that a four-lamp master came
today, and I want to see it too. “George Han said.

The middle-aged man standing behind the two heads of the family just after the
words fell. A palm smashed the wooden table beside him, and it was shattered, the
visual effect was extremely shocking, and Chen Yanran’s expression changed
dramatically.

“Now you have seen it. If you are interested, get out.” The middle-aged man said
to George Han.

George Han looked shocked on the surface, but he was very disdainful in his heart.
Even with this little trick, he could do it easily.

“Awesome, the four-lamp master is really amazing.” George Han clapped his hands
and said.



Seeing the appearance of George Han who had never seen the world, the two heads
of the clan smiled even more brazenly.

“Chen Yanran, I have to admire your vision.”

“Miss Chen’s move is really a blunder. Although this kind of trash prevents you
from being harassed by Huang Xiaoyong, it will make you a joke.”


