
When His Eyes Opened Read Novel  Chapter 3129  

Novel  Chapter 3129 -Niko: “You came to Thopiavelle for Lucas, right?” 

Hazel: “Not exactly. Even if Lucas is not here, I will come and have a look.” 

Niko nodded: “I have known him for so many years, and I only heard him 
mention a woman.” 

Hazel raised her eyebrows slightly: “Who is it?” 

Niko: “He had a nanny before. But that nanny died. During the Ching Ming 
Festival, he took me with him and burned paper for that nanny.” 

Hazel: “……” 

Niko: “That time he drank, so he was a little emotional. Then he sobered up 
and didn’t remember it.” 

Hazel murmured: “So he burned paper for me…” 

Niko: “What are you talking about?” 

Hazel shook her head again and again, and said with a smile: “It’s all right! I 
don’t think Lucas is like the kind of superstitious person. How could he burn 
paper to the dead?” 

Niko: “Hahaha! He drank too much that day. When I helped him home, I saw 
someone burning paper on the side of the road. He couldn’t walk after seeing 
it. So we went to buy paper and burned it on the side of the road. I asked him 
who he burned it for, and he said his former nanny.” 

Hazel: “Oh…he’s really nice, even burned paper for his nanny.” 

Niko: “Anyway, I’ve known him for so long, and I’ve never heard him mention 
other opposite s*xes. He may not be attracted to Miss Yoder. Miss Yoder is 
too mature.” 

Hazel: “Don’t most young guys like mature women?” 

Niko: “Not all young men like mature women! Although I prefer mature 
women, maybe Lucas likes you.” 



Hazel blushed slightly: “What type am I?” 

Niko: “Pure type.” 

Hazel: “Are you sure?” 

Niko shook her head: “It’s not exactly the pure type. Sometimes you look very 
pure, and sometimes you are a bit weird. Anyway, you are definitely not the 
same type as Miss Yoder.” 

Hazel: “If I put on the same dress as Miss Yoder, I can become very 
feminine.” 

Niko laughed loudly: “If you don’t talk, you might look feminine, but if you talk, 
you won’t be able to.” 

Hazel: “Hmph!” 

Niko: “Stop humming, I’ll take you back to the company!” 

Hazel: “Didn’t you drink? How about I drive!” 

Niko: “Can you drive? That’s great! You drive.” 

Niko and Hazel switched positions. 

After Hazel sat in the driver’s seat, she took a deep breath: “Brother Niko, I did 
get a driver’s license from Aryadelle, but I usually drive less. Thank you for 
trusting me so much. I will drive slowly and try to get you to the company 
safely.” 

Niko: “???” 

Niko held the hand of the seat belt, trembling a little: “Can you do it? If not, let 
me drive it!” 

Hazel: “No, it’s dangerous to drive after drinking alcohol!” 

After finishing speaking, Hazel started the engine, and drove the car slowly. 

at the Restaurant. 

Greta poured Lucas a glass of juice. 



Under the table, Greta’s high-heeled feet hooked Lucas’s legs inadvertently. 

Lucas immediately retracted her legs: “Miss Yoder, you are pushing them 
away, what are you trying to say to me?” 

Greta winked like silk, and said with a smile: “I do have something to tell you. 
Lucas, I recently lost love and I’m in a bad mood… It’s strange, but you look 
like my ex-boyfriend.” 

Lucas: “…What do you want to do?” 

 


