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I am a quadrillionarire chapter 2407-“I just told you, my name is David Lidell! 
This is my first time in Amber City and I plan to stay here for a while. I didn’t 
want to cause trouble, but you forced me to. It’s so troublesome entering a 
city. I gave you some benefits and you still don’t want to let me through. 
What’s wrong? Do you think you can bully me just because I’m an outsider? 
Today, I’d like to see what you ants can do to me!” David said lightly. 

The two city guards who had just accepted Beanie’s benefits had completely 
passed out. 

It was not that they were seriously injured, but they passed out from fright. 

When David’s two words made more than a dozen of the law enforcement 
team and hundreds of city guards helpless, the two knew that they were 
doomed today. 

They were the ones at fault since they had taken the bribe and yet refused to 
let David and his team pass. 

They thought they had run into an inexperienced bumpkin and wanted to 
make more money. 

And now, they had not only failed to reap more benefits, they might even have 
to pay with their lives. 

If they encountered someone ordinary, the law enforcement team might have 
suppressed them forcefully and not listened to the other party’s explanation at 
all. 

However, now that they had encountered someone like David, who was 
strong and had a powerful background, the law enforcement team would 
definitely get to the bottom of this. 

Once they traced this back to the two guards, the two of them would surely 
lose their lives. 

Under the tremendous psychological pressure, coupled with their physical 
injuries, they passed out instantly. 



“May I know which main city you’re from, Master David? I’m Viktor Cerruti, the 
captain of Team 73 of the Amber City law enforcement team. I apologize for 
offending you just now. Please forgive me.” the captain of the law 
enforcement team told David who he was. 

Facing the powerful young man in front of him, Viktor, the captain of the 
Amber City law enforcement team, had to humble himself. 

He had to bow and apologize after he had been hurt. 

This was the change brought about by strength and status. 

Viktor was not scared of David, but his background. 

David was indeed strong, but he was still young so his strength was limited 
after all. 

Therefore, he could not defeat the mayor on his own. 

However, it would be different for the force behind him. 

Any force that could cultivate an heir like David was terrifying. 

The top forces in the eight main cities of The Spirit Cage all knew each other 
in Leila. 

Unless it was a hostile relationship. 

Otherwise, they would show respect to each other and not do something that 
went over the line. 

At the end of the day, it would be the subordinates who were responsible for 
the blame. 

In other words, if David was the direct descendant of the top forces in the 
other seven main cities, subordinates would surely be the ones to blame. 

When the time came, being expelled from the law enforcement team would be 
the lightest punishment. 

The onlookers expected Viktor’s words too. 



The captain of the law enforcement team was nothing in front of David, who 
was obviously the descendant of a powerful force. 

A wise man submitted circumstances. 

“You want to know about my background, right? Well, listen carefully. I am 
me. I am all alone. I don’t have any background or power behind me, so just 
do whatever you want to me. I’ll accept anything you throw at me,” David said 
honestly. 

However, no one believed him. 

They all thought he did not want to reveal who he was. 

Could someone, all alone, have such a strong talent and strength? 

Anyway, none of the onlookers present believed him, including Viktor. 

Since he was the captain of the Amber City law enforcement team, he was 
regarded as someone prominent in Amber City, with strong support behind 
him. 

Therefore, he had met quite a lot of geniuses. 

Yet, none of them had David’s strength. 

Just two words from him could defeat a law enforcement team and hundreds 
of city guards in seconds. 

Perhaps only the captain of the entire law enforcement team had this strength. 

“Master David, calm down! Master David, please calm down! It’s all a 
misunderstanding. We didn’t mean to take action against you just now. We 
just wanted to invite you to the mayor’s residence. The conditions here are too 
bad. 

Since this is your first time in Amber City, we should be host to you,” Viktor 
quickly explained. 

“Oh? Is that so?” David pretended to be puzzled. 



‘That’s right! That’s the way it is! How would we dare to do anything to you? 
You must be tired from the journey, so we want to invite you to the mayor’s 
residence for a cup of tea!” 

“So are you saying that I’m not the one at fault? I misunderstood you and I 
shouldn’t have taken action against you?” David asked with a half-smile. 

 


