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It was a little hard for Nek to avoid Nova and Celeste and kill David directly.  

He came close to succeeding several times.  

During these moments, Celeste blocked him with her own body.  

Thus, he had to recall his strength again.  

Celeste could not die.  

Otherwise, it would definitely alert her teacher Eira.  

She was Star Kingdom’s veteran Saint.  

She might have crossed Pre-Saint Rank and become a True Saint.  

Even if Nek’s opponent was still a Pre-Saint, she might already be a late or peak Pre-
Saint.  

He was still a beginner Pre-Saint, so he was not her opponent.  

Moreover, Eira was not the only Saint in the Iridescent Sect.  

There are four Saint Realm reputable elders in total.  

How would Nek win?  

Even if the recuperating Grandmaster Simmons of the Simmons family was called here, 
he also would not be their opponent.  

Therefore, Nek was very restricted.  

This feeling of having a lot of strength but only being able to use a little made Nek very 
uncomfortable.  

He really wanted to use his full strength, but he did not dare.  

After failing to make any progress, Nek also began to worry in his heart.  

‘No, this cannot go on like this.  



‘Those b*tches are sure that I won’t hurt them, so they keep using their bodies to shield 
David.  

‘I have to think of something.”  

Nek made up his mind and rushed directly at David.  

Celeste and Nova were still moving quickly to get in front of him.  

This time, Nek did not choose to dodge.  

When he was approaching the three of them, he exuded his energy again.  

This time, it was directed at David and the two women.  

Celeste and Nova bore the brunt of it.  

They only felt a vast force coming towards them, with the energy they released being 
nothing in front of this vast force.  

Then, their bodies were hit by this wave of energy  Pihr  

The two spat out a mouthful of blood at the same time.  

Immediately, their bodies left the ground and flew into the air.  

The same went for David behind them.  

Without the protection of these two people, he also ended up like the two in front of him 
with his little strength.  

“Pfft!”  

After spitting out a mouthful of blood, his body floated into the air involuntarily.  

The three of them were all blown away by Nek’s explosive energy.  

Nova and Celeste did not expect Nek to dare to hurt them.  

He hurt the head and elder of the Iridescent Sect.  

This was no longer a provocation.  He was directly declaring war.  Nek also went all 
out.  

He would kill David first and then decide what to do later.  



If the reputable elders of the Iridescent Sect came out, he would just apologize to Nova 
and Celeste when worse came to worst.  

A Saint lowering himself to apologize to two Eternals was definitely the highest form of 
respect.  

He believed that even the reputable elders of the Iridescent Sect would not find any fault 
in that.  

The trio’s formation was destroyed.  

They all flew in the air.  

This meant that David was no longer under Nova and Celeste’s protection.  

Nek suddenly appeared in front of David at this moment.  

He looked at David with a gloomy expression.  

Since no one was stopping him, David was no different from an ant before him, and he 
could be destroyed with a snap of Nek’s fingers.  

Celeste and Nova also noticed that something was wrong.  

However, at the moment, they were out of range and they could not save David in time.  
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Nova sighed silently in her heart.  

She had done her best.  

It was too hard for two Sovereign Rankers to save someone in front of a Pre-Saint.  

Once the opponent put in real effort, they would have no chance of winning.  

However, since Nek dared to do this, the Simmons family had to be prepared to bear 
the wrath of the Iridescent Sect.  

Nova was the head of the Iridescent Sect, so she could not do anything to Nek the 
Saint.  

However, she could still teach the Simmons family a lesson.  



“David, run!” Celeste shouted, her blood-red eyes widening.  

She knew that David would surely die if he faced Nek.  

However, she could not do anything other than yell now.  

Celeste had already anticipated what would happen next.  

She closed her eyes sadly, and said silently in her heart, “I’m sorry, David. I killed you. If 
I hadn’t brought you to Star Kingdom, you would still be the overlord in the Milky Way 
and having a good time with your little girlfriends. No one would dare to disobey you 
over there. You were extremely talented and had a heaven-defying adventure. A great 
future was waiting for you, but it’s a pity that everything will be over  

now.”  

She had already listed Nek as the one whom she had to kill in her heart.  

From now on, her life goal was to kill Nek.  

No matter the price was, she was willing to accept it.  

David heard Celeste’s roar and a bitter smile appeared on his face.  

“Run?  

‘Where will I run to now that I’m facing a Saint?  

“I can’t run, okay?”  

David looked at Nek in front of him.  

He spoke to the other party for the first time.  

“There’s no grudge between us, right?” David asked.  

Nek froze for a moment.  

He had expected David to beg for mercy, not extend such a meaningless question.  

Plus, David was too calm when he was facing Nek and certain death.  

This pissed Nek off  

What he wanted was for David to kneel and beg for mercy. He wanted David to beg him 
to let him go.  



Of course, even if David did this, he would not let him go.  

Nek just enjoyed the feeling of being on top  

He wanted David to die in pain instead of disappearing in calmness.  

“We don’t have any grudges!” Nek replied.  

“Then why do you want to kill me?” David asked again.  

“Because I want to!” Nek continued to reply.  

“Why do you want to kill me instead of someone else?”  

“I want to kill you because you’re an eyesore!”  

“Can you kill whoever you want when you become a Saint?”  

“Yes, you can say that.”  

“I see, I understand! How do you want to kill me? Go ahead!”  

“Are you not going to beg for mercy?” It was Nek’s turn to ask this time.  

“If I beg for mercy, will you let me go?” David asked back.  

“No!”  

“Alright. I will die no matter if I beg or not, so it’s better not to beg!”  

“I don’t like your attitude.”  

“Come on! You want to kill me and I still have to behave in the manner you like? Are 
you out of your mind? Do you want to see a doctor?”  

“Do you  

know who you’re scolding?” Nek’s eyes turned cold.  

He wanted to kill David immediately, but he did not want David to die so easily.  

“Of course, I know! I want to scold you! Your name is Nek, right? This name is so 
horrible. Your parents must be stupid, right? Are they fools? If not, why did they name 
you a name that means rich in wisdom? By the way, are your parents still alive? I don’t 
think they are here! Even if they are, they might die from anger because they have a 
son like you. It’s better to just die!”  



David was talking to himself, but Nek’s expression was getting more and more 
unpleasant.  

He wanted to kill David.  

He wanted to do it now. Immediately. Pronto.  

David’s casual statements successfully ignited Nek’s anger, and his anger was almost 
damaging his brain.  

I’m A Quadrillionaire chapter 1525 

Chapter 1525  

“You’re… asking for… death!” Nek gritted his teeth and spat out word by word  

David’s casual statements aroused the monstrous anger in his heart.  

How many years had it been since someone talked to him like this?  

Nek vaguely remembered something like this happening a long time ago.  

Ultimately, he used the power of the Simmons family to exterminate that person’s 
family.  

Unexpectedly, after he became a Saint, he was insulted by an ant again.  

Only by smashing David’s body into thousands of pieces and turning his bones into 
ashes could Nek’s overwhelming anger be extinguished.  

At this moment, he just wanted to kill David.  

Then, he would find David’s family and exterminate all of his family members.  

Everything else was beyond his consideration.  

Nek stretched out his right hand and grabbed the top of David’s head.  

“No!” Celeste screamed.  

However, her voice did not stop Nek.  

David watched as a large hand approached him.  

He could clearly see the movements of the big hand and its trajectory, but his body 
could not resist it.  



This might be the suppression of the realms!  

After all, the difference between the two sides was too great.  

One was an Eternal Realm beginner Ruler Rank, while the other one was a Saint 
Realm Pre-Saint.  

This huge gap could hardly be made up by any other factors.  

In the face of absolute strength, all conspiracies were futile.  

Even with the strength of his own mind power, David could barely see the opponent’s 
movements clearly.  

His body could not react either.  

Therefore, he could only watch as Nek’s big hand approached before landing on his 
head.  

The aura of death was descending.  

At this moment, Nek only needed to exert force with his hand and David’s whole head 
would be crushed.  

At the same time, Nek Saint Realm energy would spread throughout David’s body, 
destroying his body and preventing it from repairing itself.  

In this way, David would be completely killed.  

However, in the face of death, David was extraordinarily calm.  

There was absolutely none of the usual panic that other people would show when they 
were faced with  

death  

He immediately pushed all his mind power to the limit, and then gathered it on the top of 
his head to  protect it from Nek’s grip.  

This was all he could do right now.  

As for fighting back?  

David did not think about it at all.  

This was because the two sides were not at the same level at all.  



He could only prolong the time as much as possible and then leave everything to fate.  

After Nek grabbed the top of David’s head, the corner of his mouth curled into a sinister 
smile.  

“Go to hell, ant! This is what you get for offending a Saint. Not only will you die, but 
everyone related to you will die. I will kill your whole family to relieve my hatred.”  

Nek’s words echoed in the room.  

Almost everyone could predict what was about to happen.  

David’s skull would be crushed, then his body would be destroyed, and in the end, he 
would die.  

Although he was an Eternal and his body could repair itself, Nek would never give David 
the chance.  

David had to die.  

“Don’t… Don’t… Don’t!” Celeste kept yelling.  

Her voice was so helpless and desolate.  

Nova also closed her eyes helplessly, unwilling to witness the bloody scene that was 
coming next.  

David looked at Nek calmly. There was no panic or fear on his face.  

He seemed to have accepted death.  

The more he did this, the angrier Nek felt.  

“Die!”  

Nek exerted force in his finger fingers to crush David’s skull.  

All the other women in the living room closed their  

eyes.  

They did not want to see such a bloody scene.  

“Hmm?”  

Nek suddenly made a confused sound.  



He used all his strength, but he was still unable to crush David’s head.  
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It was as if it was blocked by something.  

‘How is this possible?”  

Nek was a Pre-Saint, and David was just a Ruler Ranker.  

The strength gap between the two sides was miles apart.  

Even 1% of Nek’s strength was not something David can bear, let alone 10%.  If word 
got out about a Pre-Saint failing to crush the skull of a Ruler Ranker with 10% of his 
strength, Nek would definitely make countless people laugh out loud.  

Nek would also become the biggest joke and the laughingstock of Star Kingdom.  

Despite this, Nek was using 10% of his strength but David was still intact.  

The impossible had happened.  

When Nek made that sound, the other women in the room also opened their eyes.  

What they saw was not the bloody scene they imagined.  

David and Nek remained in the same position as when they had just closed their eyes.  

‘What’s going on?  

Is Nek sparing David?”  

As soon as this idea entered their minds, it was immediately rejected.  

Judging from Nek’s display just now, it was absolutely impossible for him to spare 
David.  

‘Then why didn’t he kill David?”  

Everyone had this question in their minds.  

Nek could not kill David with 10% of his strength.  

Nek froze for a moment before coming to his senses.  



All eyes were on him and David.  

It made Nek feel a little embarrassed.  

As a dignified Saint, he failed to kill David the ant after yelling ‘die’.  

For him, this was simply a shame and a great humiliation.  

Anger rose to his mind again.  

Nek increased his strength instantly.  

Boom!  

The sudden surge of energy threw Celeste and Nova in the air again.  

The middle-aged attendant and seven fairies in the distance were also affected.  

They were not even in Eternal Realm.  

Therefore, it would only take a little shockwave from a Saint to completely kill them.  

They had no options when they were facing the crisis of death.  

Hence, they could only show a look of horror as they watched their impending doom.  

Fortunately, at this time, Nova landed in front of them.  

It was too late for Nova to contemplate anything.  

Nova took out a bead from her bosom and crushed it.  

Then, a shield appeared, covering the middle-aged attendant and the seven fairies and 
blocking the shockwave of Nek Saint Realm energy.  

The crisis of their deaths was temporarily averted.  

“Huff…”  

Nova let out a long breath.  

She finally saved the seven fairies.  

If the seven fairies died, the Iridescent Sect would be hot news.  

After being relieved for a while, Nova continued to lock eyes on Nek.  



“Die!” Nek roared.  

At the same time, he increased his strength from 10% to 30%.  

How strong would that be?  

Under Nek’s energy, the room that was already crumbling broke instantly.  

Several powerful defensive formations were also destroyed.  

Boom boom boom!  

The building where the entire VIP Hall was located disappeared in the blink of an eye.  

All that remained was countless debris and fragments.  

 


