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Chapter 4111 

If it was before, Qicai Lingfeng would never believe it, but since that night in the stone 
room, seeing Mengya being naked in front of Yue Feng, Qicai Lingfeng no longer trusts 
Yue Feng. 

“It’s absolutely true.” Wei An nodded heavily. 

“Yue Feng, this bastard.” Qi Cai Lingfeng’s pretty face was cold and she couldn’t help 
scolding: “I can’t believe that he is such a person.” 

Haha… 

Seeing that Qi Cai Lingfeng has no doubts, Wei An looks angry. Appearance, but my 
heart is very proud. 

He was so witty, and in just a few words, he put the responsibility on Yue Feng, and the 
colorful Lingfeng believed it. 

“I…” 

Seeing this situation, Lia was anxious and angry, struggling to stand up and state the 
truth to Qi Cai Lingfeng, but the medicinal effect of ‘Huanhe Water’ in her body started 
to attack, and her whole body was hot. Hallucinations also began to appear in my mind, 
and in this case, I couldn’t say a word. 

“Lia!” 

Qi Cai Lingfeng walked over quickly, took out a red medicinal pill from her body, and 
stuffed it into Liya’s mouth: “Don’t talk for now, at this time our Suzaku Clan’s ‘Suzaku 
Dan’, After taking it, the poison in your body will be expelled.” 

Oops! 

At this moment, Wei An’s face changed, and he wanted to stop it. If Liya wakes up, her 
lie will be broken. How can this be done? 

But because the colorful Lingfeng was on the side, Wei An didn’t have the courage. 

hum! 

After taking Suzaku Dan, Liya only felt a buzzing in her head, and a strange power 
spread throughout her body, and then she didn’t know anything when her eyes 
darkened. 



This chapter is provided by . Visit  for daily update. 

Wei An was originally very nervous, but when he saw Liya passed out in a coma, he 
quickly asked, “What’s wrong with her?” 

“Don’t panic!” 

Qi Cai Lingfeng’s delicate face did not fluctuate at all: “After taking Zhu Que Pill, this is 
it. It seems that the more poisoned she is, the longer she will be in a coma.” 

It turned out to be the case. 

Hearing this, Wei An heaved a sigh of relief, secretly thankful that, fortunately, Liya 
didn’t wake up immediately, and she still had time to remedy it. 

But… how to remedy it? 

“Wei An!” 

At this moment, Qi Cai Lingfeng thought of something and asked, “You said just now 
that you taught Yue Feng a lesson at the time, but what happened later?” 

“Later…” 

Wei An scratched his head, thinking, He responded, “After I taught Yue Feng a lesson, I 
took Liya and left. I don’t know how Yue Feng is now.” 

Qi Cai Lingfeng nodded silently: “Go, follow me to see.” 

Said At these times, Qi Cai Lingfeng looked indifferent, but his heart was full of anger. 

This Yue Feng, who had plotted against Mengya in the stone room before, was 
fortunately discovered by himself, but now, he has caught the attention of his sister Liya. 

Wei An quickly nodded: “Okay!” 

At this time, Wei An was very excited. Don’t worry at all, Qi Cai Lingfeng will see Yue 
Feng, because Gong Ao will not let Yue Feng go. 

However, Wei An did not know that Gong Ao did not succeed in killing Yue Feng, and 
Yue Feng was taken away by Mo Yan, one of the twelve holy demon kings. 

Soon, Wei An summoned thousands of Xuanwu warriors, and together with the colorful 
Lingfeng, they rushed towards the canyon where the cave was located. 

Um? 



A few minutes later, Wei An, Qicai Lingfeng, and thousands of Xuanwu warriors arrived 
near the cave. When they saw the scene in front of them, they were all stunned. 

Especially Wei An, standing there with a blank mind. 

I saw that there was blood everywhere near the cave, and there were traces of fighting 
on the rocks next to it! 

Obviously, there was a tragic fight here before. 

This… what’s going on here? 

Wei An frowned, unable to hide the shock in his heart, and then entered the cave, but it 
was empty, there was no shadow of Yue Feng at all, and Gong Ao was gone. 

At this time, several Xuanwu warriors found the bodies of some gods and soldiers not 
far away. 

“This…. what happened?” 

Qi Cai Lingfeng also frowned. At this time, she reacted and couldn’t help but said to Wei 
An, “Why are there so many dead soldiers here? You taught me a lesson at that time. 
After Yue Feng, did you have a conflict with the Divine Realm?” 

Wei An shook his head: “No.” 

Qi Cai Lingfeng must not know about his conspiracy with Gong Ao. 
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Hearing the answer, Qi Cai Lingfeng thought for a while, and said slowly: “Looking at 
this, Yue Feng must have encountered a demon. Forget it, let’s go to the new camp 
first.” 

Well! 

Wei An hurriedly nodded, looking very serious on the surface, but excited inside. 

No matter what happens here, Yue Feng will definitely die, can you be unhappy? 

Excited, Wei An summoned his subordinates, and Qi Cai Lingfeng led Liya and quickly 
headed for the new camp. 

….. 

the other side. 



Dozens of miles northwest of Yutian Palace, Demon Venerable led an army of hundreds 
of thousands of demons to set up camp here. 

In the past half a day, Demon Lord Gone has launched several more attacks, but all 
came back without success. 

In the Yutian Palace, the Queen Mother Nuwa is in charge, and there are three innate 
law formations around. Although the Demon Lord’s army is like a rainbow, it has never 
been able to break the formation. 

Under such circumstances, Demon Lord Gone was very annoyed. 

At this time, in the military tent of the main camp. 

Demon Lord Gone stood there with a gloomy expression on his face. In front of him was 
a topographic sand table of the Imperial Palace. At this time, the sand table was filled 
with markers. 

Yes, the Demon Lord Gone is deducing the law of the innate magic circle. 

As long as the three innate law formations are broken, the demon army will be able to 
drive straight in and occupy the Yutian Palace. 

However, the three innate magic formations were deployed by the ancestors of 
Honghuang. Not only are they extremely mysterious, but they also contain endless 
innate spiritual energy. Even the Demon Lord Gone knows the technique of formations, 
but for a while, it is No clue. 

In the blink of an eye, Demon Lord Gone studied for half an hour, but there was no 
progress, and his face became more and more gloomy. 

Faced with this situation, several holy devil kings around him stood there one by one, 
not daring to let out the air. 

The atmosphere of the entire military tent was indescribably depressing. 

Mad! 

Finally, the Demon Lord Gone temporarily gave up breaking the formation, and threw 
the mark in his hand into the sand table, his eyes spitting fire, and his heart was 
extremely irritable. 

In the heart of Demon Lord Gone, the Demon Lord army has been resurrected, and it 
could have easily captured Yutian Palace! Unexpectedly, at the last critical moment, it 
was blocked by three innate magic circles. 



It can’t go on like this. 

When the ancestors of the Great Wilderness left the border, the advantage of Demon 
Venerable would be gone. 

“Your Highness!” 

Just when Demon Lord Gone was extremely annoyed, Jutian, one of the twelve holy 
demon kings, couldn’t help but take a step forward and said cautiously, “It’s better, let’s 
attack hard! 

” ? 

Demon Lord Gone said angrily: “Can you grow your brain? How many troops did we 
lose in the previous storm? Hundreds of thousands of troops have already suffered a lot 
of damage. If we continue to attack hard, we will only ask for trouble. Do you still want 
the deity to revive you again?” 

Hearing the angry shout, You Tian stepped aside with embarrassment on his face. 

However, at this moment, a slender figure slowly walked into the big tent, the curve was 
charming, but it was cold and arrogant, it was Mo Yan. 

Seeing Mo Yan’s return, Demon Zun Gone’s expression did not fluctuate in the 
slightest, and he said lightly: “Moyan, I asked you to clear the deserters from the God 
Realm near Feng Mo Mountain. What happened?” 

“Return to Zun!” 

Mo Yan felt that the Demon Lord Gone was in a bad mood at this time, but he did not 
panic at all, but responded with a smile: “I have almost eliminated the deserters from the 
God Realm near the Demon Sealing Mountain, and my subordinates are still There is a 
windfall.” 

Windfall? 

Hearing this, Demon Lord Gone frowned, and at the same time, the other holy demon 
kings around were also interested. 

The next second, Demon Zun Gone reacted and couldn’t help asking: “What’s the 
harvest?” 

Mo Yan smiled slightly: “Your Highness will know soon.” After speaking 

, Mo Yan shouted at the outside: ” Bring it in.” 



Whoops! 

The words fell, and the two Demon Venerable Warriors walked in with a person, and 
saw that the person was in a state of embarrassment, his breath was weak, but his eyes 
were rebellious. 

It was Yue Feng. 

Humanity? 

At this moment, the other holy devil kings around him suddenly started talking. 

“How do you get a human back?” 

“What’s different about this kid? Moyan actually said it was an unexpected gain.” 

In the discussion around, the Demon Lord Gone couldn’t help laughing, and praised 
Moyan: “Not bad, it really is an unexpected harvest, haha…” 
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Laughing, Demon Lord Gone walked slowly to Yue Feng, and said condescendingly: 
“Isn’t this the Nine Heavens Profound Sage named by the ancestors of the Great 
Wilderness? We really have a fate, we meet again so soon.” 

Saying these At the time, the Demon Lord Gone had a smile on his face, but his eyes 
were a bit cold. 

For the Demon Lord Gone, although he has never communicated with Yue Feng, he is 
very familiar with him. Before the Demon Lord Gone was remodeling his body, he made 
a lot of trouble in the Yutian Palace. Yue Feng was present at that time. After Gone was 
trapped in the sealed magic mirror, he was taken back to Kyushu by Yue Feng, and 
then sent to the ghost world. 

Done! 

Facing the ridicule of Demon Lord Gone, Yue Feng squeezed out a smile, but his heart 
was extremely bitter. 

This fall into the hands of the Demon Venerable, I am afraid it is completely over. 

“Your Highness!” 

At this moment, Mo Yan thought of something, and asked Demon Lord Gone, “How is 
the situation here at Yutian Palace?” 



Demon Lord Gone put away his smile and briefly explained the situation. 

Knowing the situation, Mo Yan frowned and thought for a while, then said with a smile: 
“Your Majesty, don’t worry, there is a way for your subordinates to make the Nine 
Heavens God and 

the Empress Nuwa surrender.” “Speak!” Flash, urged! 

Mo Yan showed a smile, pointed at Yue Feng and said: “This Yue Feng is not only the 
Nine Heavens Profound Sage, but also the Jade Dragon Consort, the son-in-law of the 
Nine Heavens God, with an extraordinary position, let’s put him in front of the Yutian 
Palace and force the Nine Heavens God to surrender Otherwise, it will destroy his 
primordial spirit.” As 

she said that, Mo Yan’s delicate face showed a bit of confidence: “My son-in-law was 
arrested, then the Nine Heavens God can’t be indifferent 

. 

” At this point, the other holy demon kings around were extremely excited. 

“It’s still Moyan who has a solution.” 

“Yeah, it’s wonderful to use Yue Feng to blackmail the Nine Heavens God!” 

Hahaha… 

At the same time, the Demon Lord Gone was also in a good mood and laughed loudly: 
“Okay, This is a good method, you should prepare immediately!” 

“Yes!” 

Mo Yan and the other holy demon kings responded in unison, and then took Yue Feng 
out. 

At this moment, Yue Feng wanted to cry but had no tears, and at the same time he was 
unspeakably uneasy. 

Ma De, even if he is a prisoner, he is still being used to threaten the Nine Heavens God. 
The Nine Heavens God has no good feelings for him at all, so how could he agree to 
the Demon Venerable’s request? 

I’m afraid that after the Nine Heavens God refuses, the Demon Venerable will kill 
himself to vent his anger when he gets angry. 

Thinking of this, Yue Feng was very desperate. 



Dong Dong Dong… 

After a while, under the command of Demon Lord Gone, hundreds of thousands of 
Demon Clan army escorted Yue Feng and marched mightily towards Yutian Palace. 

On the other side, Yutian Palace. 

The news that Yue Feng was taken prisoner soon spread to Yutian Palace. 

Upon hearing the news, the Nine Heavens God immediately summoned all the priests, 
walked out of the Yutian Palace, and confronted the demon army from afar. 

Swish! 

As soon as the Nine Heavens God and the priests came out, the Demon Lord Gone, 
who was suspended in the air, suddenly turned cold. 

The next second, Demon Zun Gone shouted at the Nine Heavens God: “Why is it only 
you? Where is Nuwa?” 

As he spoke, Demon Zun Gone looked around and searched for the figure of Empress 
Nuwa. Speaking of which, Demon Zun Gone didn’t care about the Nine Heavens God at 
all, but he was still a little jealous of Empress Nuwa. 

Jiutian God sneered: “My senior sister is where she should be.” 

When he said this, Jiutian God looked indifferent, but he was a little nervous. Just an 
hour ago, Nuwa returned to the place where the ancestors of Honghuang retreated to 
visit. 

Nuwa was not there, and the Nine Heavens God had no confidence in facing the 
Demon Venerable. However, the palace of Jiutian God is very deep, and on the surface 
it looks like Nuwa is nearby. 

Hearing this, the Demon Venerable chuckled lightly. 

This time, I didn’t plan to storm Yutian Palace, it doesn’t matter where Nuwa is. 

Immediately, Demon Venerable waved his hand, and immediately, several Demon Race 
warriors held a figure and walked slowly to the front. 

It was Yue Feng. 

wow. 

Seeing Yue Feng, the priests were in an uproar. 



“Jade Dragon’s Consort?” 

“Didn’t he die on the Demon Sealing Mountain? Why was he in the hands of the Demon 
Race?” 

“What happened?” 

Listening to the discussion of the priests, the Nine Heavens God was also stunned, 
watching closely. Yue Feng was speechless. At the same time, I was also a little 
annoyed. 

Gong Ao actually lied to me. 

Chapter 4114 

Yue Feng was obviously fine, but he said that he died in the blood sacrifice formation in 
Fengmo Mountain, and now, Yue Feng has fallen into the hands of Demon Zun Gone, 
which is a great shame for God Realm . 

After all, Yue Feng is not only Jiutian Xuansheng, but also his son-in-law. 

“Haha!” 

Seeing the reactions of the Nine Heavens God and the priests, the Demon Lord Gone 
laughed proudly, and then said loudly: “Nine Heavens God, you should be familiar with 
this human being, who was named Nine Heavens Profound Sage by your master at the 
beginning. Later, it was said that he became your son-in-law again.” 

“It’s a pity, but now he’s in my hands.” 

Hu… 

Hearing this, Jiutian Shen took a deep breath and said coldly: “Goni, you What do you 
want?” As he spoke, he couldn’t help but glance at Yue Feng. 

“It’s very simple!” 

Demon Lord Gone smiled and said lightly: “Let go of Yutian Palace, you and your 
subordinates, all surrender to me.” 

Shuh! 

Hearing this request, Jiutian God’s face darkened, extremely ugly. I was really worried 
about what was coming, and the Demon Lord Gone really used Yue Feng to coerce 
himself into surrender. 



Speaking of which, Jiutian God didn’t like Yue Feng. At that time, the situation forced 
Princess Dongling to be betrothed to him, just to save the royal family’s face. It can be 
said that Jiutian God didn’t care about Yue Feng’s life or death. 

But in the current situation, if you reject it directly, it will appear too cruel and indifferent. 
How can you control the realm in the future? 

Can agree to Gone’s request, but disobey the heart. 

For a time, the Nine Heavens God fell into a deep tangle. 

Whoosh! 

At this moment, a figure came quickly from behind, sweating profusely and exhausted. 

It was Gong Ao. 

After escaping from Mo Yan before, Gong Ao immediately rushed in the direction of 
Yutian Palace, only to encounter a small group of demon warriors on the way, delaying 
for some time, but finally came back successfully. 

Hiss… 

At this moment, seeing the scene in front of him, Gong Ao couldn’t help taking a breath 
of cold air, and he saw that outside the Yutian Palace, surrounded by hundreds of 
thousands of demon army, the Demon Lord Gone was suspended high in the air, with 
unparalleled momentum. 

In front of the demon army, several demon warriors were holding a human. 

Yue Feng? 

Seeing Yue Feng, Gong Ao’s heart trembled, thinking that he was confused, so he 
quickly rubbed his eyes. 

After confirming that it was Yue Feng, Gong Ao was completely stunned, and only felt 
his brain buzzing. 

what happened? That Demon King caught Yue Feng, didn’t she kill him? How did you 
bring him to the Imperial Palace? 

While muttering in his heart, Gong Ao didn’t dare to ask any more questions, but walked 
over silently and stood behind the Nine Heavens God, but he was still uneasy in his 
heart. 



You must know that in the blood sacrifice battle before, Gong Ao secretly plotted 
against Yue Feng. What he was most afraid of was that Yue Feng saw the God of Nine 
Heavens and told the truth. Once the truth was exposed, Gong Ao committed the crime 
of deceiving the king. 

But Gong Ao’s worry was unnecessary. 

Because the Demon Lord Gone tapped Yue Feng’s dumb point. 

“Nine Heavens!” 

At this time, seeing that the Nine Heavens God was reluctant to express his position, 
the Demon Lord Gone said coldly: “Have you thought about it, do you even want to 
save your son-in-law’s life in order to preserve your status?” 

call… 

Hearing this, Jiutian God clenched his fists and wanted to speak, but he didn’t know 
how to respond. 

At this moment, Gong Ao couldn’t help but stepped forward and said to the Nine 
Heavens God, “Your Majesty, don’t be fooled.” When saying this, Gong Ao tried his best 
to remain calm, but his eyes couldn’t hide the complexities in his heart. . 

Although he had just returned, Gong Ao was very thoughtful, and he could see at once 
that in the current situation, the Demon Lord Gone was going to use Yue Feng to force 
the Nine Heavens to submit. 

Um? 

Hearing the voice, Nine Heavens God turned back to see Gong Ao, and his face 
suddenly sank: “Gong Ao, where have you been, and why did it take you so long to 
come back? Also, Yue Feng is obviously fine, why do you say he died in the blood 
sacrifice college? Array?” 

When he said this, the Nine Heavens God was very angry. 

Pfft! 

Feeling the wrath of the Nine Heavens God, Gong Ao’s legs softened and he knelt 
directly on the ground. He said in fear, “Your Majesty, calm down, this subordinate did 
not lie, Yue Feng is really dead.” 

Really dead? 



Jiutian God was so angry that he pointed at Yue Feng, who was tied with five flowers on 
the opposite side: “Then explain to me, how can he live when he is dead?” 
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This… 

Gong Ao was full of fear, and his mind quickly turned: “Your Majesty, this Yue Feng may 
be fake, even if it is not fake, then the Demon Lord Gone will have a way to resurrect 
him.” After 

saying that, Gong Ao With a sincere look on his face: “I have always been loyal to Your 
Majesty, how dare I lie?” 

Speaking of which, Gong Ao didn’t have the courage to lie, but seeing that Yue Feng 
never opened his mouth, he realized that the acupuncture point was tapped by the 
Demon Lord, and he began to act recklessly. . 

call! 

Hearing this, Jiutian God took a deep breath, his expression changed, and he 
pondered. 

At the same time, the surrounding priests all looked complicated. 

“Okay!” 

Finally, Jiutian God’s expression softened, and he said to Gong Ao: “Get up, I don’t 
blame you for this matter.” 

After saying that, Jiutian God’s divine power exploded, rushing into the air, and Demon 
Lord Gonie looked at each other from a distance and chuckled, “Gonie, don’t play this 
trick in front of me. My son-in-law, Yue Feng, died in your blood sacrifice two days ago. 
Don’t you think it’s funny that you are using a fake to intimidate me?” 

When he said this, Jiutian God didn’t even look at Yue Feng, his attitude was very 
indifferent. 

Speaking of which, Jiutian God was originally very entangled, but Gong Ao’s remarks 
just woke him up. As long as you don’t admit that the Yue Feng in front of you is real, 
you can turn passive into active. 

And, don’t worry about losing your prestige. 

What? 



Hearing this, Demon Lord Gone frowned, his face extremely ugly. 

What did God say in these nine days? The Yue Feng you caught was fake? 

For the sake of status, he didn’t even recognize his son-in-law, which was too ruthless. 

What the hell! 

At the same time, Yue Feng, who was below, was also stunned, wanting to cry without 
tears, and at the same time holding back his fire. 

God is too cruel these nine days. 

Although he does not belong to the realm of the gods, he has made a lot of efforts to 
prevent the Demon Lord Gone from resurrecting the demon tribe. Not only that, he is 
also the husband of Princess Dongling. 

But what about the Nine Heavens God? For his own throne and rights, he actually 
denied himself in public. 

It’s irritating and ridiculous. 

“Tsk tsk!” 

Soon, Demon Venerable Gone responded with a sneer, and mocked at the Nine 
Heavens God: “You think you’re fake, I can’t do anything about it?” 

Then Demon Venerable raised his hand: “Come on, First cut off a hand of this Nine 
Heavens Profound Sage.” 

Swish! 

As soon as the voice fell, a demon warrior waved a long sword, and saw a flash of cold 
light, Yue Feng’s left arm was instantly cut off, and blood spurted out in an instant. 

Yue Feng was tapped on the acupuncture point and could not shout, but the severe 
pain still caused him to sweat coldly, his face turned pale, and his whole body trembled 
violently. 

Groove Nima’s. 

At this time, Yue Feng kept cursing in his heart. 

These nine gods, and the Demon Lord Gone, are more ruthless than the other. If they 
don’t die this time, they must settle the account with both of them. 



“Ha ha…” 

Seeing this scene, Jiutian God’s face did not fluctuate in the slightest, and he sneered: 
“Goni, stop acting, he is not Yue Feng at all, but your subordinate pretending to be, 
don’t say you cut off his hand, Even if it is chopped on the spot, I won’t even frown, so 
you should save it, and if you have time, do more research on how to break the innate 
magic circle around the Yutian Palace.” The 

last word fell, and the Nine Heavens God turned and entered . Imperial Palace. 

Gong Ao and other priests followed closely behind. 

Seeing this scene, Mozun Gone’s face suddenly turned gloomy. He never thought that 
the Nine Heavens God really didn’t care about Yue Feng’s life or death, and this 
recruitment was a complete failure. 

“Go back to the camp!” In the 

next second, Demon Lord Gone coldly shouted, and the figure was like a black 
lightning, and quickly went to the camp. 

The army of hundreds of thousands of demons did not dare to neglect, and quickly 
brought Yue Feng and quickly followed. 

Returning to the tent, the Demon Lord Gone sat there with a gloomy expression on his 
face. 

He knew that Jiutian God was hypocritical, but he didn’t expect such hypocrisy. For the 
sake of status, he didn’t care about the life and death of his son-in-law at all. What was 
even more contemptible was that he also said that this Yue Feng was fake to protect his 
reputation. 

The more he thought about it, the more angry the Demon Lord Gone became, his eyes 
blood red. 

The holy demon kings standing around were silent one by one. 

 


