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If this is true, Bai Yunhai has committed a heinous crime. 

Whether it’s killing the patriarch or trying to steal the devil’s soul, any one of them is 
enough for him to die a hundred times. 

Done! 

Seeing that the plan was revealed, Bai Yunhai turned pale and panicked. 

Bai Qing was trembling all over, and he could hardly stand still. 

However, Bai Yunhai quickly calmed down and pointed at Moyan and shouted: “Don’t 
believe her words, she has been poisoned deeply and has affected her mind. She is 
completely talking nonsense.” 

“Patriarch Baihe is my uncle, right. I treat him like my own, how could I mutilate him? 
When I came to visit just now, her body was poisoned and she started going crazy, so I 
had no choice but to tap her acupuncture point.” 

When he said this, Bai Yunhai looked anxious, very worried. Sincere look. 

call! 

Hearing this, everyone hesitated. What Bai Yunhai said seemed to make sense. After 
all, the poison in Mo Yan would indeed cause mental confusion. 

Seeing this, Moyan sneered: “Bai Yunhai, stop talking nonsense, what you did, you 
know best.” After 

saying that, Moyan looked around and looked at Bai Fu and everyone: “Look at what 
you did. Do I look like I’ve gone crazy?” 

At this 

moment, Bai Fu and the elders did not speak, but frowned and pondered. 

A few seconds later, Bai Fu took a deep breath and made a decision in his heart. He 
pointed at Bai Yunhai and said, “Take Bai Yunhai!” 

This chapter is provided by naijdate.com. Visit naijdate.com for daily update. 

The situation in front of him is obviously that Bai Yunhai lied. 



Although Bai Yunhai was his son, he couldn’t tolerate doing such a rebellious thing. 

Whoa! 

As soon as the words fell, the surrounding Bai family disciples exploded their inner 
strength and charged directly towards Baiyunhai. It stands to reason that Bai Fu is only 
the first elder, and they should obey the orders of the patriarch Bai Yunhai. 

But the situation at hand is special. Bai Yunhai is suspected of mutilating the former 
patriarch and must be severely punished. 

“Father!” 

Bai Yunhai was shocked and angry when he saw many disciples of the Bai family 
rushing towards him. He couldn’t help shouting at Fu Bai, “What I said just now is true, 
you have to believe me.” As 

he said, Bai Yunhai urged his inner strength to resist the siege of the crowd. 

Bai Fu snorted coldly: “You renegade son, Your Excellency Moyan personally identified 
you, but you still refuse to admit it? Hurry up and get up and explain the crime.” 

“I’m right, that’s right…” 

Seeing that Bai Fu didn’t give anything at all When he had a chance, Bai Yunhai’s face 
was grim, his eyes were blood red, and he lost his sense in an instant: “Don’t force me, 
or I’ll be welcome.” 

However, the surrounding Bai disciples, as if they didn’t hear it, stepped forward to fight 
Bai Yunhai. stand up. 

Phew… 

Seeing this scene, the disciples around Icefire Island were stunned. 

At the same time, the four Sikongjia brothers also looked at each other in dismay, 
feeling a little confused. 

what’s going on? 

Why all of a sudden, they started fighting on their own? 

A few seconds later, Sikong Bing was the first to react and whispered, “They are 
fighting, what should we do?” 



Sikong Jia looked at Bai Yunhai’s figure tightly, his face full of regret: “I wanted to 
decide the outcome with him, but now it seems that I have no chance.” 

Sikong Yi thought for a while, then pointed at Mo Yan: “This woman is a bit weird. , why 
don’t you take her away and hand it over to the little junior sister for interrogation.” 

Hmm! 

Hearing this, the three Sikongjia nodded, and then the four of them burst out at the 
same time, heading straight for Moyan. 

Seeing the four brothers burst out, Mo Yan’s pretty face changed, and she 
subconsciously wanted to dodge, but she was tapped on the acupuncture point and 
couldn’t move. 

In the next second, Mo Yan was carried into the air by Sikongjia and headed directly 
towards Icefire Island. 

The three Sikong Yi followed closely behind him. 

Made! 

Seeing this, Bai Yunhai was extremely frightened and shouted: “Don’t fight, stop 
fighting, Your Excellency Mo Yan has been captured.” As he spoke, he wanted to rush 
out to pursue. 

However, there were many Bai disciples around him, and he couldn’t rush out at all. 

Bai He’s expression also changed, and he quickly rushed into the air to pursue the four 
Sikongjia brothers. 

While chasing, Bai He did not forget to instruct Bai’s disciples: “Be sure to take down 
the Baiyunhai without making any mistakes.” The voice fell, and the figure quickly 
chased towards the Icefire Island. 
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“Yes, Great Elder!” 

Upon hearing the order, many Bai’s disciples responded one after another, besieging 
Baiyunhai again. 

At this time, Baiyunhai was anxious and angry at the same time. 

I just became the patriarch every day, and I can see that I can fuse the demon soul, but 
I never thought that all this was exposed because of the four stupid guys. 



Bang! 

In a frightened anger, the internal force of the Baiyun Sea erupted, shocking the dozen 
or so Bai disciples in front of him, then turned around and jumped into the sea. 

To be honest, with Bai Yunhai’s current strength, he is not afraid of these Bai disciples 
at all, but after all, they are from the same clan. 

Bai Yunhai thought about it, dived first and left, and then made plans when he got to a 
safe place. 

the other side! 

Bai Fu chased the four brothers, and soon reached a shore on Icefire Island. 

I can see that the entire Ice and Fire Island is very large, stretching for dozens of miles 
from east to west, but the terrain is very dangerous. Several volcanoes in the northwest 
are erupting magma. , is a gentle forest. 

At this time, when they reached the shore, the four brothers did not hesitate and rushed 
in with Mo Yan. 

call! 

Bai Fu stopped, frowned, and observed it carefully. 

Bai Fu clearly saw that in the forest in front of him, many parts of it were introduced into 
the sea water, forming intricate ditches. It seemed ordinary, but there was something 
mysterious in it. 

Yes, this forest is the unique formation of Ice and Fire Island, the Dragon King Shuimu 
formation. 

This formation was created by Sikong Yanran’s ancestors, and it has existed for 
thousands of years. In these thousands of years, few outsiders have managed to break 
through. 

Um? 

At this time, the four brothers who entered the formation found Bai Fu on the shore. 
They were stunned for a moment, and then laughed. 

“An old man is chasing after him.” ” Nonsense 

, we caught his daughter-in-law, and we must chase after him! 



“ 

When Ba Dao got up, Mo Yan’s face was full of shame and anger, and she shouted: 
“Don’t talk nonsense, let me go.” 

Si Kongjia shook his head, very serious: “This can’t be done, you are a weird woman, I 
want to bring you here. Little Junior Sister, just take a look.” He sensed Mo Yan’s 
demonic soul just now, although he didn’t know what kind of power it was, he also knew 
that this woman was unusual. 

Mo Yan was so angry that she wanted to break free, but she couldn’t. 

“Hey!” 

At this moment, Bai Fu stood on the shore and shouted: “You four, quickly put down 
Your Excellency Mo Yan, or the old man is welcome.” You 

‘re welcome? 

Hearing this, the four brothers looked at each other, then burst into laughter. 

“Haha, what did this old man say?” 

“What a big tone.” In the 

next second, Sikong Jia looked at Bai Fu with a provocative face: “Old man, if you have 
the ability, come in, otherwise, where will you come from? Where are you going?” The 

voice fell, and Si Kongjia led Mo Yan towards the depths of the woods. 

The other three brothers followed closely. 

Made! 

Seeing this situation, Bai Fu was furious, he no longer hesitated, and rushed directly 
into the woods. Your Excellency Moyan is the hope of the entire Demon Race and the 
Bai family’s support. She must not be let in. 

However, after entering, Bai Fu was stunned. 

I saw that the surrounding trees seemed to move, and no matter what method I used, I 
couldn’t get out of this forest. 

At the same time, the four brothers brought Mo Yan and soon came to an quaint 
courtyard. They saw that the courtyard was halfway up the mountain, surrounded by 



clouds and mist, like a fairyland. It formed a stark contrast with the sinister environment 
in other places on Ice and Fire Island. comparison. 

I didn’t know there was such a special place overseas. 

Seeing this courtyard, Mo Yan murmured in her heart. If the Bai family could recuperate 
here, it would also be a good choice, but unfortunately, the Bai family had a rebel 
named Bai Yunhai. 

Just as Mo Yan was muttering secretly, the four brothers kept bickering. 

“Tell me, what is the identity of this woman?” 

“That little white face’s wife.” 

“What wife? I haven’t seen that little white face’s father, so I call her “Your Excellency,” 
how could she be so respectful to her daughter-in-law?” 
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Swish! 

Hearing the brother’s argument, Mo Yan’s delicate face instantly flushed red, she was 
shy and angry, and at the same time she didn’t know whether to laugh or cry. 

These four brothers really have a problem with their brains. 

At this point, I’m still struggling with my identity. 

At this time, Mo Yan wanted to tell them that she was a famous Demon King, but she 
held back. 

“Squeak!” 

Soon, at a stone cell behind the courtyard, Si Kongjia pushed Mo Yan in, closed the 
stone gate, and said to Mo Yan seriously, “Be honest. 

” Directed at the disciples guarding the stone prison: “Look at her, don’t let her run 
away.” After the 

last sentence fell, the four brothers quickly left and hurried towards the place where 
Sikong Yanran retreated. 

Huh… 



At this moment, looking at the damp stone prison in front of her, Mo Yan breathed a 
sigh of relief, and a trace of despair rose in her heart. 

Just out of the tiger’s mouth, and into the wolf’s den. 

Is this life? 

the other side! 

The four brothers rushed to the secret room of the manor, and when they arrived at the 
door, none of them dared to speak rashly. 

You must know that in the past year, Sikong Yanran has been cultivating a special 
exercise, and there is no need to disturb it. 

“Junior sister..” 

After a few seconds, Si Kongjia slowly stepped forward and shouted cautiously, “Little 
junior sister?” 

The voice fell, and a clear and pleasant voice came from the secret room: “Senior 
Brother, didn’t I tell you before that when I was in retreat, I was not allowed to disturb 
me?” 

Uh… 

Sikong Jia scratched his head: “We caught one Woman, the power in her body is very 
strange!” 

“A very beautiful woman.” Sikong Yi answered. 

At the same time, Sikong Bing and Sikong Ding also spoke. 

“With this woman, there is a large group of people, it seems to be a family.” 

“Yes, the family surnamed Bai.” 

Squeak! 

Hearing this, the door of the secret room was pushed open, and then a slender and 
beautiful figure came out slowly. 

It was Sikong Yanran. 

At this moment, Sikong Yanran was wearing a long white dress, with graceful curves 
and charming features, delicate facial features, like a fairy descending from the earth. 



Seeing the junior sister come out, the four Sikongjia quickly shut their mouths and 
lowered their heads, like children who have done something wrong. 

The four brothers are not afraid of heaven and earth, but they are afraid of this little 
junior sister. 

You know, little junior sister dislikes being interrupted when she is in retreat. Now that 
her cultivation is interrupted, she will definitely have to teach others a lesson. 

However, Sikong Yanran didn’t blame the four brothers. With her delicate face, she 
couldn’t hide the astonishment and asked, “What did you just say? There is a family 
named Bai, and there is a woman with special strength? 

” Sikong Yanran’s face was calm, and her eyes showed some tremors. 

The family surnamed Bai, a woman with special strength, if I guessed correctly, it must 
be related to Bai Yunfei. 

Maybe, that special woman is an important figure in the Demon Race. 

Over the past year, although Sikong Yanran has not left Icefire Island, he has always 
been concerned about the situation in Kyushu. 

Um! 

Hearing the question, the four brothers looked at each other and nodded at the same 
time. 

“Yes! That woman was locked in the stone prison by us.” 

“And when we came back, an old man surnamed Bai chased after him.” 

“But he was blocked from Shuimuzhen.” 

Knowing the situation, Sikong Yanran didn’t have time to think about it, she nodded and 
said, “Take me to see it!” After speaking, she took the lead in the direction of the Dragon 
King Shuimu Formation. 

The four brothers followed closely. 

…… 

At this moment, in the stone prison. 

At first, Mo Yan was very anxious and desperate, but slowly calmed down. 



No, you can’t sit still. 

Before Bai Yunhai seized the demon soul and was interrupted at the last moment, it 
was enough to prove that he should not die. 

Thinking to herself, Mo Yan hurriedly sat there, silently regaining her strength. 

However, what made Mo Yan depressed was that the blood-soul pill in her body was 
extremely poisonous, and her strength could not return to its peak state if it was not 
expelled. 

Moreover, there are several disciples of Ice and Fire Island guarding outside the stone 
prison. In this case, it is more difficult to escape than to go to heaven. 
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Let’s talk about opening the acupoints first. 

Depressed, Mo Yan sat cross-legged again, and after a while, she successfully opened 
the acupuncture point. 

call! 

After regaining her freedom, Mo Yan breathed a sigh of relief, and then began to 
carefully observe the stone prison in front of her. 

As you can see, this stone prison is a natural stone cave. At the innermost position, 
there is a big hole as thick as a bucket. The big hole slopes down and winds straight 
into the sea. 

Great! 

Mo Yan was shocked and angry when she found this big hole, but she was stunned 
when she got to the front. 

I saw that there were turbulent undercurrents everywhere near the bottom of the sea 
where the big hole was linked. If they were involved, there was no possibility of survival. 

Done. 

Just had hope, and then shattered. 

At this moment, Mo Yan was exhausted. 

At this moment, footsteps were heard outside, and it was obvious that a lot of guards 
had arrived. 



“The eldest lady has an order to be strictly guarded.” 

“Yes!” 

Hearing this, Mo Yan bit her lip tightly and made a bold decision in her heart. There are 
more guards outside, and it is almost impossible to rush out. , it is better to jump down, 
there may be a chance of life. 

After making up her mind, Mo Yan took a deep breath, her delicate body flashed, and 
she jumped directly into the big hole. 

Huhu… 

At the moment of falling into the sea, the nearby undercurrent instantly shrouded 
Moyan. At this time, Moyan’s strength in the body is less than one-tenth of the peak 
period, and she can’t break free at all. 

In just a few seconds, under the raging power of the undercurrent, Mo Yan lost her 
strength, and her eyes turned black. 

Are you going to die? 

So unhappy. 

However, dying at the bottom of the sea like this is better than falling into the hands of 
those people. 

Finally, Mo Yan couldn’t stand it anymore, she fainted directly, and her body was swept 
into the depths of the sea by the undercurrent. 

… 

the other side! Sikong Yanran and the four brothers arrived at the Dragon King Shuimu 
Formation. 

Um? 

Seeing that the shore was empty, and there was not a single person in sight, Sikong 
Yanran frowned slightly, tilted her head and asked the four brothers, “What about the 
old man surnamed Bai you’re talking about?” The 

four brothers looked at each other and responded. 

“It should be gone.” 

“Our Dragon King Shuimu Formation is so powerful that he can’t pass through.” 



“Alas, I thought this old man was so strong, but he backed away. It’s really boring. 

” With that, Sikong Yanran was not in the mood to pay attention, but looked around to 
find out that the mysterious woman had a special identity, and the old man surnamed 
Bai would definitely not give up easily. 

Soon, Sikong Yanran found something in the woods, and her body was shocked. 

I saw that at the edge of the Dragon King Shuimu Formation, an old man fell into a pool 
of blood with a huge wooden arrow stuck in his heart. 

It was Bai Fu, the great elder of the Bai family. 

died? 

Seeing this scene, Sikong Yanran frowned secretly, and there was no slight fluctuation 
on her delicate face. 

You must know that the Dragon King Shuimu Formation can’t help trapping the enemy. 
In some shadows, there are still many organs hidden. The situation in front of him is 
very obvious. Bai Fu rushed in and triggered the organs. 

“Oops!” 

At this time, the four brothers also saw Bai Fu’s body, and they were all taken aback. 

“This old man really came in.” 

“It’s a pity that he actually died.” 

Sikong Yanran frowned and said softly, “Don’t talk about it, get him out and bury him 
somewhere.” Although the other party accidentally broke into the formation and broke 
the rules of Ice and Fire Island, but the dead person is the biggest, so it is better to bury 
him. 

Hearing the order, the four brothers complied, then walked in and took out Bai Fu’s 
body. 

Whoa whoa whoa! 

As soon as the body was taken out, the sound of sea water was heard. 

At this moment, Sikong Yanran and the four brothers looked at it subconsciously, and 
they were all stunned. 



I saw that on the sea not far away, several large ships came quickly, and there were 
people standing on them, all dressed in white, it was the Bai disciples and a few elders. 

After Bai Yunhai jumped into the water before, these Bai disciples and several elders 
waited there for news, but they waited and waited, but they didn’t see Fu Bai rescue Mo 
Yan. 

At that time, after a few elders discussed it, they brought the disciples of the Bai family 
and came directly to Icefire Island. 

“Little Junior Sister!” 

Seeing this scene, Sikongjia was the first to react and shouted, “It’s these people.” 
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At the same time, three Sikong Yi also spoke. 

“These people are very courageous, and they dare to come to the door.” 

“Just right, I didn’t have fun before.” 

Seeing their open mouth, Sikong Yanran frowned and waved her hand. 

Suddenly, the four brothers shut up obediently. 

Swish! 

At this time, the Bai family also discovered them, and all of them cast their gazes over 
instantly. 

In the next second, one of the figures walked to the bow of the boat, and looked closely 
at Sikong Yanran and the four brothers: “Hurry up and hand over our Great Elder and 
Your Excellency Mo Yan, otherwise, we will settle the Ice and Fire Island.” 

Ling Ran said, Undoubtedly. 

It was the second elder Bai Yuting. 

Hearing the threat, Sikong Yanran’s delicate face suddenly showed a bit of anger, and 
said coldly: “You are trespassing on our Icefire Island, but you are still so arrogant? I tell 
you, I will not let the two of you go. Please leave quickly, or you will be at your own risk.” 
The 

voice was not loud, but it spread throughout the audience. 



Sikong Yanran has a good heart and didn’t want to do this at first, but Icefire Island has 
the rules of Icefire Island, and the Bai family in front of her is related to the Demon 
Race, so you must not be polite to this kind of person. 

When the voice fell, the four brothers couldn’t help shouting loudly. 

“Get the hell out of here.” 

“You guys, you dare to come to the Ice and Fire Island to make trouble ? 

“ 

At this moment, Bai Yuting and the other elders all had extremely gloomy expressions 
on their faces, and they were full of anger. 

Immediately afterwards, someone suddenly shouted, “Look, it’s the Great Elder, the 
Great Elder is dead.” The 

voice fell, and the eyes of everyone in the Bai family converged behind Sikong Yanran, 
only to see Bai Fu lying there. , covered in blood, has been dead for a long time. 

“You…” The 

next second, Bai Yuting reacted, pointing at Sikong Yanran and shouting angrily, “You 
guys are so cruel, you actually killed the Great Elder.” 

In his heart, he thought that it was Fu Bai who came to rescue Moyan, but he was killed. 
The people of Ice and Fire Island were killed. 

Swish! 

In an instant, all Bai’s disciples present glared at Sikong Yanran. 

Sikong Yanran looked indifferent, her delicate face did not fluctuate in the slightest, and 
she said softly: “He didn’t kill us, but killed himself. He broke into our formation on Ice 
and Fire Island and touched the organ…” 

For a time, the four brothers and several others also spoke. 

“That’s right, don’t spit your blood!” 

“He broke into the formation and triggered the mechanism, can you blame us?” 

Hearing this, both Bai Yuting and the Bai disciples behind him fell silent, each with a 
complicated expression. stand up. 



If the Great Elder broke into the chassis of others, triggered the mechanism and died, it 
would really be no wonder they were. 

“Father!” 

At this moment, a cry of grief and indignation came, and then, after seeing a large rock 
not far away, a figure rushed out, his face was full of grief and anger, and his eyes were 
blood red. 

It is Baiyunhai. 

That’s right, after Baiyunhai jumped into the water before, he quietly sneaked to the 
vicinity of Icefire Island, intending to find an opportunity to rescue Moyan. After all, 
capturing the demon soul is the most important thing. 

Just as soon as they landed, they saw the Bai family driving the boat. At that time, Bai 
Yunhai did not hesitate and hid in the big rock, planning to fight the two sides, and then 
take the opportunity to enter the depths of Icefire Island. 

However, seeing his father’s body, Bai Yunhai suddenly lost his composure. 

Although Bai Fu chose to kill his relatives because of Mo Yan before, but in Bai 
Yunhai’s heart, his father will always be his father, and the revenge of killing his father 
will never be shared. 

“I want you all to die!” In the 

blink of an eye, Bai Yunhai arrived in front of Sikong Yanran, his inner strength 
exploded, and he slapped Sikong Yanran with a savage palm. 

With this palm, Baiyunhai almost burst out with all his strength, and the air was 
extremely distorted wherever he passed. 

Swish! 

Suddenly seeing Bai Yunhai, the eyes of the four brothers lit up. 

Then Sikongjia shouted first, “Good boy, how dare you show up?” The 

other three brothers also shouted loudly. 

“Despicable and shameless boy, don’t even think about hurting the little sister.” 

“Take him!!” The 



voice fell, and the four brothers broke out at the same time, and they had to rush to 
help, but it was too late. 

Seeing Bai Yunhai’s palm coming, Sikong Yanran didn’t panic at all, she quickly raised 
her jade hand and attacked. 
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Bang! 

The next second, the palms of the two sides collided, making a loud noise, and the 
powerful internal force fluctuations swept the audience. 

Bai Yunhai and Sikong Yanran were both shocked and took a few steps back at the 
same time. 

Obviously, neither side took advantage of this fight. 

Seeing this scene, Bai Yuting and the surrounding Bai disciples were stunned. They 
never thought that they would meet Bai Yunhai here. 

“Bai Family Disciple listen to the order!!” 

At this moment, Bai Yuting reacted, pulled out his long sword, and shouted: “Sweep the 
Ice and Fire Island and avenge the Great Elder. 

” In the current situation, we must let go of internal grievances and unite with the outside 
world. 

Whoa! 

As soon as the words fell, hundreds of Bai’s disciples jumped off the big boat and 
rushed towards Sikong Yanran and the four brothers. 

“Want to step on the Ice and Fire Island?” 

Seeing this scene, Sikong Yanran’s delicate face showed a bit of anger: “You are too 
proud of yourself.” The moment the voice fell, he raised his hand and released a 
firework. 

In an instant, many disciples of Ice and Fire Island rushed towards the seaside to fight 
with Bai’s disciples. 

…. 



on the other side, deep in the sea. 
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Gululu… 

Mo Yan didn’t know how long she had been in a coma, but she woke up faintly with a 
strange sound. 

This… 

The moment she opened her eyes, Mo Yan was stunned, her delicate face was full of 
confusion. 

What is this place? 

At this moment, Mo Yan saw that she was in a strange space. The surrounding walls 
were slowly wriggling, and these walls were dark red with cobweb-like veins on them. 

Moreover, the ground under your feet is also soft, constantly rising and falling. 

Could it be… 

After a few seconds, Mo Yan realized that she was in the belly of a huge monster? 

Gululu… 

Just when Mo Yan was secretly puzzled, suddenly, a strange voice came again, and 
then, a bright light appeared in front of him, and then a stream of sea water poured in. 

Through the bright light, Mo Yan saw the scene outside, her body trembled suddenly, 
and her whole body was stupid. 

She guessed it well, she was indeed in the belly of a ‘monster’, and this monster was a 
huge octopus. This octopus was jet-black all over, with more than a dozen tentacles, 
and it was dozens of meters long. 

Before, Moyan jumped into a big hole from the stone prison on Icefire Island, was swept 
into the bottom of the sea by the undercurrent of the sea, and finally fainted. It was a 
coincidence that a big octopus passed by and swallowed Moyan. 

Speaking of which, if an ordinary human being was swallowed by such a big octopus, it 
would have been dissolved and turned into a stream of blood. However, Moyan is a holy 
demon king, possessing a demon body and a demon soul, so he is naturally not afraid. 

Huhu… 



Just when Moyan was secretly shocked, there was another violent vibration around, and 
then the big octopus opened his mouth and spat out Moyan. 

Arriving in the sea outside, Mo Yan was taken aback when she saw the scene in front of 
her. 

I saw that several giant sharks were besieging the big octopus. 

These giant sharks were covered with black and red veins all over their bodies, their 
eyes were blood red, and even the sharp teeth in their mouths were blood red, 
extremely terrifying. 

The big octopus seemed very ferocious, but in front of these sharks, there was no 
resistance at all, and in just a few seconds, it was torn to shreds. 

At this time, Mo Yan didn’t know that this ferocious giant shark, called the blood-toothed 
shark, had an extremely brutal temperament, and the prey they were staring at had 
almost no chance of escaping. 

Swish swish… 

In the blink of an eye, the big octopus was eaten cleanly, and the eyes of several blood-
toothed sharks flashed, directly locking on Mo Yan, and the figure rushed over like a 
sharp sword. 

Oops! 

Mo Yan’s body trembled, and she didn’t have time to think about it, she turned and 
swam into the distance, but in the water, how could her speed be as fast as a blood-
toothed shark? Just got caught up in the blink of an eye. 

Click! 

In the next second, the first blood-toothed shark caught up, the blood basin opened its 
mouth wide and directly bit Mo Yan’s shoulder. Immediately, blood gushed out, dyeing 
the sea water red. 

When the pain came, Mo Yan was angry and desperate. 

It’s over, it’s over now. 

Rather than being bitten to death by these sharks, it is better to stay on Icefire Island. 

However, what happened next surprised Mo Yan. 
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Mo Yan at this time clearly felt that the moment the blood-toothed shark bit him, the 
sharp teeth injected a very strong poison, which spread into the body, directly and the 
blood-soul pill’s drama Poisons cancel each other out… 

Speaking of which, the highly poisonous blood-toothed shark is extremely paralyzing. 
No matter how strong a cultivator is, as long as he is poisoned, he will be paralyzed all 
over, but unfortunately, This kind of poison and blood soul pill are mutually exclusive. 

Perhaps it is the will of God in the dark, if Moyan is attacked by other sea creatures, 
there is absolutely no possibility of surviving, but she has encountered a blood-toothed 
shark. 

call! 

In less than half a minute, Mo Yan felt that the highly poisonous Blood Soul Pill in her 
body was quickly neutralized by the blood tooth shark’s toxin. 

She never thought that in this desperate situation, she would be blessed by misfortune. 
The blood-toothed shark, which has been disgusting to others, is highly poisonous, but 
when she comes to her, it becomes a good antidote. 

Chill! 

In the next second, Mo Yan’s delicate body twisted, and she broke free from the bite of 
the blood-toothed shark, pulled out a dagger from her body, and stabbed it on the back 
of the blood-toothed shark. 

As the dagger went down, blood spurted out, and the blood-toothed shark’s fierceness 
was thoroughly stimulated, and its tail swept over, knocking Moyan back. 

Because the movement was restricted by the water pressure under the deep sea, Mo 
Yan couldn’t dodge at all. At that time, she only felt that the tail of the blood tooth shark 
was pressing down like a mountain. 

call! 

Mo Yan was shaken back a few meters, only to feel that her body was overturned, and 
she almost spat out a mouthful of blood. 

However, Moyan was the Holy Demon King of the Demon Race. At this time, the blood 
soul pill was no longer suppressed by the poison, and the power of the Demon Soul 
recovered very quickly. 

At this moment, the blood-toothed shark opened its big mouth and charged again. 

Papa… 



At this moment, Mo Yan didn’t hesitate at all, and quickly tapped on her body a few 
times to stop the bleeding from her shoulders, and then her body turned around, like a 
spirit snake avoiding the blood-toothed shark. bite. 

Afterwards, Mo Yan rushed to the back of the blood-toothed shark, held the dagger 
tightly, and stabbed it directly on the blood-toothed shark’s head. The dagger hit the 
blood-toothed shark’s gate of life, and saw its huge body, rolling over and over and 
blood constantly. It gushed out and finally sank to the bottom of the sea. 

hum! 

After killing the blood-toothed shark, Mo Yan once again activated the power of the 
demon soul. In an instant, a terrifying aura spread through the sea water to the 
surroundings. 

Swish swish… 

The remaining blood-toothed sharks, sensing Moyan’s terrifying murderous aura, didn’t 
dare to rush forward. Finally, they turned around and swam into the distance, 
disappearing cleanly in the blink of an eye. 

These blood-toothed sharks are not low in intelligence. They know that if they stay, they 
will be the same as their companions just now. They will sink to the bottom of the sea 
and run away decisively. 

Phew…. 

finally out of danger. 

Seeing those blood-toothed sharks escape, Mo Yan felt a long sigh of relief, and then 
she struggled upstream and surfaced. 

When they got to the water, Moyan opened her mouth to take a breath, then looked 
around, and was stunned. 

I saw that there was sea water all around, I couldn’t see the Ice and Fire Island, and I 
didn’t know where I was at all. Obviously, Mo Yan was in the stone prison on Ice and 
Fire Island at that time, jumped out of the big hole, was engulfed by the undercurrent in 
the sea, and then drifted with the current, and was taken to a far away place. 

In this vast sea, which direction should I go? 

At first, Mo Yan was a little flustered, but she quickly calmed down and swam in one 
direction. 

Um? 



After some time, Mo Yan saw that there was a small island not far ahead. At that time, 
Mo Yan was overjoyed and quickly accelerated. 

When they got to the shore, Moyan looked around at the environment of the small 
island, and saw that the island was not big, with a small hillside in the middle. The 
surroundings were gentle, the vegetation was abundant, and there were no traces of 
development. It was obviously a deserted island. 

Not Ice and Fire Island. 

Seeing this, Mo Yan felt a little disappointed, but she quickly calmed down, found a 
piece of grass, and practiced cross-legged to recover. 

Mo Yan thought about it, and when her strength fully recovered, she hurried to Icefire 
Island. You must know that Ice and Fire Island is powerful, and the Bai family will 
definitely suffer. 

More importantly, Bai Yunhai is cunning and despicable, delusional to take away his 
own demon soul, this kind of scum must be eliminated as soon as possible. 

Chapter 4688 

At this time, Mo Yan still doesn’t know that the small island she is sitting on is within the 
area of the Guixu Sea Area. The environment here is harsh, pirates are rampant, and 
the Bai family has already started a fierce battle with Icefire Island. 

Whoops! 

While meditating, suddenly there was a sound of footsteps in the woods not far away, 
and then, a group of people rushed over quickly, holding long knives in their hands, and 
surrounded Moyan. 

Hearing the movement, Mo Yan quickly opened her eyes and saw the group of people 
dressed strangely, most of them shirtless and wearing leather armor, apparently they 
were pirates nearby. 

Yes, these people are the members of the Hailong Hall. 

Hailongtang is one of the most powerful pirates in the area of Guixu Sea Area. There 
are thousands of people in the group, and they do all kinds of evil. In addition, they 
disturbed Icefire Island several times, but they were all repelled by Icefire Island. 

Speaking of which, a few years ago, Yue Wuya and Han Bing had traveled overseas in 
order to pursue Duan Yu, and finally Yue Wuya became the leader of the blood shark 
pirates. At that time, the blood shark pirates were the strongest pirate gang at sea. After 



becoming the leader, Yue Wuya also subdued many other pirates, among them 
Hailongtang. 

However, because of the war between Kyushu and the Rakshasa tribe, Yue Wuya and 
Han Bing returned to the Kyushu mainland. It was precisely because of this that many 
pirates who had been integrated before split up again, while Hailongtang took the 
opportunity to develop and grow. In just a few years In time, it surpassed the blood 
shark and became the strongest pirate organization at sea. 

Today, a team from Hailongtang passed this deserted island and saw someone 
meditating here from a distance, so they came to loot. 

“Hurry up and hand over the valuables on your body!” 

At this moment, a big bearded man came out, his face full of arrogance, and shouted at 
Mo Yan. 

This person’s name is Xun Dong. He is a team leader of Hailongtang. This person is not 
only ruthless, but also greedy and lustful. In the past two years, many families have fled 
overseas to avoid disputes. Robbery and murder, no one can leave alive. 

call! 

Mo Yan’s delicate face did not fluctuate in the slightest, and she did not stand up. 
Instead, she glanced at Xun Dong lightly, her red lips parted lightly, and coldly spit out a 
word: “Go away!” 

At this moment, Mo Yan, the demon in her body. Soul power has almost recovered, and 
naturally he will not take a small pirate leader in his eyes. 

“Aiya?” 

Hearing this, Xun Dong was furious: “The little girls are quite arrogant.” As he spoke, he 
couldn’t help looking up and down at Mo Yan, and his eyes suddenly became straight. 

beautiful! 

So beautiful. 

I never thought that on this deserted island, I could meet such a beautiful beauty! 

At this time, Mo Yan, although she has just experienced several life and death, her long 
skirt is rotten, and she is very embarrassed, but she still can’t hide her talent, especially 
her unique temperament, which is difficult for any man to control when he sees it. Not to 
mention the lecherous Xun Dong. 



After a few glances, Xun Dong was a little itchy, and said to Mo Yan with a smile: “Little 
beauty, seeing you alone, you should be fleeing here, hehe, let’s do it, you will follow 
me from today onwards. , Be my woman, I promise not to treat you badly in the future.” 
As he 

spoke, Xun Dong looked up and down at Mo Yan again. 

As a pirate, the wind and the sun all year round, even if he successfully robbed the 
caravan, most of the people he encountered were men. I was fortunate enough to meet 
a woman, and her appearance was average, but now I meet such a beautiful woman, 
how can I let it go easily? 

Whoa! 

As soon as the voice fell, the other accomplices around were also excited one by one, 
and they all started booing. 

“Haha, such a beautiful woman, the captain is really blessed.” 

“The woman who is the captain, we are blessed every day.” 

“Not bad, hahaha…” 

These pirates are in their prime, never seen before. Such top-notch beauties are 
howling like crazy at this time. 

Swish! 

Hearing this, Mo Yan’s delicate face suddenly flushed red, and her heart was even 
more ashamed and angry. 

He is a dignified demon king, and his identity is extraordinary. Anyone who sees him 
should be polite. When has he suffered such humiliation? 

“I’ll say it again!” In the 

next second, Moyan’s red lips parted lightly, and her icy voice spread throughout the 
island: “Go away, otherwise, die!” 
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Huh? 

Feeling Mo Yan’s powerful aura, Xun Dong was stunned for a moment, and then said 
with a smile: “Tsk tsk, I didn’t expect that the little beauty has quite a temper, and you 
look like a Jianghu person, come and let me teach you. The ability!” The 



voice fell, Xun Dong soared into the sky! 

hum! 

In the next second, an aura of inner strength erupted from Xun Dong’s body, he raised 
his right hand, and hit Mo Yan with a palm. Wherever the figure passed, the air was 
distorted, and the momentum was astonishing. 

“Looking for death!” 

Seeing Xun Dong burst out, Mo Yan was completely impatient, she gave a cold and 
tender cry, and then the power of the devil’s soul exploded. 

“Boom!” 

In an instant, Moyan’s body was covered with a blood-colored light, and then he heard a 
crisp sound, and a huge beast condensed. 

I saw that this fierce beast, like a tiger but not a tiger, was covered with dark red scales, 
and its fangs flashed with cold light, which made people palpitate. 

That’s right, this is the beast ‘Maoshan’ that only the demons have. Although it is 
transformed by the power of the demon soul, it is not real, but it is also vivid. The breath 
that permeates the whole body is even more frightening. 

Hiss… 

At this moment, Xun Dong’s heart was startled, and he couldn’t help gasping for air. 

The power contained in this strange beast is too strong. 

This… 

At the same time, the other companions around were also shocked, stunned, and their 
hearts were extremely shocked. 

What beast is this? 

Just the illusion created by the illusion can burst out such a powerful breath… 
Moreover, this power is so evil. 

“Roar!” 

At this moment, Mo Yan didn’t talk nonsense. With a wave of her jade hand, she saw a 
roar from the man’s mouth, and then, the huge body rushed towards Xun Dong. 



Xun Dong was sweating profusely, and he didn’t have time to think about it. He quickly 
mobilized all his inner strength and concentrated on the long sword, trying to block the 
blow. 

At this time, Xun Dong still didn’t know what kind of terrifying existence he was facing. 

“Ah…” The 

next second, the long knife collided with Maojian, and the long knife shattered instantly, 
and Maojian’s terrifying power erupted, only to hear Xun Dong’s scream, and the whole 
person spilled a rain of blood in the air , was directly shocked and flew out, flying more 
than a hundred meters away, and finally smashed into a rock. 

“Pfft!” When he slipped off the rock, Xun Dong spat out a mouthful of blood again, his 
eyes widened, and he died of breathlessness! 

hiss! 

one move? 

Just one move to kill Captain Xun Dong? 

Seeing this scene, all the members of the Hailongtang present were dumbfounded. 
They couldn’t help gasping for air. 

This woman looks thin, but her strength is so terrifying! 

quiet! 

For a time, the entire deserted island was silent, except for the sound of water returning 
around, and a needle could be heard clearly. 

After more than ten seconds, Mo Yan’s eyes were like electricity, and she slowly 
glanced around them, her red lips parted lightly, and said coldly: “If you are not 
convinced, or want to avenge him, just come up and take revenge. die.” 

The voice is clear and crisp, but it contains a powerful deterrent, which is beyond doubt. 

Hearing this, the rest of Hailongtang and the others looked at each other in dismay, and 
no one dared to answer. 

Pfft! 

Soon, one of them reacted and knelt down and pleaded with Mo Yan: “Woman, woman, 
spare your life, we didn’t want to offend Your Excellency, it’s all Xun Dong who doesn’t 
know the current affairs…” 



Pu Tong, Pfft… 

The voice fell, and the rest of the people hurriedly knelt down, trembling and trembling 
all over. 

“Yeah, it was Xun Dong who offended your Excellency. He’s dead now, and he 
deserves it!” 

“We are all scumbags. I beg 

the heroine to spare our lives.” The captain was killed by her one move, who has the 
courage to challenge her. 

Facing this situation, Mo Yan’s delicate face did not fluctuate at all. 

In the next second, Mo Yan thought about it, looked at these people and asked, “Where 
is this place? Also, do you have any other accomplices, where is the old nest?” 

Although these pirates were very hateful, they killed them directly. It is not good for 
yourself, it is better to ask about the situation and understand the surrounding 
environment. 
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“Return to the heroine!” 

As soon as the voice fell, a pirate kneeling in front of her wiped the cold sweat from her 
forehead and quickly responded: “This is a deserted island, located on the edge of the 
Guixu sea area, we are all from Hailongtang, It was our captain who was killed by you 
just now… our base camp is on Black Rock Island, which is dozens of miles away.” 

Hu! 

Hearing this, Mo Yan pondered. 

Looking at it like this, there are quite a few pirates in this Sea Dragon Hall, and they are 
a considerable force, so it is better to make good use of them. 

Thinking to herself, Mo Yan glanced at Xun Dong’s corpse and instructed the pirate, 
“Go and chop off his head and hang it on the bow of the boat.” 

Yes, Mo Yan intends to subdue the entire Hailong Hall in order to return in the future. 
Prepare for the Kyushu mainland. The first step now is to take Xun Dong’s head back to 
Heishi Island and give the leader of Hailong Hall a dismount. 

Ah? 



Hearing this, the pirate was startled and immediately stunned. 

The other pirates also felt cold all over. 

The captain was killed by her, and her head was beheaded. What was she going to do? 
Only at this moment did they realize that the beautiful woman in front of her was 
charming in appearance, but she was a murderous devil who was even more terrifying 
than the blood-toothed shark in the deep sea. 

Seeing their reaction, Mo Yan frowned, and said very displeased: “What? Do you want 
to die too ? 

“ 

Disobeying, he nodded and said, “I’ll do it now, I’ll do it now.” After saying that, he 
walked over quickly and cut off Xun Dong’s head. 

A few minutes later, Xun Dong’s head was suspended from the bow. 

Then, under Mo Yan’s instruction, these pirates drove the ship towards Heishi Island. 

…… 

On the other side, Black Rock Island. 

Black Rock Island is located in the northwest of the sea area. The whole island is long 
from south to north. The whole island is covered with large and small black stones, 
hence the name Black Rock Island. 

In the flat place in the middle of Black Rock Island, there is a house built of stones, 
which is the old lair of Hailongtang. 

At this time, on a beach on the south side of the island, a middle-aged man was sitting 
quietly fishing. The man was dark-skinned, blinded in one eye, and had a scar running 
through half of his face. . 

This person is the leader of Hailongtang, Yu Du. 

Speaking of which, Yu Du was originally an inner disciple of the Shaolin School. 
Because of his aggressive nature, he violated the rules and was expelled from Shaolin. 
After that, he wandered in the rivers and lakes. He became a pirate by chance, and 
finally became the leader of Hailongtang. 

Yu Du recently fell in love with fishing, and he would go fishing at the seaside when he 
had nothing to do. 



Whoa! 

The fishing was going well, and suddenly there was a burst of noise from the direction 
of the old nest. 

Yu Du was very annoyed. He didn’t like being disturbed when he was fishing. He 
immediately ordered his subordinates, “Go and see what’s going on, Mad, who dared to 
disturb Lao Tzu’s fishing!” 

“Yes! 

” When the order was reached, the subordinate hurriedly responded, and then hurriedly 
walked towards the old nest. 

After a while, the subordinate ran over with panic on his face, and before he got to the 
front, he shouted in a panic: “Boss, no… it’s not good, Xun Dong died, and his head 
was hung on the bow of the boat. “ 

What? 

Hearing this, Yu Du was shocked and stood up immediately. 

You must know that Xun Dong is his most capable subordinate, and he is in the realm 
of the martial emperor. 

“Go!” In the 

next second, Yu Du reacted, dropped his fishing rod, and rushed over quickly. 

When I got there, I saw a group of people surrounded by the shore, the second leader 
and the third leader were there, and on the sea in front of him, a ship was slowly 
approaching. 

Several members of the Hailongtang on the boat are rowing tremblingly, and a head is 
hanging at the bow of the boat. 

It was Xun Dong. 

Mad, who dares to touch me in Hailongtang? 

Seeing this scene, Yu Du was furious and shouted angrily at a member of the ship: “Jia 
Liu, what the hell is going on? How did Xun Dong die?” 

Hearing the question, the pirate named Jia Liu, full of With a terrified face, he 
stammered and said: “Master Hui, yes…” 



Before he could finish speaking, he was interrupted by a cold voice: “I killed it!” The 
moment the voice fell, a beautiful voice The figure appeared on the flagpole on the bow. 

It was Mo Yan. 

 


