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Chapter 6736 Whoosh! 

Seeing Xiao Je and Yan Bingyu, the disciples present were all surprised, Xiao Je and 
Gu Qianqiu fought fiercely in the altar before, and the scene at that time was still vividly 
remembered. 

This Xiao Absolute strength is unfathomable, and now that the life and death of the sect 
master are unknown, I am afraid that no one present is his opponent. 

Oops! 

At the same time, Yue Feng and Feixue, who were in the room, were also secretly 
shocked when they saw the situation outside. 

Especially Yue Feng, at this time, his brows were locked, and at the same time he was 
shocked, his heart was also inexplicably anxious, this time is broken, this Xiao will never 
come, but pick this time to come. 

Muttering, Yue Feng couldn’t help but glance at Shao Lingfeng. 

No wonder this kid is so arrogant, it turns out that he found a new backer…. 

This man….. 

At this moment, feeling the strong aura permeating Xiao Je’s body, the jealousy on 
Hongpao’s delicate face could not be concealed, and at the same time, he realized that 
it should be this old man who used a stone to knock down his long sword just now. 

In the next second, Red Peony reacted, looked at Xiao Je, and asked, “What are you?” 
When asking, Hong Peony’s face was indifferent, but he was a little apprehensive in his 
heart. This person’s strength is unfathomable, and he must not take it lightly. 

Red Peony is still young, and he knows nothing about what happened twenty years ago, 
so naturally he does not know Xiao Jie. 

Xiao Ji looked proud and ignored it. 

“Huh! 

At this time, Shao Lingfeng chuckled, slowly took a step forward, and said proudly to 
Red Peony: “Red Peony, you are really lonely, this senior, we left the Heavenly Dao 
twenty years ago Xiao Je’s deputy sect master, was secretly plotted by Gu Qianqiu 
back then to take away the position of the sect master, and came back at this time to 
get back the position of the sect master.” 



While speaking, Shao Lingfeng did not forget to turn his head and nodded at Xiao Ji, 
with a humble and flattering attitude. 

It’s him? 

Hearing these words, Hong Peony’s body trembled, and her delicate face was full of 
solemnity. 

She really didn’t know Xiao Je, but before Xiao Je came to Qingyun City to make 
trouble, and she also knew some news about fighting with Gu Qianqiu, but she didn’t 
expect that the other party would come again so soon. 

“Xiao Jian! 

In the next second, Red Peony reacted, staring closely at Xiao Je and said, “I don’t 
know the situation back then, but I know that the ancient sect master has been in 
charge of the Heavenly Dao for all these years, acting justly, acting honorably, and 
deeply respected by the entire Heavenly Dao, and it is ridiculous that you come back 
now to seize the position of the sect master.” 

Speaking, the red peony’s tone became cold: “Please leave quickly, otherwise, don’t 
blame us for not being polite.” “ 

Boom! 

When the last word fell, Red Peony drew his long sword, looking ready to strike. 

Seriously, Red Peony was very panicked at this time, but the situation in front of him 
must not show the slightest cowardice, after all, the sect master was seriously injured 
and comatose, and someone important came out to face it. 

Mmmm 

At the same time, the surrounding disciples also drew their long swords one after 
another, glaring at Xiao Jian and the three of them one by one, and rushed forward with 
just one order. 

Looking at the situation in front of him, Xiao Ji chuckled, his eyes full of contempt. 

Yan Bingyu also pulled out his long sword and looked around coldly: “How?” Want to 
get your hands dirty? Those who are not afraid of death come up. “ 

Phew…. 

Feeling the murderous aura in Yan Bingyu’s eyes, all the disciples present looked at 
each other, and there was jealousy in each other’s eyes. 



Ha ha…. 

Seeing this scene, Shao Lingfeng was very proud, and suddenly the fox fake tiger got 
up, pointed at the red peony and shouted: “Do it? You are a girl, dare to clash with the 
sect master? What qualifications do you have? “ 

Hurry up Gu Qianqiu and call it out, it’s okay if he obediently hands over the position of 
sect master today, if he doesn’t hand it over, hehe, then wait for death.” When he said 
this, Shao Lingfeng looked arrogant. 

Call! 

Hearing this, Hong Peony’s face was cold, and she looked at Shao Lingfeng coldly: 
“You shameless traitor, what qualifications do you have to see the sect master?” I’ll kill 
you scum first. When 

the words fell, the red peony suddenly rose, and the long sword stabbed fiercely into 
Shao Lingfeng’s heart. 

Shao Lingfeng was shocked, and his first reaction was to dodge, but he didn’t have the 
slightest strength at this time, and he couldn’t dodge at all. 

Seeing this scene, Yan Bingjiao sighed: “Want to do it? I’ll play with you. “ 

Whoosh! 

Speaking, Yan Bingyu clenched his long sword, blocked in front of Shao Lingfeng, and 
directly greeted the red peony. 

The ultimate husband in Chinese chapter 6737 

Chapter 6737 Ringing ing….In an instant, the two long swords continued to collide, 
erupting with a loud sound. Everyone only saw dazzling. 

And many male disciples are even more pleasant. 

Yan Bingyu and Red Peony, both superb beauties, fought fiercely together at this time, 
and the charming curves were perfectly presented, and many people’s eyes were 
straight at that time. 

Boom! 

In the blink of an eye, the two fought for several rounds, and finally their palms collided, 
and each was shocked. 



After stabilizing the figure, Yan Bingyu took a deep breath and wanted to rush up, but 
was stopped by Xiao Jian. 

“Girl! 

Xiao Ji looked the red peony up and down, his tone was indifferent, and there was no 
doubt: “You can’t be the master in this matter, quickly let Gu Qianqiu come out, 
otherwise, the old man doesn’t mind stepping here.” “ 

It’s not loud, but it’s imposing. 

Call! 

Hearing this, Hong Peony bit her lip tightly and did not respond, but she was a little 
panicked in her heart. 

What to do? 

With his own strength, plus the disciples present, I am afraid that he is not this Xiao Je’s 
opponent, and the sect master is still unconscious in the room, and it is impossible to 
call him out. 

At the same time, Yue Feng and Flying Snow in the room were also in a hurry. 

You can only gamble. 

In the next second, Yue Feng’s brain turned quickly, and he immediately had an idea, 
and strode out. 

Swish! 

Seeing Yue Feng come out, the eyes of the audience suddenly converged. 

Shao Lingfeng and Yan Bingyu’s faces changed even more, and the anger in their eyes 
could not be concealed. 

Especially Yan Bingyu, her delicate face was full of shame, and she immediately said 
coldly: “You shameless person, you are still here.” “At that time, I was teased by Yue 
Feng on Yunxi Mountain, and this shame will never be forgotten for the rest of my life. 

Red Peony frowned secretly. 

He doesn’t take care of the sect master inside, what does he come out for? 

“Huh! 



Sensing the hostility in Yan Bingyu’s eyes, Yue Feng didn’t care, and smiled at that 
time: “Good sister is here, of course I have to come out to meet you.” 

While speaking, Yue Feng deliberately looked Yan Bingyu up and down, and ridiculed: 
“I haven’t seen you for a day, my good sister is beautiful again.” “ 

Oh! 

When the words fell, Yan Bingyu’s face turned red, shy and angry: “Shut your dog 
mouth, who is your good sister, talk nonsense again, I cut your tongue.” At 

this time, Yan Bingyu wanted to kill Yue Feng immediately, but the purpose of wanting 
to come was to deal with Gu Qianqiu, so he held back. 

Seeing Yue Feng’s cynical look, Red Peony also turned slightly red. 

This Yue Feng, when is it, is still full of impropriety. 

“Boy! 

At this moment, Xiao Ji became a little impatient, and said coldly to Yue Feng: “What 
about Gu Qianqiu? “This person is Gu Qianqiu’s sworn brother, he is here, and Gu 
Qianqiu must be there. 

Call! 

At this moment, Yue Feng collected his smile and said slowly: “I’m afraid, you will never 
be able to see Sect Master Gu in the future, he… He was seriously injured and died. “ 

Yes, Yue Feng said this on purpose. 

Xiao Ji came to provoke several times, the purpose was to kill Gu Qianqiu, and then 
seize the position of the sect master, if he knew that Gu Qianqiu was deeply injured and 
unconscious, he would definitely be ruthless and send Gu Qianqiu back to the west 
directly. 

In this case, Yue Feng simply said that Gu Qianqiu was dead, completely making Xiao 
cut off his thoughts. Anyway, now Gu Qianqiu is in a deep coma, and there is still a faint 
breath, as long as it is not close, it is difficult to detect. 

What the? 

Hearing this, whether it was Xiao Jie’s master and disciple, or Red Peony, Feixue, and 
the disciples present, they were all taken aback. 

Gu Qianqiu… He’s dead? 



Shao Lingfeng was stunned for a while, and then his heart was ecstatic. 

Ha ha… Gu Qianqiu died? Good death. 

“You…” 

Finally, Red Peony was the first to react, and couldn’t help but whisper, “What do you 
say, why did the sect master die?” “How can this Yue Feng talk nonsense, the sect 
master is obviously saved, he even said that he is dead. 

Yue Feng secretly exhaled and responded in a low voice, “If you don’t say that, how can 
this Xiao never stop?” “ 

Red Peony is a smart woman, listening to him say this, she immediately understood the 
deep meaning, and immediately stopped talking. The voices of the two were very small 
and small, and Xiao Jie’s master and disciple and the surrounding disciples could not 
hear it. 

At this moment, Feixue also guessed Yue Feng’s intentions, and his mood calmed 
down. 
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Chapter 6738 “Dead?” 

At this time, Xiao Ji slowed down, frowned and looked at Yue Feng and said, “How did 
you die?” 

While speaking, Xiao Ji took a few steps forward, looked into the house, and saw Gu 
Qianqiu lying there quietly, his face pale, his eyes closed, and there was a shocking 
wound at the mouth of his heart…. 

Seeing this, Xiao Ji’s heart was not only surprised, but also indescribably complicated. 

Who is the other party who can kill Gu Qianqiu… 

Call! 

Yue Feng took a deep breath and spoke in an indifferent tone: “Died at the hands of the 
red flower mother-in-law.” Then, Yue Feng roughly explained the situation at that time. 

Safflower mother-in-law: 

Knowing the situation, Xiao Ji couldn’t help but muttered secretly in his heart, it turned 
out to be the strange old woman he met before. 



Thinking about it, Xiao was absolutely unspeakable. 

Twenty years… 

He taoguang and recuperated obscurity, and lived in seclusion in the deep mountains 
for nearly twenty years, in order to wait for one day, when he personally killed Gu 
Qianqiu and regained the position of sect master, but he did not expect that Gu Qianqiu 
would die at the hands of others….. 

For a while, the more Xiao Ji thought about it, the more he held his breath. 

Hahaha…. 

At this moment, Shao Lingfeng slowed down and looked up to the sky and laughed: 
“Die well, die well, Gu Qianqiu, you are selfish, just to maintain your majesty, not only 
abolish my exercises, but also expel me from the Heavenly Dao, but I didn’t expect that 
I would have such a day.” “ 

It’s really the news that came too quickly, too comforting, hahaha…” 

After saying this, Shao Lingfeng turned around and knelt down towards Xiao Je, his 
tone was respectful, and he said loudly: “Congratulations to the sect master, the great 
vengeance has been avenged, and he has successfully controlled the Heavenly Dao.” 
When 
shouting this, Shao Lingfeng looked flattering. He is a wise man, Gu Qianqiu is dead, 
and now is a good time to elect Xiao Jian to become the new sect master. 

At this time, Yan Bingyu also reacted, and said to Xiao Je very happily: “Congratulations 
Master.” “ 

Hmm! 

Xiao Ji nodded, his face could not see joy and anger, and his heart was still stunned. 

Originally, he was riveted and wanted to fight with Gu Qianqiu for victory and life and 
death, but suddenly Gu Qianqiu died, and the previous efforts were in vain, which made 
Xiao Ji feel very bored. 

This…. Seeing this scene, the disciples present all looked at each other, with 
complicated expressions. 

The ancient sect master suddenly died violently, and this Xiao was desperate to snatch 
the position of the sect master. 

How is this good? 



At this time, these disciples did not know that Gu Qianqiu was not dead at all, but was in 
a deep coma, and Yue Feng deliberately said this just now, just to make Xiao die. 

“You guys! 

At this time, Shao Lingfeng quickly stood up, looked around and shouted, “Don’t you 
hurry up to see the sect master?” 

However, none of the surrounding disciples responded to him. 

At this time, Red Peony reacted and looked at Xiao Je coldly: “What qualifications do 
you have to be the sect master?” “Although he was the deputy sect master of the 
Heavenly Dao, it was also twenty years ago. 

More importantly, Gu Qianqiu is not dead at all, how can he let them come around? 

“You are presumptuous! 

At this time, Yan Bingyu couldn’t help but snort, took out the sect master’s jade sword, 
and scolded the red peony: “My master has the sect master’s jade sword, seeing the 
jade sword is like seeing the sect master, don’t you understand this truth?” 
When 
he said this, Yan Bingyu looked proud. 

What the? Sect Master Jade Sword? 

Seeing the jade sword in Yan Bingyu’s hand, Hong Peony’s body was shocked, and she 
didn’t expect that the other party would have this thing in her hand. 

In shock, Hong Peony subconsciously glanced at Yue Feng, her red lips lightly opened, 
and whispered, “What should I do?” She didn’t know why, but she believed that Yue 
Feng would have a way to deal with it. 

“Don’t panic! 

Yue Feng smiled slightly, signaled Hong Peony not to worry, and then took a step 
forward and said to Xiao Je: “I’m really sorry, you have a token, and I also have a 
token.” 

Speaking, Yue Feng took out the key to the Xuantian Martial Arts Treasure Vault from 
his body: “Before the ancient sect master left, he gave me this thing and asked me to 
temporarily take the position of the sect master. “ 

What? 

Hearing this, Shao Lingfeng’s face changed. 



Gu Qianqiu passed the position of suzerainty to him? Shao Lingfeng, the key to the 
treasure house, had seen it, and knew that it was not fake, but it was absolutely 
unacceptable to let Yue Feng succeed to the position of sect master. 

Xiao Ji also frowned: “The key to the treasure house?” 

At this moment, Yan Bingyu also looked disdainful and said coldly: “You are the sect 
master? Are you eligible? ” 
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Chapter 6739 said, Yan Bingyu’s eyes flickered, and he continued: “You said that Gu 
Qianqiu passed the position of sect master to you, who can prove it?” Just a word from 
you? The words were full of disdain. 

As soon as the words fell, Shao Lingfeng also shouted: “Not bad, there is no basis for 
empty words, you said that you are the sect master, you are the sect master?” At 

this moment, the disciples present also looked at Yue Feng. 

In the hearts of these disciples, they also felt that Yue Feng’s empty words were 
unfounded and unconvincing. 

For a time, the audience was silent. 

“I testify! 

At this moment, Feixue, who was in the room, finally couldn’t help it, and quickly walked 
out and said loudly: “I was present when the sect master gave him the key. 

Saying that, Feixue took a deep look at Yue Feng and continued, “At that time, the sect 
master said that he would be allowed to succeed the sect master. “ 

Whoosh! 

Hearing these words, the audience was in an uproar. Most of the disciples nodded 
subconsciously, and their hearts were also inclined to Yue Feng’s side. 

You know, Feixue is Gu Qianqiu’s personal disciple, and he will definitely not lie. 

Hehe… 

Seeing this situation, Xiao Ji couldn’t help but chuckle, and looked at Yue Feng with a 
playful gaze: “It’s a little interesting…” 



Yan Bingyu pouted with a look of disdain: “He is Gu Qianqiu’s sworn brother, and Gu 
Qianqiu will naturally pass the position to him.” “ 

In Yan Bingyu’s heart, Yue Feng is a scoundrel and has no qualifications at all. 

Oops! 

And Shao Lingfeng, who was standing on the side, frowned secretly, and couldn’t help 
muttering in his heart. Now there was trouble, and Gu Qianqiu passed the location to 
Yue Feng. 

Buzz…. 

At this moment, a strong aura fluctuation came from not far away, and then three figures 
quickly arrived, one by one, filled with a strong aura. 

It was the three elders besides Li Muchen. 

There are a total of four elders away from the Heavenly Dao, Li Muchen who came 
before is the great elder, and the three who come now are the second elder Zhang 
Dongzhi, the third elder Wang Youming, and the fourth elder Xu Chengyuan. 

Haha, here it is! 

Seeing this scene, Shao Lingfeng showed a smile, not bad, the three elders were 
specially invited by him to send a message secretly. 

Because among the four elders, the third elder and the fourth elder have always been at 
odds with Gu Qianqiu, inviting them to come will definitely support Xiao Jian, and it will 
be easier to control the situation at that time. 

Although Shao Lingfeng was expelled from the Heavenly Dao, he knew the contact 
information inside the Heavenly Dao very well, and it was not difficult at all to summon 
the three elders to come. 

Wow… 

Seeing the three elders, the disciples present saluted one after another. 

“Elder! 

“I’ve seen three elders. Faced 

with this situation, the three elders nodded, and then the second elder Zhang Dongzhi 
looked around, and finally his eyes fell on Xiao Jian, his tone was flat, but he was a little 
shocked: “Xiao Jian, you really didn’t die.” 



At the same time, Wang Youming and Xu Chengyuan also had complicated 
expressions. 

Twenty years ago, although they had not yet taken the position of elders, they were also 
elite disciples at that time, and naturally knew Xiao Jie. 

Hehe! 

Xiao Ji’s eyes flickered, and he smiled: “The three of you are not harmed.” 

Zhang Dongzhi’s eyes flickered, and there was no nonsense at that time, and he turned 
his head to look at Feixue and Red Peony at the door of the room: “What about the sect 
master?” “ 

Phew! 

Faced with the inquiry, Feixue and Red Peony looked at each other. 

In the next second, Red Peony spoke: “The sect master was secretly plotted by the red 
flower mother-in-law, and he died of serious injuries, and he has already driven Hexi to 
the west.” “ 

What? 

Hearing this, Zhang Dongzhi’s body was shocked, and a wave of sadness welled up in 
his heart, he and Gu Qianqiu were the same age, and they had a good relationship in 
private, and it was difficult to accept it for a while when he learned that Gu Qianqiu died. 

Gu Qianqiu died? 

And the third elder Wang Youming and the fourth elder Xu Chengyuan, when they 
heard this news, looked at each other and secretly rejoiced in their hearts. The two of 
them had never been at odds with Gu Qianqiu, and when they heard the news of the 
death at this time, their hearts were inexplicably excited and excited. 

“Why? 

At this time, Zhang Dongzhi reacted, unable to hide his sadness, and looked up to the 
sky and said to himself: “Why is this happening? The sect master is bent on leaving the 
Heavenly Dao and living for the world, why can’t God take care of him…” When 

the words fell, Zhang Dongzhi’s hand held his forehead, and tears flowed. 

Seeing him like this, the surrounding disciples were also saddened. 
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Chapter 6740 “Zhang Dongzhi!” 

At this moment, Xiao Ji said lightly: “Gu Qianqiu is dead, a new sect master is urgently 
needed from the Heavenly Dao, the old man has the sect master jade sword, and it is 
logical to succeed the sect master, what do you think?” 
When 
he spoke, Xiao Ji’s eyes showed a bit of expectation. 

This hole is not low from the status of the Heavenly Dao, if he has his support, it will 
definitely achieve twice the result with half the effort. 

Call! 

Zhang Dongzhi took a deep breath and looked at Xiao Jian: “You have not been away 
from the Heavenly Dao for more than twenty years, how can you succeed to the 
position of sect master?” 

Hearing this answer, Xiao Jian’s face sank: “So, you don’t plan to support me?” 

Zhang Dongzhi chuckled and was about to answer, but was interrupted by flying snow. 

“Second Elder! 

Feixue bit her lip and pointed to Yue Feng next to her, “Before the sect master left, he 
had already let Yue Feng take over the position of the sect master, and had already 
given him the key to the treasure house. “ 

Yue Feng? 

Hearing this, Zhang Dongzhi was first stunned, then looked Yue Feng up and down and 
asked, “Yue Feng?” You helped King Shaoyang defend the city of Qi a few months ago 
and defeated Yue Feng, who had defeated Ji Beiye’s army several times? “ 

At the beginning, Yue Feng strategized and beat Ji Beiye’s army to the fall of flowers 
and water, and his reputation shook the world, and almost everyone knew about it. 

Yue Feng smiled and looked humble: “It’s me.” “ 

Hmm! 

Zhang Dongzhi nodded, his face full of approval: “Sure enough, it is a Heavenly Vertical 
Wizard, I believe in the choice of Sect Master Gu.” Although he didn’t say it directly, the 
implication of his words was obviously to support Yue Feng’s sitting sect master. 

“Huh! 



At this time, Xiao Ji smiled coldly and glanced at Yue Feng with disdain: “He is not a 
person who has left the Heavenly Dao at all, but he wants to be the sect master, which 
is really ridiculous.” 

Hearing this, Zhang Dongzhi frowned. 

Without waiting for him to refute, Shao Lingfeng, who was not far away, seemed to have 
discovered something, and suddenly burst out laughing. 

Hahaha…. 

At this moment, Shao Lingfeng raised his head and laughed, pointing at Feixue, his 
eyes flashing with resentment and ridicule: “You mean woman, you say that it is Gu 
Qianqiu’s life, in fact, you are deliberately helping your adulterer.” “ 

Oh! 

When the words fell, all the eyes of the audience converged on Feixue. 

Feixue was furious and said coldly, “Shao Lingfeng, what do you mean by this?” “This 
Shao Lingfeng, first betrayed the master, and now humiliated himself, it is simply too 
hateful. 

At the same time, everyone present was also puzzled, and they didn’t understand why 
Shao Linfeng suddenly targeted Flying Snow. 

Hehe! 

Shao Lingfeng sneered and pointed to Feixue’s long skirt: “Are you still pretending to be 
innocent?” You look at your skirt, what did you and Yue Feng do in the room just now? 
It’s really shameless…” 
“Gu Qianqiu’s corpse is inside, you guys are doing that kind of thing, it’s really 
shameless.” 
When 
he said this, Shao Lingfeng’s heart was full of evil fire. 

Just now, when I saw Feixue’s skirt being torn apart, I decided at that time that this was 
done by Yue Feng… In his heart, he had always regarded Feixue as a goddess, but 
now, the goddess had been touched by Yue Feng, and the resentment and 
unwillingness in his heart completely broke out. 

Wow…. 

Hearing Shao Lingfeng’s words, everyone in the audience also paid attention to 
Feixue’s skirt, and there was an uproar. 



“This…” 

“Unexpectedly, Feixue is this kind of woman…” 

Many disciples did not know the situation, subconsciously agreed with Shao Lingfeng’s 
words, and couldn’t help but whisper one by one. 

Seeing this situation, Shao Lingfeng was relieved and excited, pointing at Feixue and 
shouting: “You faceless slut, you not only get along with Yue Feng, but also vainly want 
to help him sit in the position of sect master. 

“What kind of key, you found it from Gu Qianqiu, right?” 
After 
saying this, Shao Linfeng looked proud. 

“You…” 

Seeing Shao Lingfeng slandering in public, Feixue’s face turned red and extremely 
embarrassed: “You don’t want blood spraying people, Yue Feng and I have nothing to 
do.” “ 

Tsk! Shao Lingfeng chuckled and retorted: “Who doesn’t know, when you and Yue Feng 
were forced to visit the hall and become relatives by Mother-in-law Honghua, you didn’t 
want to on the surface, but in fact, you secretly hooked up with Yue Feng a long time 
ago.” Hearing 

this, Feixue almost cried in anger. 

“Shao Lingfeng! 

At this time, Yue Feng couldn’t help but say coldly: “I know that you have always been 
unaccustomed to me, but if there is something, even if you come at me, you will not 
spray blood here.” ” 

 


