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Chapter 2446 

Jasper's eyes blazed with fury as he locked his gaze on Justin, a sharp, 
determined gleam in his dark eyes. 

"I will clear my name and restore my reputation, no matter the cost!" he 
declared, his voice ringing with resolve. 

The tension between Justin, standing on stage, and Jasper, positioned below, 
was palpable-like a killer whale facing off with a great white shark. The 
outcome was still uncertain. 

"I, Landon Harper, swear on my name and the entirety of Harper Group that 
Jasper never did drugs. The whole situation was a setup!" 

Landon's voice resounded throughout the entire hall. 

The reporters buzzed with questions. "Who would do such a thing?" 

Landon refrained from directly naming Justin, aware that exposing the wolf in 
sheep's clothing would not be easy. Accusing him too hastily might provide 
Justin with an opportunity to counterattack, exploiting any gaps in their 

case. 

Landon had no fear of tarnishing his own reputation, but he was deeply 
concerned about the damage it might cause to Jasper. Every move they made 
was crucial. They couldn't afford any more mistakes. 

Another reporter stood up. "Mr. Jasper, if this drug scandal was truly a setup, 
as Mr. Harper claims, do you have any evidence to support that?" 

"He does." 

The answer came not from Jasper but from someone emerging from behind. 

Jonah and a visibly injured Xavier led Sebastian into the room, drawing 
everyone's attention. 

While Justin remained unfazed, Sheryl's face drained of color. Her anxiety 
was evident as beads of sweat appeared on her forehead. 

The crowd was taken aback once again. 



"I can't believe Mr. Jonah is here to show his support for Jasper. His methods 
are bold!" 

"Have you forgotten that Mr. Jasper is Mr. Winston's soon-to-be son-in-law? 
Isn't it only right for Jasper's brother-in-law to help him out?" 

The harsh white lights illuminated Sebastian's face, casting a stark glow on 
him. 

Sebastian gulped, his gaze shifting toward Justin, who stood a few steps 
away. Justin's expression was elegant yet menacing, and a chill ran down 
Sebastian's spine. 

He remembered the many close calls he'd faced in making it this far. Despite 
his past offenses, Jasper and Xavier had done everything to protect him. How 
could he hesitate now? 

It was this very hesitation that had ruined his son, Zayne. 

With newfound resolve, Sebastian straightened his back and spoke with 
unwavering seriousness. "My name is Sebastian Bender. I was Mr. Jasper's 
primary physician when he was hospitalized for acute headaches." 

He paused, then added with a deep, regretful sigh, "I owe Mr. Jasper a 
sincere apology." 

Sebastian's eyes softened as he turned toward Jasper. "I was the one who 
handed over Mr. Jasper's hospital records and blood test results to the 
police... I violated my professional ethics, and in doing so, I severely damaged 
Mr. Jasper's reputation. Not only did I harm him, but I also contributed to his 
losing his position as president." Sebastian stood at attention with a heavy 
heart, bowing deeply to Jasper. "I am truly sorry. I am willing to accept all 
consequences and relinquish my medical career. Someone like me has no 
right to continue practicing medicine." The room erupted in shock and 
disbelief. 

So, Jasper had been arrested because this doctor had secretly provided the 
so-called evidence to the authorities? 

A reporter couldn't hold back. "Dr. Bender, why did you do it?" 

Sebastian's eyes narrowed in fury as he glared at Sheryl's twisted face. "One 
day, while Mr. Jasper was hospitalized, Ms. Sheryl Gillis, Mr. Justin's private 
physician, approached me. 



"She threatened me, using my wife's illness and my son's debts against me. 
She demanded I hand over the blood test results to the police, framing Mr. 
Jasper. I had no choice but to comply, given Mr. Justin's influence." 

 


