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I am a quadrillionarire chapter 2551-“Ah!” 

Lufian held his head and cried out in pain. 

His pursuit is very simple. He just wanted to stay in Leila, be with Elora, and 
have his own home and children. 

However, the other voice in his head said, ‘You have to go out. Leave Leila, 
conquer one civilization after another, step across the universe, and become 
the master of the universe. 

‘That is what you should do.’ 

The constant collision of the two ideas drove Lufian to the brink of insanity. 

He did not know how he should choose, and for a moment, he did not even 
know who he was. 

Woosh! 

In the end, he could not bear it anymore, so he turned into a dazzling light and 
disappeared in an instant. 

As Sylvio looked at Lufian leave, he felt relaxed and worried at the same time. 

Although he was safe for now, the real danger lay ahead. 

Lufian had achieved Heavenly Overlord Rank, so his strength was already 
invincible, and no one could suppress him. 

With the fusion of dual souls, he could fly into a rage at any time, so there was 
not one place in Leila that was safe. 

‘What should I do now?’ Sylvio thought for a moment. He planned to assess 
Elora’s situation before making any plans. 

Suppressing the discomfort in his body, he waved his hand and an intricate 
nebula map appeared in front of him. 



He started to quickly stir the nebula, using Zwei Arithmetics to make 
predictions. 

Suddenly, the nebula bounced back with such force that it knocked him back 
a few steps. 

He had already been seriously injured by Lufian and when he was knocked 
back, he spat out a mouthful of blood. 

“What’s this?’ 

Sylvio looked at the nebula map in front of him with shock on his face. 

He could no longer detect Elora now. 

How was this possible? 

It worked before, why not now? 

There were only two possibilities for this. 

One possibility was Elora herself. 

Her strength might have surpassed Sylvio and she might have learned a 
secret technique that was on the same level as Zwei Arithmetics. Or she 
might have obtained an ancient 

artifact that could hide her. They were all possible reasons as to why she 
could not be detected. 

The second possibility was interference from external factors. 

This was much more complicated. 

According to Sylvio’s guess, the first possibility was unlikely, so it was mostly 
the second. 

Perhaps the entanglement between Elora and David was too deep, causing 
her to be affected as well. 

As for why Sylvio could not deduce David, Sylvio could not say for sure as he 
had never met him. 



“Huff…” 

He took a few deep breaths and tried to calm himself down. 

So much had happened during this time. 

The Robotias and the Soul Devourers had teamed up for a sneak attack. As a 
result, Elora was forced to self-detonate and her soul entered The Spirit Cage 
for recovery. After that, she met a mysterious man named David, someone 
that even Zwei Arithmetics could not identify. 

After Elora’s soul recovered, Stark disrupted her restoration, causing her soul 
to be seriously damaged yet again, so she had to enter The Spirit Cage for 
further recovery. 

Since Lufian had recklessly and forcibly merged his dual souls to become a 
legendary Heavenly Overlord, he had lost his true self and become a source 
of danger that could go berserk at anytime. 

Zwei Arithmetics was once considered invincible but it had failed on Stark and 
David, making Sylvio feel lost. 

He greatly relied on Zwei Arithmetics and it had helped him avoid bad luck, 
and turn bad luck into good, many times in the past. 

Once it lost its effect, Sylvio could only run around like a headless chicken. 

Everything that happened indicated that Leila was about to usher in a 
catastrophe. 

No one could say for sure if they could get through this safely. 

Sylvio knew. 

Judging from the current situation, the Robotias and the Soul Devourers were 
doomed. 

They would surely not be able to stop Heavenly Overlord Lufian. 

However, that did not mean that Leila would be safe. 

If Elora rejected Lufian, Leila would fall into a bigger crisis, and miaht even be 
destroved. 



 


